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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue

OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director John P. Kelly

] o ) 08754-2191
Deputy Director Virginia E. Haines Tel: (732)929-2005
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea Fax: (732)505-1918
Commissioner Gary Quinn
Commissioner Joseph H. Vicari
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: April 20, 2022 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding contracts for the furnishing and delivery of MOBILE RETAIL FOOD CONCESSIONS AT
SPECIFIED COUNTY PARK LOCATIONS to Davey B's Ice Cream & Treats, Inc. and Dollar Concessions,
LLC, the highest qualified bidders. No bids were received on ltem Nos. 2, 4, 5,6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14
and 16. All no bid items will be rebid. (B2022-56)

Official Resolution# [2022000495
Meeting Date 04/20/2022
Introduced Date 04/20/2022
Adopted Date 04/20/2022
Agenda ltem p-6

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2022-56
Result Adopted
COMMISSIONER § % g % § % %
Kelly v v
Haines v v v
Crea v v
Quinn v

Vicari v v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON
Michuate \. Guakoor”

Clerk Of The Board
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CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

RESOLUTION

April 20, 2022

WHEREAS, on March 29, 2022, pursuant to legal advertisements
therefore, sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of MOBILE RETAIL
FOOD CONCESSIONS AT SPECIFIED COUNTY PARK LOCATIONS for the County
of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, one response was received from the

following bidder:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Davey B’s Ice Cream & Treats, Inc. Dollar Concessions, LLC

17 Greenfield Road 79 Freedom Landing Drive
Manalapan, NJ 07726 Ponte Vedra, FL 32081

(908) 415-3809 (732) 597-0281

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County
Purchasing Agent has now recommended to this Board that the highest qualified bid
according to specifications, in each instance, namely that of, DAVEY B’S ICE CREAM
& TREATS, INC., and DOLLAR CONCESSIONS, LLC be accepted. No bids were
received for Item Nos. 2, 4, 5, 6,7, 8,9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14 and 16. All no bid items will
be rebid. Contract will be awarded to the vendor offering the highest discount.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as
follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and
difected to enter into contracts accepting bids for the Mobile Retail Food Concessions at
Specified County Park Locations for the County of Ocean, for the contract period of three
(3) years from date of award through April 19, 2025, or until delivery is complete unless
otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant
to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15 as follows:

Introduced on]] April 20, 2022
Adopted on: April 20, 2022
Official Resolution#: 2022000495




Introduced on:
Adopted on:
Official Resolufi
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A. DAVEY B’S ICE CREAM & TREATS., INC. for two (2) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 1 and 3.

B. DOLLAR CONCESSIONS, LLC for one (1) item, to wit:

ITEM NO. 15.

2. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices
and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2022-56.

3. BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution
shall be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing,
Department of Finance, County Director of Parks and Recreation, and the successful

bidders.

April 20, 2022
April 20, 2022
on#: 2022000495
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DAVEY B'S ICE CREAM & TREATS, INC.
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
MOBILE RETAIL FOOD CONCESSIONS AT SPECIFIED COUNTY PARK LOCATIONS

14. Acknowledgement of Submission of Forms from Current Bid Package*

Bidders shall complete all documents and acknowledge all terms included with the bid package. All documents should be from this bid
package as forms change frequently and the most updated forms are provided in this specification. The forms must not be dated or
executed prior to the date of advertising. Failure to follow these instructions is cause for rejection. '

Confirmed

N

15. Submission of Bid Package*

By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

PRICE TABLES
MOBILE RETAIL FOOD CONCESSIONS AT SPECIFIED COUNTY PARK LOCATIONS

Line ltem Description Unit of Minimum  Minimum Bid No Bid Comments

Measure Price County  (Per Year)
Will Accept

LOCATION | --Ocean County Park, Route 88, Lakewood, NJ

1 Frozen Snacks S $500.00 $801.99

2 Light Meals $ $400.00 No Bid X

LOCATION Il - Lake Shenandoah Park, Route 88/New Hampshire Avé., Lakewood, NJ

Introduced-on: April 20,2022
Adopted on: April 20, 2022
Official RegRiwiinek RY7@PAYENT REPORT \

Bid - MOBILE RETAIL FOOD CONCESSIONS AT SPECIFIED COUNTY PARK LOCATIONS
Page 8
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DAVEY B'S ICE CREAM & TREATS, INC.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD |
MOBILE RETAIL FOOD CONCESSIONS AT SPECIFIED COUNTY PARK LOCATIONS

Line ltem Description Unit of Minimum  Minimum Bid No Bid Comments
Measure Price County  (Per Year)
Will Accept
3 Frozen Snacks . S $500.00 $631.99

4 Light Meals ' S $400.00 .No Bid X

LOCATION Il - Patriots' County Park, Bowman Road, Jackson Township, NI

5 Frozen Snacks : S $500.00 No Bid X

6 Light Meals $ $400.00 No Bid X

LOCATION IV - A. Pau!l King County Park, Route 72, Stafford Township, NJ

7 Frozen Snacks S $500.00 No Bid X

8 Light Meals S $400.00 No Bid X

LOCATION V - Beaver Dam Creek County Park, Point Pleasant, NJ -AND- Gull Island County Park, Point Pleasant Beach, NI

9 Frozen Snacks S $500.00 No Bid X

10 Light Meals $ $400.00 No Bid X

LOCATION VI - Jake's Branch County Park, 1100 Double Trouble Rd., Beachwood, NI

11 Frozen Snacks ' $ $500.00 No Bid X

12 Light Meals S $400.00 No Bid X

LOCATION VII - Mantoloking Fishing Pier, 30 Mantoloking Road, Brick, NJ

13 Frozen Snacks S $500.00 No Bid X
Introducefd on: April 20, 2022
Adopted on: April 20, 2022

Official Rep@lpisnt BUC0ANHENRT REPORT
Bid - MOBILE RETAIL FOOD CONCESSIONS AT SPECIFIED COUNTY PARK LOCATIONS
Page 9
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DOLLAR CONCESSIONS, LLC
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
MOBILE RETAIL FOOD CONCESSIONS AT SPECIFIED COUNTY PARK LOCATIONS

Line ltem Description Unit of Minimum  Minimum Bid Comments

Measure Price County  (Per Year)
Will Accept

14 |Light Meals $  [$400.00 No Bid X

LOCATION VIII - John C, Bartlett, Jr., County Park, Bayville, N

J 15 Frozen Snacks $ $600.00 $1,402.00
16 Light Meals S $500.00 No Bid X
Introduced on: April 20, 2022
Adopted on: April 20, 2022 4

Official ResaIWBAT SOCURIERT REPORT
Bid - MOBILE RETAIL FOOD CONCESSIONS AT SPECIFIED COUNTY PARK LOCATIONS
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