



Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Joseph H. Vicari
Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191
Tel: (732)929-2005
Fax: (732)505-1918

Board Meeting Agenda

Date: May 3, 2023 - 4:00 PM
Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES NO. II to The Hungry Puppy Corp. and Plastic Express, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on Item Nos. 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 44, 47, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75, 76, 77, 78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 85, 86, 87, 88, 89, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94 and 95. The Purchasing Agent shall be given the authority to enter in ...

Official Resolution#	2023000598						
Meeting Date	05/03/2023						
Introduced Date	05/03/2023						
Adopted Date	05/03/2023						
Agenda Item	I-5						
CAF #							
Purchase Req. #	B2023-87						
Result	Adopted						
COUNTY COMMISSIONER	PRES.	ABS.	MOVE	SEC	AYE	NAY	ABST.
Joseph H.	✓				✓		
Gary	✓				✓		
Barbara Jo	✓		✓		✓		
Virginia E.	✓			✓	✓		
John P.	✓				✓		

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING REFERENCED THEREON

Michelle I. Gunther

Clerk Of The Board

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS
No. B2023-87

RESOLUTION

May 3, 2023

WHEREAS, on April 18, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor, sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES NO. II for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder

The Hungry Puppy Corp.
1288 State Hwy 33
Farmingdale, NJ 07727
(732) 938-4470

Name and Address of Bidder

Plastic Express, Inc.
667 Lehigh Avenue
Union, NJ 07083
(718) 499-1119; Ext. 8201

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to specifications, be accepted, namely that of THE HUNGRY PUPPY CORP. and PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. No bids were received on Item Nos. 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 44, 47, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75, 76, 77, 78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 85, 86, 87, 88, 89, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94 and 95. It is requested that the Purchasing Agent be given the authority to enter into a negotiated contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) for all No Bid Items, as no responsive bids were received for a second time.

WHEREAS, N.J.S.A. 40A:11-5(3) provides that, in the event no qualified bids are received on two occasions, a governing body may enter into a negotiable contract.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to enter into contracts, accepting bids for the furnishing and delivery of K9 Dog Food and Supplies No. II for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through May 2, 2024, a period of one (1) year, or until delivery is complete. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15 as follows:

A. THE HUNGRY PUPPY CORP. for fifteen (15) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 2, 3, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 14, 18, 20, 22, 24, 29 and 46.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. PLASTIC EXPRESS, INC. for twenty one (21) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 1, 4, 11, 12, 13, 15, 16, 17, 19, 21, 23, 26, 27, 28, 43, 45, 67, 68, 69, 83 and 84.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials and equipment to be acquired by this contract shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-87.

4. BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance, Sheriff's Office and the successful bidders.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES NO. II

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Delivery, A.R.O.	Mfr./Packaging	Comments
1	Fromm 4-Star, WhiteFish Potato, 26 lb.	60	BAG	\$64.99	\$3,899.40				
2	Purina Proplan Shred Chicken and Rice, 35 lb.	24	BAG	\$75.99	\$1,823.76				
3	ProPlan Sport Active, 26/16 All Life Stages, Chicken, 37.5 lb.	24	BAG	\$68.99	\$1,655.76				
4	Fromm Gold Adult, Chicken & Barley, 30 lb.	12	BAG	\$55.99	\$671.88				
5	Nutro Senior, Large Breed, Lamb & Rice, 30 lb.	12	BAG	\$78.99	\$947.88				
6	Purina ProPlan Senior, Bright Mind 7+, Chicken & Rice, 30 lb.	12	BAG	\$84.99	\$1,019.88				
7	Kinetic Perform Active 26k, Chicken, 35 lb.	36	BAG	\$68.99	\$2,483.64				
8	Hills Prescription Diet, d/d, Potato & Duck, 25 lb.	12	BAG	\$130.99	\$1,571.88				
9	Hills Prescription Diet, d/d, Potato & Duck, 8 lb.	12	BAG	\$58.99	\$707.88				

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
 Bid No. TBD
 K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES NO. II

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Delivery, A.R.O.	Mfr./Packaging	Comments
10	Nutro Adult Chicken, 30 lb.	12	BAG	\$78.99	\$947.88				
11	Nutro Adult, Large Breed, Chicken & Rice, 30 lb.	12	BAG	\$78.99	\$947.88				
12	Royal Canin German Shepherd, Adult, 30 lb.		BAG	No Bid	No Bid	X			
13	Milk Bone Original Biscuit Marro Snacks, 40 oz.	19	BAG	\$20.99	\$398.81				
14	Milk Bone Flavor Snacks Biscuit Treats, Small, 7 lb.	19	BAG	\$20.99	\$398.81				
15	Milk Bone Biscuit Treats, Medium, 24 oz.	19	BAG	\$8.99	\$170.81				
16	Milk Bone Biscuit Treats, Mini's, 15 oz.	19	BAG	\$6.99	\$132.81				
17	Milk Bone Biscuit Treats, Large, 10 lb.	19	BAG	\$24.50	\$465.50				
18	Milk Bone Biscuit Treats, Large, 4 lb.	19	BAG	\$14.99	\$284.81				
19	Jack & Pup Elk Antler, Giant 8" Chews	19	BAG	\$47.99	\$911.81				

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES NO. II

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Delivery, A.R.O.	Mfr./Packaging	Comments
20	Benebone Wishbone, Jumbo-Bacon, Chicken or Peanut Butter Chews	19	BAG	\$21.99	\$417.81				
21	Large Treat Tote	5	EA	\$15.99	\$79.95				
22	Rubber Feed bowl, 4 Quart	19	EA	\$12.99	\$246.81				
23	Stainless Steel Flat Side Pails, 6 Quart; 192 oz.		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
24	Stainless Steel No-Tip Feed Dish, 3 Quart, 96 oz.	19	EA	\$18.99	\$360.81				
25	Stainless Steel Pails, 6-Quart		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
26	Vittles Vault 50 lb.	5	BAG	\$71.50	\$357.50				
27	Vittles Vault 60 lb.	5	BAG	\$79.99	\$399.95				
Grooming & Beds									
28	Furminator, Long Hair-M, Brush	19	EA	\$52.50	\$997.50				
29	Orthopedic Dog Bed, X-Large, 44" x 27", PVC Frame	6	EA	\$94.50	\$567.00				
Leashes, Collars & Muzzles									
30	A.S.A.T. Lead, 20' L x 1/2" W		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			

Introduced on: ~~May 3, 2023~~

Adopted on: ~~PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT~~

Official Resolution#: ~~202300598~~

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES NO. II

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Delivery, A.R.O.	Mfr./Packaging	Comments
40	Dominant Dog Collar, Ranger Green, 18 inch		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
41	E-Lusive 2.0 Garmin I.D. Collar (specify color)		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
42	Garmin Pro 550 Electronic Collar		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
43	Herm Sprenger Black Stainless Pinch Collar 3.2mm	10	EA	\$78.99	\$789.90				
44	Herm Sprenger Neck-Tech Sport Martingale Stainless Steel Collar, 24"		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
45	Herm Sprenger Neck-Tech, Black, S/S Collar with Cliclock Buckle 24"		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
46	Herm Sprenger Stainless Steel Pinch Collar, 3.2 MM	19	EA	\$49.50	\$940.50				
47	Lead - Classic Lead, 5 Feet with 1 inch bolt		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
48	Lead - Extending Lead, 26 Feet, Black		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			

Introduced on: May 3, 2023
 Adopted on: May 3, 2023
 Official Resolution # 202300598

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES NO. II

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Delivery, A.R.O.	Mfr./Packaging	Comments
1	Fromm 4-Star, WhiteFish Potato, 26 lb.	60	BAG	\$59.39	\$3,563.40		10-14 Business Days		
2	Purina Proplan Shred Chicken and Rice, 35 lb.	24	BAG	\$84.20	\$2,020.80		10-14 Business Days		
3	ProPlan Sport Active, 26/16 All Life Stages, Chicken, 37.5 lb.	24	BAG	\$74.89	\$1,797.36		10-14 Business Days		
4	Fromm Gold Adult, Chicken & Barley, 30 lb.	12	BAG	\$51.97	\$623.64		10-14 Business Days		
5	Nutro Senior, Large Breed, Lamb & Rice, 30 lb.	12	BAG	\$95.58	\$1,146.96		10-14 Business Days		
6	Purina ProPlan Senior, Bright Mind 7+, Chicken & Rice, 30 lb.	12	BAG	\$85.79	\$1,029.48		10-14 Business Days		
7	Kinetic Perform Active 26k, Chicken, 35 lb.	36	BAG	\$111.99	\$4,031.64		10-14 Business Days		
8	Hills Prescription Diet, d/d, Potato & Duck, 25 lb.		BAG	No Bid	No Bid	X			
9	Hills Prescription Diet, d/d, Potato & Duck, 8 lb.	12	BAG	\$79.79	\$957.48		10-14 Business Days		

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES NO. II

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Delivery, A.R.O.	Mfr./Packaging	Comments
10	Nutro Adult Chicken, 30 lb.	12	BAG	\$104.97	\$1,259.64		10-14 Business Days		
✓ 11	Nutro Adult, Large Breed, Chicken & Rice, 30 lb.	12	BAG	\$60.89	\$730.68		10-14 Business Days		
✓ 12	Royal Canin German Shepherd, Adult, 30 lb.	3	BAG	\$153.99	\$461.97		10-14 Business Days		
✓ 13	Milk Bone Original Biscuit Marro Snacks, 40 oz.	19	BAG	\$20.47	\$388.93		10-14 Business Days		
14	Milk Bone Flavor Snacks Biscuit Treats, Small, 7 lb.	19	BAG	\$35.49	\$674.31		10-14 Business Days		
✓ 15	Milk Bone Biscuit Treats, Medium, 24 oz.	19	BAG	\$8.71	\$165.49		10-14 Business Days		
✓ 16	Milk Bone Biscuit Treats, Mini's, 15 oz.	19	BAG	\$3.25	\$61.75		10-14 Business Days		
✓ 17	Milk Bone Biscuit Treats, Large, 10 lb.	19	BAG	\$21.36	\$405.84		10-14 Business Days		
18	Milk Bone Biscuit Treats, Large, 4 lb.	19	BAG	\$25.17	\$478.23		10-14 Business Days		
✓ 19	Jack & Pup Elk Antler, Giant 8" Chews	19	BAG	\$27.99	\$531.81		10-14 Business Days		Price is for Split Antler

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES NO. II

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Delivery, A.R.O.	Mfr./Packaging	Comments
20	Benebone Wishbone, Jumbo-Bacon, Chicken or Peanut Butter Chews	19	BAG	\$30.52	\$579.88		10-14 Business Days		
21	Large Treat Tote	5	EA	\$9.88	\$49.40		10-14 Business Days		
22	Rubber Feed bowl, 4 Quart	19	EA	\$20.89	\$396.91		10-14 Business Days		
23	Stainless Steel Flat Side Pails, 6 Quart; 192 oz.	19	EA	\$37.04	\$703.76		10-14 Business Days		
24	Stainless Steel No-Tip Feed Dish, 3-Quart, 96 oz.		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
25	Stainless Steel Pails, 6-Quart		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
26	Vittles Vault 50 lb.	5	BAG	\$69.93	\$349.65		10-14 Business Days		
27	Vittles Vault 60 lb.	5	BAG	\$79.79	\$398.95		10-14 Business Days		
Grooming & Beds									
28	Furminator, Long Hair-M, Brush	19	EA	\$29.99	\$569.81		10-14 Business Days		
29	Orthopedic Dog Bed, X-Large, 44" x 27", PVC Frame	6	EA	\$153.93	\$923.58		10-14 Business Days		
Leashes, Collars & Muzzles									

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES NO. II

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Delivery, A.R.O.	Mfr./Packaging	Comments
39	Dominant Dog Collar, Ranger Green, 17 inch		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
40	Dominant Dog Collar, Ranger Green, 18 inch		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
41	E-Lusive 2.0 Garmin I.D. Collar (specify color)		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
42	Garmin Pro 550 Electronic Collar		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
43	Herm Sprenger Black Stainless Pinch Collar 3.2mm	10	EA	\$39.79	\$397.90		10-14 Business Days		
44	Herm Sprenger Neck-Tech Sport Martingale Stainless Steel Collar, 24"		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
45	Herm Sprenger Neck-Tech, Black, S/S Collar with Cliclock Buckle 24"	5	EA	\$131.59	\$657.95		10-14 Business Days		
46	Herm Sprenger Stainless Steel Pinch Collar, 3.2 MM		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
47	Lead - Classic Lead, 5 Feet with 1 inch bolt		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES NO. II

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Delivery, A.R.O.	Mfr./Packaging	Comments
65	Modern Icon Waist Lead, all sizes		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
66	Nomad Harness Frame with Metal Cobra Buckles		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
67	Stainless Steel Choke Collar, Black, 18"	10	EA	\$28.69	\$286.90		10-14 Business Days		
68	Stainless Steel Choke Collar, Black, 20"	10	EA	\$28.66	\$286.60		10-14 Business Days		
69	Stainless Steel Pinch Collar, Black, 4.0mm	10	EA	\$106.39	\$1,063.90		10-14 Business Days		
70	Tactical Bungee E-Collar Strap		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
71	Tactical Bungee Leash Belt Holder, Black		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
72	Tactical Bungee Leash, Black		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
73	Tactical Patrol Harness with Cobra Buckle, Black		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
Training Aids									

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES NO. II

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Delivery, A.R.O.	Mfr./Packaging	Comments
74	Belgian Style Arm Bite Sleeve, Level 4, Jute Hard		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
75	Belgian Style Arm Bite Sleeve, Level 5, Jute Extra Hard		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
76	Belgian Style Leg Bite Sleeve, Level 4, Jute Hard, Adult Dog		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
77	Blast Hose Reward Toy, 10"		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
78	Canvas Narcotic Bag, 4" x 5", (6) Per Pack		PACK	No Bid	No Bid	X			
79	Euro Ball with Rope and Handle, 2.75"		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
80	I-Clicker, Clicker Training		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
81	Kong, Large, Black, with Rope Handle, 4"H x 2-3/4" W		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
82	Kong, Large, Red, with Rope Handle, 4"H x 2-3/4" W		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
83	Kong, X-Large, Black, 5"H x 4 1/2" W	19	EA	\$12.59	\$239.21		10-14 Business Days		

Introduced on: May 3, 2023
 Adopted on: May 3, 2023

Official Resolution 2023-00159
 K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES NO. II

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

K9 DOG FOOD AND SUPPLIES NO. II

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Delivery, A.R.O.	Mfr./Packaging	Comments
84	Kong, X-Large, Red, 5"H x 4 1/2" W	19	EA	\$11.77	\$223.63		10-14 Business Days		
85	Syntek Tug Handle, 2" x 12"		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
86	Synthetic Bite Bar, 2-handle		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
87	Synthetic Tug Handles, 24", (2) Handles, 6" Wide		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
88	Synthetic Tug Handles, 12", (2) Handles, 1.5" Thick		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
89	Synthetic Tug Handles, 12", (2) Handles, 2.5" Thick		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
90	Training Vest, Black, 2 Large		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
91	Training Vest, Black, 2 Medium		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
92	Training Vest, Black, 2 Small		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
93	Training Vest, Black, 2 X-Large		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X			
94	Ultra Scent Case, 6 Jars/Case		CASE	No Bid	No Bid	X			

Introduced on: ~~May 3, 2023~~

Adopted on: ~~May 3, 2023~~

Official Resolution#: ~~202300598~~