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Ocean County Board of Commissioners
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Director John P. Kelly

Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi
Commissioner Robert S. Arace
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione

Commissioner Virginia E. Haines

Board Meeting Agenda
Date:
Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

October 15, 2025 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754
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Action Uniform Co, LLC and Keyport Army Navy, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2025-136)
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REFERENCED THEREON

Michaie . Guainer”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on|
Adopted on:

CONTRACT NO.MUST BE ON AXE€S-PJ:1.
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

vo PACAS- 13

RESOLUTION

October 15, 2025

WHEREAS, on August 19, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS
DEPARTMENTS for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Action Uniform Co., LLC Keyport Army Navy

1500 S. New Road P.O. Box 985

Pleasantville, NJ 08232 Brick, NJ 08723

(609) 573-5462 (732) 673-5356

Dependable Sourcing Partners
133 S. 23" Street-Floor 2
Pittsburgh, PA 15203
(609) 513-3452
;and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely, ACTION UNIFORM CO., LLC and
KEYPORT ARMY NAVY.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF

COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, accepting bids for the furnishing and delivery of UNIFORMS FOR
VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS for the County of Ocean; for the contract period of one (1) year
from November 6, 2025 through November 5, 2026, or until delivery is complete unless
otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to
N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. ACTION UNIFORM CO. LLC for thirty-seven (37) items to wit:
ITEMNOS. 1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9,10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24,
25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36 and 98.
For a Total Lump Sum Award Section I (Item Nos. 1 - 36) of $79,040.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

October 15, 2025
October 15, 2025

Official Resolgfion#: 2025001473
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Adopted on:
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B. KEYPORT ARMY NAVY for one hundred (100) items to wit:
ITEM NOS. 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48A, 48B, 49, 50A, 50B, 50C, 51A,
51B, 51C, 52A, 52B, 52C, 53, 54A, 54B, 55, 56A, 56B, 56C, 56D, 57A, 57B, 57C, 58, 59,
60, 61, 62A, 62B, 62C, 63A, 63B, 63C, 64, 65, 66A, 66B, 67A, 67B, 67C, 68A, 68B, 68C,
69, 70, 71, 72A, 72B, 73A, 73B, 74, 75A, 75B, 75C, 76A, 76B, 77, 78A, 78B, 79A, 79B, 80,
81, 82A, 82B, 83A, 83B, 84A, 84B, 85A, 85B, 86, 87, 88, 89, 90, 91, 92, 93A, 93B, 94A,
94B, 95A, 95B, 96A, 96B, 97A, 97B and 98.
For a Total Lump Sum Award Section II (Item Nos. 37 - 49) of $5,971.00.
For a Total Lump Sum Award Section III (Item Nos. 50A - 97B) of $52,581.50.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Funds for the materials or services described herein shall be made available
through operating and expense (O&E) accounts, trust accounts, grant accounts, or capital
accounts maintained by, but not limited to, the following departments: Office of Clerk of the

Board, Consumer Affairs and the Security Department.

3. Payments for the materials and services to be acquired by these contracts
shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in
accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations

and needed quantities shall be indicated.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-136.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall
be made available to the County Auditor, Purchasing Department, Finance Department, Office

of Clerk of the Board, Consumer Affairs, Security Department and the successful bidders.

October 15, 2025
October 15, 2025
on#: 2025001473




[ACTION UNIFORM COJ] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ‘
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

- Res-Pg:1.1-4

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

SECTION |- SECURITY DEPARTMENT

Line Item Description . Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Style Delivery, Comments

A.R.O.

1 Trousers, 250 PR $68.00 $17,000.00 ELBECO 9850RN-F8 YES
Unisex, Flying

/ Cross, As
\v

Specified, or
Equal

2 Men's Tactical 15 PR . $63.00 $945.00 511 74273 YES
Pants, 5.11 4
/ Men's Taclite
\ Pro Pants,
Style #74273,
‘As Specified

3 Pants, BDU, 10 PR $65.00 $650.00 511 74251 YES

5.11 Tactical,
, / Style #74251,
\ As Specified,
or Equal

4 Long Sleeve 175 EA $79.00 $13,825.00 ELBECO Z319N YES
/ Shirt, Men, :
\V Elbeco Style
#3319, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Introduced on: QOctober 15,2025

Adopted A6TION UNIPORIVEEDE, RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official ResolufiaptiRAI338IARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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Res-Pg:1.1-5
[ACTION UNIFORM CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ' :
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line item Description . Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Style Delivery, Comments

A.R.O.

5 Short Sleeve ' 175 EA $77.00 $13,475.00 ELBECO Z3319N | 'IYES
Shirt, Men,

/ Elbeco Style
\Y #3319, NO

EXCEPTIONS

6 Long Sleeve 10 EA $79.00 $790.00 ELBECO Z9319LCN YES

3 Shirt, Women,
/ Elbeco Style
\/ #9319, NO
EXCEPTIONS

7 Short Sleeve 10 EA $77.00 $770.00 "~ |ELBECO Z9819LCN YES
Shirt, Women,
Etbeco Style
#9819, NO
EXCEPTIONS

8 Supervisor 15 EA $89.00 $1,335.00 ELBECO Z314N YES

Long Sleeve
’ \/ Shirt, Men,
) Elbeco Style

#3314, NO
EXCEPTIONS

9 Supervisor 15 EA $87.00 $1,305.00 ELBECO Z3314N YES
Short Sleeve
Shirt, Men,
Elbeco Style
#3314, NO
EXCEPTIONS

10 Supervisor S EA $89.00 $445.00 ELBECO Z9314LCN YES

Long Sleeve . )

\ Shirt, Women,
Elbeco Style

#9314, NO

EXCEPTIONS

Introduced on: Octoher 15,2025
AdoptedaTION UNPCAMArCIS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rggolvfignit RORSPIARPARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
Page 7 ' '




[ACTION UNIFORM COJ RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-P_g:I.1-6

Line Item

11

Description

Supervisor
Short Sleeve
Shirt, Women,
Elbeco Style .
#9814, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$87.00

Total Cost No Bid

$435.00

Manufacturer

ELBECO

Style

Z9814LCN

Delivery,

A.R.O.
YES

Comments

12

Golf Shirt,
Short Sleeve,
Elbeco, Style
#K5134, UFX
Performance
Tactica! Polo,
As Specified or
Equal

10

EA

$70.00

$700.00

FETCHHEIMER

F13201-86

YES

13

Golf Shirt,
Long Sleeve,
Elbeco, Style
#K5144, UFX
Performance
Tactical Polo,
As Specified,
or Equal

10

EA

$74.00

$740.00

FETCHHEIMER

F13221-86

YES

14

Turtleneck
Dickie, Elbeco
Dickie, Style
#K8024, As
Specified, or
Equal

70

EA

$18.00

$1,260.00

ELBECO

k8024

YES

15

Turtleneck,
Long Sleeve,
Elbeco, Style
#K8014, As
Specified, or
Equal

50

EA

$32.00

$1,600.00

ELBECO

K8014

YES

Introduced on:

QOctaber 15,2025

Adopted[aGTION UNBGARICB] RRSPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Rggol gt RO PR WPARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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Res-Pg:1.1-7
[ACTION UNIFORM CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD -
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line item Description 2 Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Style Delivery, Comments
AR.O.

Sweater, : $58.00 $1,160.00 LIBERTY

4 Unisex,
) / Liberty, Style
Ui #140, As

Specified, or
Equal

17 Raincoat, 15 EA $99.00 $1,485.00 PETRA ROC 48RV YES
Newport

/ Harbor, Style
\_/ #02230, As
Specified, or
Equal

~18 Shield Genesis 50 EA $175.00 - |. $8,750.00 ' ELBECO - SH3804 YES
Jacket, Elbeco
Style #SH3804,

1/ NO

EXCEPTIONS

19 Security Parka, 15 EA $65.00 $975.00 LIBERTY 568MNV YES

) Liberty . .

. Uniform, Style
/ #568MNV, As

\/ Specified, or

Equal

0] Full Zip Fleece 10 EA $48.00 $480.00 ' HARRINGTON | M990 YES
Jacket, With ’
. Embroidery,
\, Harrington,
Style #M990,
As Specified,
or Equal

Introduced on: October 152025 :
Adopted AGTION UNIPORMIC(] BBIPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Resolyfjont RAORSPEI4TPARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Page 9




[ACTION UNIFORM COJ] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:1.1-8

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line ltem

21

Description

Bike Patrol
Shirt, Short
Sleeve,
MOCEAN Style
#354, or Equal

20

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$78.00

Total Cost

$1,560.00

No Bid

Manufacturer

MOCEAN

Style

354

Delivery,

YES

Comments
A.R.O.

22

Bike Shorts,
Mocean,
Patrol Cargo
Short, Style
#1059, As
Specified, or
Equal

10

PR

$65.00

$650.00

MOCEAN

1059

YES

Bike Pants,
Mocean, Zip-
Off Pant Style
#20587,
Regular sizing,
As Specified,
or Equal

10

PR

$94.00

$940.00

MOCEAN

20582

YES

24

Baseball Cap,
KC Caps, Style
#5110, As
Specified, or
Equal

30

EA

$24.00

$720.00

KC CAPS

5110s

YES

Ball Cap,
Flexfit, As
Specified, or
Equal

35

EA

$28.00

$980.00

FLEXFIT

6277

YES

Watch Cap,
LawPro, Style
#4FHW765, As
Specified, or
Equal

30

EA

$15.00

$450.00

PORT
AUTHORITY

CP90

YES

Introduced on:

Qctober 15,2025

Adopted[HETION UNGQGHdra6) RRSPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resplytiqni RRASIIRTARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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[ACTION UNIFORM CO] RESPONSE
Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

DOCUMENT REPORT

Res-Pg:1.1-9

Line item

Description

Unit of Meas.

Unit Cost

Total Cost No Bid

Manufacturer

Style

Delivery, Comments

A.R.O.

- 27

Belt, Dutyman,
Style #1611U,
As Specified,
or Equal

30

EA

$19.00

$570.00

ART CRAFT

8095

YES

28

Tie, Samuel
Broome,
Button Over,
As Specified,
or Equal

60

EA

$8.00

$480.00

ART CRAFT

6001

YES

29

Collar
Ornament,
Smith &
Warren, Style
#M1502, As
Specified, or
Equal

40

EA

$34.00

$1,360.00

S&W

M1502

YES

30

Collar
Ornament,
HWC Police
Equipment
Company,
Gold Sgt. Bars,
As Specified,
or Equal

40

EA

$12.00

$480.00

S&W

SGT-4

YES

L

Tie Bar with
State Seal -
Gold Finish,
Smith &
Warren, Style
#CS10L, As
Specified, or
Equal

20

EA

$16.00

$320.00

S&W

CS10L-GOLD

Introduced on:

Qctober 15 2025
Adopted AGTION UNICORIMICG] BEZPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Begolufiat ¥R°RBH ARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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[ACTION UNIFORM COJ] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ' '

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-10

Line Item

Description

Tie Bar with
State Seal -
Nickel Finish,
Smith &
Warren, Style
#CS510L, As
Specified, or
Equal

20

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$16.00

Total Cost

© $320.00

Manufacturer

S&W

Style

C50L-NICKEL

Delivery,

YES

Comments
A.R.O.

33

Nameplate,
Reeves, Style
#0800, As
Specified, or
Equal

20

EA

$12.00

$240.00

ACT

CUST

YES

34

Safety Vest,
Safety Flag,
Style #SVC-
PLN-KV, As
Specified, or
Equal

15

EA

$24.00

$360.00

PETRAROC

LB2-BPSV

YES

35

Duty Gloves,
Hatch, Style
#GL410, As
Specified, or
Equal

15

PR

$39.00

$585.00

PF

6UD

YES

Shouider
Patch, Hero’s
| Pride, Style
#X107667A,
NO
EXCEPTIONS

400

EA

$2.25

) $900.00

HERO'S PRIDE

X107667A

YES

TOTAL

$79,040.00

Introduced on:

SECTION Il - CLERK OF THE BOARD (MAIL SERVICES)

October 152025

Adopted AGTION UNIBORMICE] REFPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official RegolufiRt IR PR PARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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[ACTION UNIFORM CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-11

Line Item Description ; Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Total Cost

No Bid

Manufacturer

Style

Delivery,

AR.O.

Comments

97B Posicharge 25 EA $18.00 $450.00
Competitor
Cotton Touch
Tee, Sport-Tek,
Style #ST450,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

SPORT-TEK

ST450

YES
N

TOTAL : $67,435.00

SECTION IV - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

Line Item Description

Unit of

Percentage

No Bid

Comments

98 Discount Percentage (%) for Uniforms not listed herein (NOT LESS THAN), As

Specified

Measure

%

5%

Introducedon:  October 15, 2025
AdOPt%l'g;@'I’ION UNPCSRIICIS] HEPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official

SONIHE RSP’ APARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
" Bid No. TBD '

Res-Pg:1.1-12

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line ltem

36

5

Description

Shoulder

_ [Patch, Hero's

Pride, Style
#X107667A,
NO
EXCEPTIONS

Qty.

Unit of Meas.

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Manufacturer

Style

Delivery,

AR.O.

Comments

TOTAL

$0.00

Line Iltem

37

Description

Short Sleeve
Polo Shirt,
Women, Ulira
Club, Style
#8530, As
Specified, or
Equal

15

SECTION Il - CLERK OF THE BOARD {MAIL SERVICES)

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$26.95

Total Cost

$404.25

No Bid

Manufacturer

ULTRA CLUB

Style

8530

Delivery,
A.R.O.

Comments

38

Short Sleeve
Polo Shirt,
Men, Ultra
Club, Style
#8534, As
Specified, or
Equal

15

EA

$28.95

$434.25

PORT
AUTHORITY

K420P

39

e

Full Zip
Hooded
Sweatshirt,
Men, Gildan,
Style #G18600,
As Specified,
or Equal

10

EA

$30.95

$309.50

PORT & CO.

PC787H

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025

AdOPte‘%RE\(IPO_RT Am«ohw; #25PONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
SRS AR FYAVTARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Official

Page 13



[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:1.1-13

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description ! Unit of Meas. Unit Cost

40 Men’s Polo 15 EA $37.95
Shirt, Short
Sleeve, Nike

. Men’s Dri-Fit
\/ Micro Pique
2.0, Style
#NKDC1963,
As Specified,
or Equal

£ $569.25

Total Cost No Bid

Manufacturer

NIKE

Style

NKDC1963

Delivery, Comments
A.R.O.

41 Men'’s Polo ' 15 EA $42.95
Shirt, Short
} Sleeve, Nike

-~ [Men’s Dri-Fit
\/ Classic Polo,
Style #267020,
As Specified,
or Equal

$644.25

NIKE

267020

42 Men's Polo 15 EA $42.95
/ Shirt, Long

Sleeve, Nike
U Men’s Dri-Fit
Micro Pique
2.0
#NKDC2104,
As Specified,
or Equal

$644.25

NIKE

NKDC2104

43 Ladies Polo 15 EA $37.95
; Shirt, Short

Sleeve, Nike

Ladies Dri-Fit
\’ Micro Pigue
2.0, Style
#NKDC1991,
As Specified,
or Equal

$569.25

NIKE

NKDC1991

Introduced on: October 15, 2025

g?f?g;?d RE’{IPORT Aotolrex 18] 20290 ONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
SR AR AN ARIOUS DEPARTMENTS -
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD )
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-14

Line item Description 3 Unit of Meas. Unit Cost

Total Cost No Bid

Manufacturer

Style

Delivery, Comments
AR.O.

44 Ladies Polo 15 EA $42.95
Shirt, Short
Sleeve, Nike

. . Ladies Dri-Fit
v Classic Polo,

A Style #286772,
As Specified,
or Equal

$644.25

NIKE

286772

45 Ladies Polo 15 EA $42.95
Shirt, tong
Sleeve, Nike

/ Ladies Dri-Fit

' Micro Pique

Y 2.0, Style
H#NKDC2105,
As Specified,
or Equal

$644.25

NIKE

NKDC2105

46 Rain Jacket, 10 EA $42.95
3 Port Authority
/ - | Essential Rain

. Jacket, Style
#1407, As
Specified, or
Equal

$429.50

PORT
AUTHORITY

1407

47 Safety Vest, 10 EA | $2495
/ GSS Enhanced
1 Visibility Vest,
Style
#GS51712, As
Specified, or
Equal

$249.50

GSS

1713

Introduced on: October 15, 2025

AdoptedignypRT ARRAIORERAS RBSBONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Off'c'a'(g%\;'ﬂﬂﬁ?%Rﬁ%sﬁ’éﬂTg&RnoUs DEPARTMENTS

Page 15



[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS.

Res-Pg:l.1-15

Line Item Description s Unit of Meas. Unit Cost

48A Snapback Cap, 10 EA $10.95
S . |Port Authority,
Style #C118,
\v As Specified,
or Equal

Total Cost

$109.50

No Bid

Manufacturer

PORT
AUTHORITY

Style

Cl118

Delivery,
AR.O.

Comments

488 Snapback Cap, 10 EA $16.95
Port Authority, :

/ Style #C118,
9% True Blue, Mail
Services
Embroidery, As
Specified, or
Equal

$169.50

PORT
AUTHORITY

C118

49 Fleece Beanie, 10 EA $14.95

- Port Authority
R-Tek Stretch
\/ Fleece Beanie,
Style #C900,

As Specified,
or Equal

$149.50

PORT
AUTHORITY

€300

TOTAL

$5,971.00

’SECTION (Il - CONSUMER AFFAIRS DEPARTMENT

.Introduced on: October 15, 2025

Adopte y ;
il Orcaomf %5@ R#2PONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - UNIFORM ARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY]
Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Res-Pg:1.1-16

Line Item

50A

Description

Jacket, 5.11
Zippered
Tactical Fleece
Jacket #48038,
Embroidery:
"Ocean
County”
above,
"Consumer
Protection”
below, may
require the
word
"Director", As
Specified, or
Equal

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$98.95

Total Cost

$494.75

No Bid

Manufacturer

Style

78026

Delivery,
A.R.O.

Comments

508

Jacket, 5.11
Zippered
Tactical Fleece
Jacket #48038,
Embroidery:
"Ocean County
Consumer
Affairs" above
and "Weights
& Measures"
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

$98.95

$494.75

78026

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025

AdopteqpaypORT ARRIR

R#ZPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-17

Line Item

50C

Description

Jacket, 5.11
Zippered
Tactical Fleece
Jacket #48038,
Embroidery:
Scale of Justice
with "Ocean
County
Consumer
Affairs" above
top and
"Weights &
Measures”

| below, As

Specified, or
Equal

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$98.95

Total Cost

$494.75

No Bid

Manufacturer

5.11

Style

78026

Delivery,

A.R.O.

Comments

51A

Fleece Lined
Jacket, Dickies
#33237,
Embroidery:
"Ocean
County"
above,
"Consumer
Protection”
below, may
require the
word
"Director", NO
EXCEPTIONS

EA

$49.95

$249.75

DICKIES

33237

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025

Page 18
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD 4
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-18

Line Iltem

51B

Description

Fleece Lined
Jacket, Dickies
#33237,
Embroidery:
"Ocean County
Consumer
Affairs" above
and "Weights
& Measures”
below, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$49.95

Total Cost

$249.75

No Bid

Manufacturer

DICKIES

Style

33237

Delivery,

AR.O.

Comments

51C

Fleece Lined
Jacket, Dickies
#33237,
Embroidery:
Scale of Justice
with "Ocean
County
Consumer
Affairs" above
top and
"Weights &
Measures"
below, NO
EXCEPTIONS

EA

$49.95

$249.75

DICKIES

33237

Introduced on:

ctober 15, 2025
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-19

Line item Description Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Style Delivery, Comments
AR.O.

Polo Shirt,
Men, Short
Sleeve, Tru-
Spec
Performance
Polo #4336,
/'I Embroidery:
/ "Ocean
/ County"
above,
"Consumer
Protection”
below, may
require the
word
"Director", NO
EXCEPTIONS

EA $48.95 $979.00 TRU SPEC 4336

528 Polo Shirt, 20 EA $48.95 $975.00 TRU SPEC 4336
3 Men, Short
Sleeve,
Embroidery:

\/ "Ocean County
Consumer
Affairs" above
and "Weights
& Measures"
below, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Introduced on: October 15, 2025

Adopte REYPO FQWWW ALPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official eao
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-20

Line Item Description Unit of Meas. Unit Cost

52C Polo Shirt, 5 EA $48.95
Men, Short
Sleeve,
Embroidery:
Scale of Justice
with "Ocean
County
/ Consumer
\/ Affairs" above
top and
"Weights &
Measures"
below, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Total Cost

$244.75

No Bid

Manufacturer

TRU SPEC

Style

4336

Delivery,
A.R.O.

Comments

53 polo Shirt, 25 EA $19.50

Men, Short
/ Sleeve, Sport-
v Tek
Micropique
Sport Wick,
Style #ST650,
As Specified,
or Equal

$487.50

SPORT TEK

ST650

S4A Polo Shirt, 20 EA
Women, Short
Sleeve, Tru-
/ Spec
Performance
Polo, Style
#4375,
Embroidery:
"Ocean County
Consumer
Affairs" above
and "Weights
& Measures"
below, NO
EXCEPTIONS
Introduced on: Qctober 15,2025

'$48.95

$979.00

TRU SPEC

4375

Adopted;oni
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Bid - UNIFORM ARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
Page 21



[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-21

Line item

548

Description

Polo Shirt,
Women, Short
Sleeve, Tru-
Spec
Performance
Polo, Style
#4375,
Embroidery:
Scale of Justice
with “Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Protection”
below, NO
EXCEPTIONS

20

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$48.95

Tota! Cost

. $979.00

No Bid

Manufacturer

TRU SPEC

4375

Style

Delivery,

A.R.C.

Comments

Polo Shirt,
Women, Long
Sleeve, Tru-
Spec
Performance
Polo, Style
#4420, NO
EXCEPTIONS

© 15

"EA

$47.95

$719.25

TRU SPEC

4420

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025

Adopted ppypORT ARAIOREIVD
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Res-Pg:1.1-22
[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line item Description . Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Style Delivery, Comments

A.R.O.

56A Oxford Shirt, 20 EA $29.95 $599.00 RED KAP SR70/SR71
Long Sleeve,
Men and
Women, Red
Kap, Model#
SR70LB Men,
Model#
SR71LB
Women,
| Embroidery:
Ocean
County" -
above,
"Consumer
Protection"
below, may
require the
word
"Director", As
Specified, or
Equal

568 - 1Oxford Shirt, 20 EA $29.95 $599.00 RED KAP SR70/SR71
Long Sleeve, .
Men and ‘ B
Women, Red
| Kap, Model#
SR70LB Men,
/ Model#
T/ SR71LB
Women,
Embroidery:
"Ocean County
Consumer
Affairs" above
and "Weights
& Measures",
As Specified,
or Equal

Introduced on: October 15, 2025 »
Adopted ey p A&gmfm@ H2PONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid

Official esoluggr;‘;#'
id - UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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Res-Pg:1.1-23
[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description ; Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Style Delivery, Comments

A.R.O.

56C Oxford Shirt, 20 EA $29.95 $599.00 RED KAP SR70/SR71
Long Sleeve,
Men and
Women, Red
Kap, Model#
SR70LB Men,
/7 Model#
SR71LB

Vi Women,
Embroidery:
Scale of Justice
with “Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Protection”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

56D Oxford Shirt, 20 EA $29.95 $599.00 RED KAP SR70/SR71
e Long Sleeve,
Men and
Women, Red
Kap, Model#
i SR70LB Men,
Model#
SR71LB
Women,
Embroidery:
Scale of Justice
with “Ocean
County
Consumer
Affairs” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced-er October |u, 2025

g?f‘i’g;?‘g@g Iutlo mﬁ/ ' RE3PONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Res-Pg:1.1-24
[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT ‘

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description ] Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Style Delivery, Comments
AR.O.

57A . Oxford Shirt, 20 EA $28.95 : §579.00 RED KAP SR60/SR61
Short Sleeve,
Men and
Women, Red
Kap, Model#
SR60LB Men,
Model#
“|SR61LB
Women,
Embroidery:

/ . "Ocean

County"

[/ above,
"Consumer
Protection"
below, may
require the
word
"Director”, As
Specified, or
Equal

578 Oxford Shirt, 20 - ) EA $28.95 $579.00 RED KAP SR60/SR61
Short Sleeve,
Men and
Women, Red
Kap, Model#
SR60LB Men,
Model#
SR61LB
Women,

V] Embroidery:
"Ocean County
Consumer
Affairs" above
and "Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introducee-on: etober 452025
Adopte D,
Asereqeyc A SRONSE DOCUMENT rePorT
. Bid - UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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Res-Pg:1.1-25 .
[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD .
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description 3 Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Style Delivery, Comments

A.R.O.

57C Oxford Shirt, 20 EA $28.95 . $579.00 RED KAP SR60/SR61
Short Sleeve,
Men and
Women, Red
Kap, Model#
SR60LB Men,
Model#
SR61LB
Women,
Embroidery:
/ Scale of Justice
V] with “Ocean
County
Consumer
Affairs” above
and "Weights

| & Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

58 Pants, PDU 10 PR $68.95 $689.50 5.11 64472
Duty, Women,

/ - 5.11 Style

1% |#64306, NO
EXCEPTIONS

59 Pants, BDU, 10 PR $54.95 $549.50 5.11 74251
/ 5.11 Tactical
] Style #74251,
NO
EXCEPTIONS

Duty, Men,
RV 5.11 Style
#74326, NO
EXCEPTIONS

//"e';o Pants, PDU 10 PR $68.95 $689.50 5.11 74551

Introduced on: October 15, 2025
Adopteq ey pORT ARREPR RE2PONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Ft' .

Il R O U RV FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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4 Res-Pg:1.1-26
[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line item Description s Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Style Delivery, Comments

A.R.O.

61 Tactical Pants, 35 PR $51.95 $1,818.25 5:%1 74273
Men's, 5.11
» Taclite Pro
/ Ripstop Pants,
. \4 ) Style #74273,
As Specified,
or Equal

62A Parka, 5.11 3- 5 EA $209.95 $1,049.75 5.11 48358
In-One Parka,
Style #48001,
Embroidery:
"Ocean
County"
above,

ul "Consumer
Protection”
below, may
require the
word
"Director”, NO
EXCEPTIONS

62B Parka, 5.11 3- 5 EA $209.95 $1,049.75 5.11 48358
In-One Parka,

' ’ Style #48001,
Embroidery:
U "Ocean County

Consumer
Affairs" above
and "Weights
& Measures"
below, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Introduced on: October 15, 2025
g?.f‘i’ggi gﬁgmg%@g‘?g@% REEPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
_ Bid ARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
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[KEYPORT ARMY -NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-27

Line [tem Description . Unit of Meas. Unit Cost

62C - [{Parka, 5.11 3- 5 EA $209.95
In-One Parka,
Style #48001,
Embroidery:
Scale of Justice
: with “Ocean
/ County
Consumer
Affairs” above
and "Weights
& Measures"
below, NO
EXCEPTIONS

Total Cost

$1,049.75

No Bid Manufacturer

Style

48358

Delivery, Comments
A.R.O.

63A Cap, Rothco, 5 EA $18.95
Style #8492,
Embroidery:
"Ocean
County"
/ above,

"Consumer
Protection"
below, may
require the
word
"Director”, As
Specified, or
Equal

$94.75

ROTHCO

8492 -

638 Cap, Rothco, 5 EA $18.95
’ Style #8492, :
d Embroidery:
/ "Ocean County
\/ Consumer
. Affairs" above
and "Weights
& Measures"
below, As
Specified, or
Equal
tober 1'; 202

Introdurﬂd 0.

$94.75

ROTHCO

8492

n:
A“°Pte YPORT Aﬁ’@? 'WAW]%%PONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Offi I ution#; 2
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-28

Line ltem

63C

Description

Cap, Rothco,
Style #8492,
Embroidery:
Scale of Justice
with “Ocean
County
Consumer

Affairs” above -

and "Weights
& Measures"
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$18.95

Total Cost

$94.75

Manufacturer

ROTHCO

Style

8492

Delivery, Comments
A.R.O.

‘64

Logger Boots,
Carolina 8"
Plain Toe
Logger Boot,
Style #ACA825,
NO
EXCEPTIONS

PR

$109.95

$549.75

CAROLINA

CA825

65

Boots, Men,
Magnhum
Stealth Force
6.0, Style
#5874, As
Specified, or
Equal

PR

$109.95

$549.75

THOROGOOD

804-6190

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-29

Line item

66A

Description

Sweatshirt,
Front Zip, .
Mens, Charles
River, Style
#9682,
Embroidery:
"Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Protection”
below, may
require the
word
“Director”, As
Specified, or
Equal

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$32.95

Total Cost

$164.75

Manufacturer

PORT
AURTHORITY

F217

Style

Delivery,
A.R.O.

Comments

668

Sweatshirt,
Front Zip,
Mens, Charles
River, Style
#9682,
Embroidery:
Scale of Justice
with “Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Protection”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal ’

‘EA

$32.95

$164.75

PORT
AUTHORITY

[F217

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025

Seniedeetp o ety

UNIFOR
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U “Consumer

[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:1.1-30

UNIFORMS FO_R VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Style Delivery, Comments
AR.O.

All Weather EA $57.95 $289.75 - |PORT 1331
lacket, Port ' AUTHORITY
Authority,
Style #J331,
Embroidery:
“Ocean’

County” above
and

Protection”
below, may
require the
word
“Director”, As
Specified, or
Equal

678 All Weather S EA $57.95 $289.75 - PORT J331
Jacket, Port AUTHORITY
Authority,

Style #)331,
Embroidery:
“Ocean County

Consumer
Affairs” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

Introduced on: October 15, 2025

Adopte
Official
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY]
Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Res-Pg:1.1-31

Line Item

67C

Description

All Weather
lacket, Port
Authority,
Style #1331,
Embroidery:
Scale of Justice
with “Ocean
County
Consumer
Affairs” above
and "Weights
& Measures"
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$57.95

Total Cost

$289.75

Manufacturer

PORT .
AUTHORITY

Style

1331

Delivery,
AR.O.

Comments

68A

Long Sleeve T-
Shirt, Gildan
Soft, Style
#64400,
Embroidery:
"Ocean
County" above
and
"Consumer
Protection”
below, may
require the
word
"Director"”, As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

$19.95

$99.75

GILDAN

64400

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-32

Line Item

Description

Unit of Meas.

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Manufacturer

Style

Comments

688

Long Sleeve T-
Shirt, Gildan
Soft, Style
#64400,
Embroidery:
"Ocean County
Consumer
Affairs" above
and "Weights
& Measures"
below, As

Specified, or

Equal

EA

$19.95

$99.75

GILDAN

64400

68C

Long Sleeve T-
Shirt, Gildan
Soft, Style
#64400,
Embroidery:
Scales of
Justice with
"Qcean County
Consumer
Affairs" above
and "Weights
& Measures"
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

$19.95

$99.75

GILDAN

64400

69

Pleated Khaki .
Pants, Red Kap
Pleated Front,

Style #PC4A6KH, |-

As Specified,
or Equal

PR

$32.95

$164.75,

RED KAP

PC44

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025

Adopt D
Ot HEEIPORT ARRAORENYY

REEPONSE DOC

UMENT REPORT

Bid - UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Page 33



[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-33

Line ltem

70

Description

Leather Belt,
Red Kap, Style
H#HAB14BK, As
Specified, or
Equal

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$24.95

Total Cost

$124.75

No Bid

‘| RED KAP

Manufacturer

Style

- |AB14

Delivery,
AR.O.

Comments

71

Oxford Style .
Safety Shoe,
Unisex, Lehigh,
Style
#LEHI002, As
Specified, or
Equal

10

EA

$84.95

$849.50

AVENGER

A7119

o

Loose Fit
Midweight
Rain Jacket,
Regular,
Carhartt, Style
#103510,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As’
Specified, or
Equal

EA

$69.75

$348.75

CARHARTT

106434

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025

Adopte
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Introdu
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Official

[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:1.1-34

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item

728

Description

Loose Fit *
Midweight
Rain Jacket,
Regular,
Carhartt, Style
#103510,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$69.75

Total Cost

$348.75

No Bid

Manufacturer

CARHARTT

Style

106434

Delivery,
AR.O.

Comments

73A

Loose Fit
Midweight
Rain Jacket,
Tall, Carhartt,
Style #103510,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

EA

$74.95

$374.75

CARHARTT

106434

ced on:

October 15, 2025
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-35

Line Item

73B

Description

Loose Fit
Midweight
Rain Jacket,
Tall, Carhartt,
Style #103510,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$74.95

Total Cost

$374.75

Manufacturer

CARHARTT

Style

104670

Delivery,
A.R.O.

Comments

74

Force ESD
NANO Toe
Shoe, Carhartt,
Style
#CMD3461, As
Specified, or
Equal

10

EA

$99.95

$999.50

CARHARTT

CMD3461 .

75A

Loose Fit
Midweight
Hoodie,
Regular,
Carhartt, Style
#K121,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

10

EA

$46.95

$469.50

CARHARTT

K121

Introduced on:

e ORT AR Ry} REGPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

October 15, 2025
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Res-Pg:1.1-36
[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD '
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line [tem Description 1 Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Style Delivery, Comments

AR.O.

758  llLoose Fit 10 EA $46.95 $469.50 CARHARTT K121
Midweight ‘ Co
Hoodie,
Regutar,
Carhartt, Style

#K121, v
/ Embroidery:
\ “Ocean

County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

75C Loose Fit 10 EA $48.95 $489.50 CARHARTT K121
Midweight
Hoodie,
Regular,

/ Carhartt, Style
Vi #K121,
Embroidery:
Scales of
Justice with
“Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Speciﬁéd,
or Equal

Introduced on: October 15, 2025
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-37

Line item Description ] Unit of Meas. Unit Cost

76A Loose Fit e 5 EA $48.95
Midweight
Hoodie, Tall,
Carhartt, Style

s - l#Kazg,
/ Embroidery:
\, “Ocean

County” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

Total Cost

$244.75

No Bid Manufacturer

CARHARTT

Style

K121

Delivery, Comments
A.R.O.

768 -|LooseFit 5 “EA $48.95
Midweight
Hoodie, Tall,

Carhartt, Style
\ #K121,
Embroidery:

“Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

$244.75

CARHARTT

K121

77 Jean Belt, 10 EA $31.95
/ ’ Carhartt, Style
\ #A0005511, As

Specified, or
Equal

$319.50

'CARHARTT

A0005502

Introduced on: October 15, 2025
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-38

Line {tem Description Unit of Meas. Unit Cost

78A Super Dux 10 EA $109.95
Relaxed Fit
Sherpa-Lined
Active Jac-2
Warmer
Rating,
Regular,

Carhartt, Style
- \,/ #105001,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

Total Cost

$1,099.50

No Bid

Manufacturer

CARHARTT

Style

103826

Delivery,
AR.O.

Comments

788 Super Dux i 10 EA $109.95
Relaxed Fit

Sherpa-Lined

; Active Jac-2

/ Warmer
_‘/ Rating,

Regular,
Carhartt, Style
#105001,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

$1,099.50

CARHARTT

103826

Introduced on: October 15, 2025
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[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

'UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-39

Line item

Description

Super Dux
Relaxed Fit
Sherpa-tined
Active Jac-2
Warmer
Rating, Tall,
Carhartt, Style
#105001,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

10

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$114.95

Total Cost

$1,149.50

Manufacturer

CARHARTT

NS

103826

Delivery,
AR.O.

Comments

798

Super Dux
Relaxed Fit
Sherpa-Lined
Active Jac-2
Warmer
Rating, Tall,
Carhartt, Style
#105001,

.Embroidery:

“Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

EA

$114.95

$574.75

CARHARTT

103826

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025
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Res-Pg:1.1-40
[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Line Item Description : Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Totat Cost No Bid Manufacturer Style Delivery, Comments

A.R.O.

80 Men's 20 EA $31.95 $639.00 . CARHARTT AS511
Waterproof
Insulated Knit
Cuff Gloves,

/ Carhartt, Style
\' #A511, As
Specified, or
Equal

81 Tonal Patch 10 EA $24.95 $249.50 CARHARTT 1101070
Beanie, .
U Carhartt, Style

#101070, As
Specified, or
Equal

82A Force Long ‘20 EA $24.95 $499.00 SPORT-TEK ST700LS
Sleeve
Lightweight T-
/ shirt, Regular,
\/ Carhartt, Style
#105846,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal :
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Line Item Description . Unit of Meas.

828 Force Long, 20 EA
Sleeve .

Lightweight T-
shirt, Regular,
Carhartt, Style
#105846,

Embroidery:
“Ocean

County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

Unit Cost

$24.95

Total Cost

$499.00

No Bid

Manufacturer

SPORT-TEK

Style

ST700LS

Delivery,
AR.O.

Comments

83A force Long 20 EA
Sleeve
Lightweight T-
shirt, Tall,
Carhartt, Style
#105846,
\/ _ ~ |Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

$24.95

$499.00

SPORT-TEK

TST350LS
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Line item

838

’

Description

Force Long
Sleeve
Lightweight T-

‘| shirt, Tall,

Carhartt, Style
#105846,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

20

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

- $24.95

Total Cost

$499.00

No Bid

Manufacturer

SPORT-TEK

Style

TST350L5

Delivery,
AR.O.

Comments

84A

Loose Fit
Heavyweight
Long Sleeve
Pocket T-shirt,
Regular,
Carhartt, Style
#K126,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

15

EA

$31.75

$476.25

CARHARTT

K126

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025

Otfvaar ALY OBTARRAEREYY) RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Page 43



[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-43

Introdu

Line item

848

Description

Loose Fit
Heavyweight
Long Sleeve
Pocket T-shirt,
Regular,
Carhartt, Style

" 1#K126,

Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

15

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$31.75

Total Cost

$476.25

Manufacturer

CARHARTT

K126

Style

Delivery,
A.R.O.

Comments

85A

Loose Fit
Heavyweight
Long Sleeve
Pocket T-shirt,
Tall, Carhartt,
Style #K126,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

15

EA

$33.75

$506.25

CARHARTT

K126

ced on:

October 15, 2025

Adopte
Official

lon#.

BAVPaRT ARDEIIRRUARESBONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
id

Bid - UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Page 44



[KEYPORT ARMY NAVY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

UNIFORMS FOR VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

Res-Pg:1.1-44

Line Item

Description

Unit of Meas.

Unit Cost

Total Cost No Bid

Manufacturer

Style

Delivery, Comments

AR.O.

858

Loose Fit
Heavyweight
Long Sleeve
Pocket T-shirt,
Tall, Carhartt,
Style #K126,
Embroidery:
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

15

EA

$33.75

$506.25

CARHARTT

K126

86

Ripstop Pant,
S.11 Tactical,

{Taclite Pro,

Style #74273,
Men's, As
Specified, or
Equal

25

PR

$51.95

$1,298.75

5.11

{74273

87

Ripstop Short,
5.11 Tactical,
Taclite Pro 11",
Style #73308,
As Specified,
or Equal

25

PR

$48.95

$1,223.75

73308

88

N

Waterproof
Boot, 5.11 A/T
Mid, Style
#124460C, As
Specified, or
Equal

25

PR

$134.95

$3,373.75

5.11

12446
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Line ltem Description . Unit of Meas.

89 Rush Moab 8 10 EA

Sling Pack 13L,
/ 5.11, Style

Y #56810, As

Specified, or

Equal

Unit Cost

$76.95

Total Cost

$769.50

Manufacturer

5.11

Style

56810

Delivery,
A.R.O.

Comments

90 Men's Safety 10 PR
Toe Slip-on
) Shoes,
/ . | ComfortPro,
U Red Wing
Shoes, Style
#6705, As
Specified, or
Equal

$124.95

$1,249.50

RED WING

6705

91 Men's Safety 10 PR
Toe Athletic
\‘ / Work Shoe,
Cooltech
Athletics, Red
Wing Shoes,
Style #6352, As
Specified, or
Equal

$147.95

$1,479.50

RED WING

6352

92 Men's 6-Inch 10 PR
Waterproof
Safety Toe

/ Boot, BRNR XP,
H Red Wing
Shoes, Style
#2400, As
Specified, or
Equal

$169.95

$1,699.50

RED WING

2400
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Line Item

93A

Description

Dri-Mesh Polo,
Tall, Sport Tek,
Style #TK469,

1Embroidery:

“Ocean
County” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

15

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$29.95

Total Cost

$449.25

No Bid

Manufacturer

SPORT-TEK

Style

TK469

BEINVEIA Comments

A.R.O.

Dri-Mesh Polo,

Tall, Sport-Tek,
Style #TK469,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

15

EA

$29.95

$449.25

SPORT-TEK

TK469

94A

Dri-mesh Pro
Polo, Sport-
Tek, Style
HTKA74,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and “Weights

-& Measures”

below, As
Specified, or
Equal

20

EA

$29.95

" $599.00

SPORT-TEK

TK474
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Line Item Description Qty. Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Style Delivery, Comments
AR.O.

948 Dri-mesh Pro 20 EA $29.95 $599.00
Polo, Sport
Tek, Style
#TK474,

SPORT-TEK

County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

95A Long Sleeve 20 EA $29.95 $599.00 SPORT-TEK ST657
: Micropique : )
Sport Wick

Polo, Sport-

Tek, Style
/ #ST657,
“Ocean
County” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As

Specified, or
Equal
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Introdu

Line Iltem

958

Description

Long Sleeve
Micropique
Sport Wick
Polo, Sport-
Tek, Style
#7657,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

20

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$29.95

Total Cost

$599.00

No Bid

Manufacturer

SPORT-TEK

Style

ST657

Delivery,
A.R.O.

Comments

96A

Posicharge
Competitor
Tee, Tall,
Sport-Tek,
Style #TST350,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

20

EA

$21.95

$439.00

SPORT-TEK

TST350LS
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Line Iltem

96B

Description

Posicharge
Competitor
Tee, Tall,
Sport-Tek,
Style #TST350,
Embroidery:
“Qcean
County” above
and

1 “Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,
or Equal

25

Unit of Meas.

EA

Unit Cost

$21.95

Total Cost

$548.75

No Bid

Manufacturer

SPORT-TEK

Style

TST350LS

Delivery,
A.R.O.

Comments

97A

Posicharge
Competitor
Cotton Touch

Style #ST450,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and “Weights
& Measures”
below, As
Specified, or
Equal

Tee, Sport-Tek,

25 .

EA

$21.95

$548.75

SPORT-TEK

ST450
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Line item

Description Unit of Meas. Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer

Style

Delivery, Comments

A.R.O.

978 Posicharge 25 EA $548.75 SPORT-TEK ST450
Competitor
Cotton Touch
Tee, Sport-Tek,
Style #ST450,
Embroidery:
“Ocean
County” above
and
“Consumer
Affairs” below,
As Specified,

or Equal

$21.95

TOTAL

$52,581.50

Line Item

SECTION IV - DISCOUNT RATE FOR ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN'

Unit of
Measure

No Bid

Description

Percentage Comments

Discount Percentage (%) for Uniforms not listed herein (NOT LESS THAN}), As
Specified

% 10%
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