



Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Joseph H. Vicari
Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191
(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

Board Meeting Agenda

Date: October 4, 2023 - 4:00 PM
Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT to Van Wickle Auto Supply, Inc., the lowest qualified bidder. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 39 and 40 as unresponsive. They will be rebid. (B2023-153)

Official Resolution#		2023001408					
Meeting Date		10/04/2023					
Introduced Date		10/04/2023					
Adopted Date		10/04/2023					
Agenda Item		k-1					
CAF #							
Purchase Req. #		B2023-153					
Result		Adopted					
COUNTY COMMISSIONER	PRES.	ABS.	MOVE	SEC	AYE	NAY	ABST.
Vicari	✓				✓		
Quinn	✓				✓		
Crea	✓			✓	✓		
Haines	✓				✓		
Kelly	✓		✓		✓		

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING REFERENCED THEREON

Michelle I. Gunther

Clerk Of The Board

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS
NO. B2023-153

RESOLUTION

October 4, 2023

WHEREAS, on August 8, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor, sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder

Van Wickle Auto Supply, Inc.
201 Hwy 71
Spring Lake Heights, NJ 07762
(732) 449-0100

Central Jersey Equipment, LLC
670 Rt. 40
Elmer, NJ 08318
(856) 358-2880

Priority Group Services, LLC
217 Fairmount Ave, Unit 1
Newark, NJ 07103
(347) 985-3863

Name and Address of Bidder

RJP Hotsy, LLC
17R Lakewood Road
New Egypt, NJ 08533
(609) 286-2958

Ecom Group, Inc.
3775 Park Ave. Unit 3
Edison, NJ 08820
(718) 504-7324

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to specifications, be accepted, namely that of, VAN WICKLE AUTO SUPPLY, INC. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 39 and 40 as unresponsive. They will be rebid.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to enter into a contract, for the furnishing and delivery of Batteries for Various Equipment, for the County of Ocean, for the contract period effective from date of award through October 3, 2024 a period of one (1) year, OR until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. VAN WICKLE AUTO SUPPLY, INC., for ten (10) items, to wit:
ITEMS NO. 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37 and 38.

For a Total Lump Sum Award Section II (Item #'s 29 - 35) of \$3,860.05.

For a Total Lump Sum Award Section III (Item #'s 36 - 38) of \$13,956.50.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. Funds for the materials shall be available within the following funding Source: Parks Department; Solid Waste Management, Transportation Department and Vehicle Services Department O.E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-153.

5. BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchase, Department of Finance, Parks Department, Solid Waste Management, Transportation Department, Vehicle Services and Van Wickle Auto Supply, Inc. the Successful Bidder.

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
 Bid No. TBD
 BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

VAN WICKLE AUTO SUPPLY, INC.

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments
27	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: H7 AGM As Specified	5	EA	\$152.17	\$760.85		
28	Trade-In Allowance for Section I (DEDUCT) As Specified	750	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00		UNIT'S COST INCLUDES CORE RETURN
TOTAL					\$67,683.85		

SECTION II - SPECIALTY BATTERIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments
29	Golf Cart Batteries BCI Group Number: 570 MF As Specified	5	EA	\$105.64	\$528.20		
30	Golf Cart Batteries BCI Group Number: GC12 As Specified	5	EA	\$214.42	\$1,072.10		
31	Golf Cart Batteries BCI Group Number: GC8 As Specified	5	EA	\$122.78	\$613.90		
32	Golf Cart Batteries BCI Group Number: GC2 As Specified	5	EA	\$118.52	\$592.60		
33	Lawn Mower Batteries BCI Group Number: U1L As Specified	5	EA	\$37.57	\$187.85		
34	Military Batteries BCI Group Number: 6TL As Specified	5	EA	\$173.08	\$865.40		
35	Trade-In Allowance for Section II (DEDUCT) As Specified	20	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00		UNIT PRICE INCLUDES CORE RETURN
TOTAL					\$3,860.05		

SECTION III - DEEP CYCLE BATTERIES

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
 Bid No. TBD
 BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

VAN WICKLE AUTO SUPPLY, INC.

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments
36	Deep Cycle Batteries BCI Group Number: 24 As Specified	20	EA	\$83.00	\$1,660.00		UNIT COST INCLUDES CORE RETURN
37	Deep Cycle Batteries BCI Group Number: 31 As Specified	50	EA	\$245.93	\$12,296.50		
38	Trade-In Allowance for Section III (DEDUCT) As Specified	75	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00		
TOTAL					\$13,956.50		

SECTION IV - VOTING MACHINE BATTERIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments
39	Voting Machine Batteries As Specified (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
40	Trade-In Allowance for Section IV (DEDUCT) As Specified		EA	No Bid	No Bid	X	
TOTAL					\$0.00		

SECTION II – SPECIALTY BATTERIES

✓ **ITEM # 29 – Golf Cart Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 525 / (CA) 665

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 570 MF

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 24 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 540

Reserve Capacity: 80

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 36 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: DEKA/NAPA

Product Code Number: 7570

✓ **ITEM # 30 – Golf Cart Batteries**

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: GC12

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 24 Months

Reserve Capacity: 280

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: DEKA/NAPA

Product Code Number: 8141

✓ **ITEM # 31 – Golf Cart Batteries**

Voltage: 8

BCI Group Number: GC8

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 24 Months

Reserve Capacity: 318

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: DEKA/NAPA

Product Code Number: 8148

✓ **ITEM # 32 – Golf Cart Batteries**

Voltage: 6

BCI Group Number: GC2

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 24 Months

Reserve Capacity: 395

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: DEKA/NAPA

Product Code Number: 8143

Introduced on: October 4, 2023
Adopted on: October 4, 2023
Official Resolution#: 2023001408

SECTION II – SPECIALTY BATTERIES

✓ **ITEM # 33 – Lawn Mower Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 200

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: U1L

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 230

Reserve Capacity: Click or tap here to enter text.

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 6 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: DEKA/NAPA

Product Code Number: 8223

✓ **ITEM # 34 – Military Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps: 750

Voltage 12

BCI Group 6TL

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 month

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 750

Reserve Capacity: 230

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 6 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: DEKA/NAPA

Product Code Number: 7256

SECTION III – DEEP CYCLE BATTERIES

✓ **ITEM # 36 – Deep Cycle Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps: 400

Voltage 12

BCI Group Number 24

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 500

Reserve Capacity: 130

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: DEKA/NAPA

Product Code Number: 8302

✓ **ITEM # 37 – Deep Cycle Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps: Minimum of 800

Voltage 12

BCI Group: 31

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 925

Reserve Capacity: 200 *Reserve Capacity: must be over 200*

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 36 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: DEKA/NAPA

Product Code Number: 9837