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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

08754-2191

(732)929-2005
Commissioner Robert S. Arace (732)505-1918

Director John P. Kelly
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi

Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione

Commissioner Virginia E. Haines

Board Meeting Agenda

Date: December 17, 2025 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL
EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. Il to All for U, Inc. and E-Logic, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders. (B2025-
186)

Official Resolution# [2025001784
Meeting Date 12/17/2025
Introduced Date 12/17/2025
Adopted Date 12/17/2025
Agenda ltem i-8

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2025-186
Result Adopted
COUNTY g s g o lw [ !5;
COMMISSIONER § a g gi ﬁ g %
Kelly v v
Sadeghi v v
Arace v v v
Bacchione v v |v
Haines v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michaie . Guaner”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on:
Adopted on:
Official Resolu

ki

PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOU

NO. BQ\QQS‘ 'g(p

RESOLUTION

December 17, 2025

WHEREAS, on November 6, 2025 pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND
VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. II for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder

All for U, Inc. E-Logic, Inc.

21 D Granite Drive 2000 Pennsylvania Avenue NW

Lakewood, NJ 08701 Suite 7000

(609) 824-0682 Washington, DC 20006
(202) 499-7955

Every Need Supply LLC Star Data Co

16724 Oakboro Street P.O.Box 12

Winter Garden, F1 34787 Hewlett, NY 11557

(855) 425-1855 (201) 565-9876

Yellow Networks LL.C

3315 Aurora Avenue

Unit 203

Ames, 1A 50014
(712) 560-3633
; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance, namely, ALL FOR U, INC., and E-LOGIC, INC., be
accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, for the furnishing and delivery of PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND
VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. II for the County of Ocean, for the contract
period from December 17, 2025 through November 5, 2026, or until delivery is complete
unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract
pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. ALL FOR U, INC for seven (7) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 56, 58, 59, 60, 88, 94 and 101.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

December 17, 2025
December 17, 2025
on#: 2025001784

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON Au’dﬁﬁﬁ"’g ‘i18-2

{
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. B.  E-LOGIC, INC for four (4) items, to wit:
| ITEM NOS. 44, 45, 57 and 102.

E 2. Pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:30-5.4, the County has established a reasonable
§ | estimated maximum dollar value of $5,000.00 for the term of this contract, based on historical
procurement data for comparable goods or services. The County further reserves the right to
increase quantities by up to twenty percent (20%) of the maximum awarded amount at the

unit prices bid, in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:30-11.3.

3. Funds for the materials or services described herein shall be made available
through operating and expense (O&E) accounts, trust accounts, grant accounts, or capital
accounts maintained by, but not limited to, the following departments: Public Affairs,

Engineering, Medical Examiner, Parks Department and Sheriff’s Office.

4. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities

shall be indicated.

5. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-186.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Purchasing Department, Finance Department, Public
Affairs, Engineering, Medical Examiner, Parks Department and Sheriff’s Office and the

successful bidders.

Introduced on December 17, 2025
Adopted on: December 17, 2025
Official Resoldtfon#: 2025001784




Introduced-en:

[ALL FOR U INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. Il

Res-Pg:i.8-4

Line Item

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

SECTION 1V - CAMERAS, CAMCORDERS & ACCESSORIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

Total Cost

Manufacturer
{Required)

Product Name
and/or No.
{Required)

Delivery, AR.O.

Comments

44

Cable, USB-C,
100W Power
Delivery

EA

$10.95

$54.75

Anker

A8758

45

Camera Bag, 14"
Lx7"Wx11"D,
As Specified or
Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

56

Case, 750D
Silicone Camera
Case, TUYUNG
Camera Housing
Case Protective
Cover,
Compatible with
Canon EOS
7500 Rebel T6i
Camera, Red, or
Equal

EA

$19.99

$99.95

Tuyung

™

6118647615

57

Case, EasyCover
Camera Case,
Silicone
Protective Cover
for Canon 5D
Mark IV, Red, or
Equal

EA

$28.99

$144.95

- .
JIELARHUA

BODGY2LKFT

D.

ber17-2025.
R =
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AdoptedAdri: FOR U INIcBRIRONSBEBCUMENT REPORT
Official Besolutionty GRAANTEAUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. II
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[ALL FOR U INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. |l

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer  Product Name  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

(Required) and/or No.
(Required)

58 Case, 5 . EA $21.99 $109.95 Surpassed BOBMAZFG4S
Professional
Secure Silicone
Camera Case
/ Cover Housing
\/ Body Skin Full
Body Protective,
for Canon EOS
7D CMOS Digital
SLR Camera,
Red, or Equal

59 Case, Rieibi EOS S EA $19.99 $99.95 Rieibi BOBL1355QS
R7 Camera
Case, Silicone
/ for Canon EOS
V1 R7 Digital
Camera,
Protective Cover
Silicone for
Canon R7, Red,
or Equal

60 Case, S EA $7.99 $39.95 Abundant 860500000302
Unidentified Supply
/ .| Flashdrive Company
Organizer Case,
-{ Abundant
Supply
Company, Black

88 Lens Cleaning 5 EA $20.99 $104.95 ProOptic PROXCPK1

Kit, ProOptic
Complete Optics

/ Care and

A Cleaning Kit,

SKU: PROXCPK1,

or Equal

Introdueced-on: B nber47-2026

ZUZO

Adopted\bh:FOR U INGb&AB@NSFREECUMENT REPORT
OfficialfRgsopytiontsGZREMETSUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. |
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[ALL FOR U INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. |

Res-Pg:i.8-6

Line item

94

Description

Measuring
Scales Forensic
Kit, Standard
Photo Scale Kit,
SKU: A-66005K
or Equal

Est. Qty.

Unit of Measure

EA

Unit Cost

$74.99

Total Cost

$374.95

Manufacturer
(Required)

Arrowhead

Product Name
and/or No.
{Required)

A-66005K

Delivery, AR.O.

Comments

101

SanDisk Extreme
PRO CFexpress
Card Reader,
SKU: SDCFE-
0000-A46, or
Equal

EA

$51.99

$259.95

SanDisk

SDDR-F451-
GNGNN

102

SD Card Reader,
Kingston
Mobilelite Plus

25

EA

$16.99

$424.75

Kingston

MobileLite Plus

Introdueed-on:

D.

har 17 2025
Rber 12026

Adoptelfbh:FOR U INGEBERBENSEDSEUMENT REPORT
officialfgsobutionthG22PPAL7SUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. I
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[E-LOGIC, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. I

Line item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer Product Name  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
(Required} and/or No.
(Required)
44 Cable, USB-C, EA $7.37 $36.85 Rocstor Premium USB-C |21 N/A
100W Power Charging Cable
Delivery M/M-USB 3.1
Fast Charge &
Sync-3ft{im)-
100W PD -
Heavy Duty &
/ Durable - EMI
. Protection - 1 x
V 24-pin Type-C
Male - 1x 24-
pin USB 3.1
Type C Male -
For MacBook
Air, MacBook
Pro,
Chromebook,
Samsung Galaxy
- Black
/ 45 Camera Bag, 14" EA $325.02 $1,625.10 BEVISGEAR BEVISGEAR Top {21 N/A
\/ Lx7"Wx11"D, Shelf DSLR
As Specified or Camera
Equal Backpack
56 Case, 750D EA $21.98 $109.90 TUYUNG 7500 Silicone 21 N/A
Silicone Camera Case, TUYUNG
Case, TUYUNG Camera Housing
Camera Housing Case Protective
Case Protective Cover,
Cover, Compatible with
Compatible with Canon EOS
Canon EOS 750D Rebel T6i
7500 Rebel T6i Camera, Red
Camera, Red, or
Equal

Res-Pg:i.8-7

. 17 2028
Introduced-on- December47-202

AdoptefEetOGIC, INCHSRERMRNSE BREUMENT REPORT
OfficialiRgsopytion#; ROZBANTT84UDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. Il
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[E-LOGIC, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. Il

" Res-Pg:i.8-8

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost WEL Il (g Product Name  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
(Required) and/or No.
(Required)
57 Case, EasyCover 5 EA $21.34 $106.70 easyCover easyCover 21 N/A
Camera Case, Silicone
Silicone Protection
\// Protective Cover Cover for Canon
for Canon 50 EOS R {Red)
Mark IV, Red, or
Equal
58 Case, 5 EA $24.07 $120.35 Surpassed Professional 21 N/A
Professional Secure Silicone
Secure Silicone Camera Case
Camera Case Cover Housing
Cover Housing Body Skin Full
Body Skin Full Body Protective
Body Protective, Cases for Canon
for Canon EOS EOS 7D CMOS
7D CMOS Digital Digital SLR
SLR Camera, Camera (Red)
Red, or Equal
59 Case, Rieibi EOS 5 EA $22.58 $112.90 Rieibi Rieibi EOS R7 21 N/A
R7 Camera Camera Case,
Case, Silicone Silicone Case for
for Canon EOS Canon eos r7
R7 Digital Digital Camers,
Camera, Protective Cover
Protective Cover Silicone for
Silicone for Canon r7 - Red
Canon R7, Red,
or Equal
Introduced-on+ December47-2026

AdoptedohOGIC, INDEBESBENTE DOEUMENT REPORT
Official Brpolptientn GR2F9QIF8AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. |1
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[E-LOGIC, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. I

Res-Pg:i.8-9

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost No Bid Manufacturer Product Name  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
(Required) and/or No.
(Required)
' 102 SD Card Reader, 25 EA $12.21 Kingston Kingston 21 N/A
Kingston Mobilelite Plus
Mobilelite Plus SD Card Reader
Introduced-on: 1) rber44-2026

AdoptedBohOGIC, INDEBESBONGE 212EUMENT REPORT

Official Repoltiority SRAFINT8AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES NO. H
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