



Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Barbara Jo Crea
Deputy Director Gary Quinn
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Commissioner Frank Sadeghi

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191
(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

Board Meeting Agenda

Date: October 1, 2024 - 4:00 PM
Location: Administration Building
Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT to Batteries Plus - 1071 and East Coast Battery of NJ, LLC, the lowest qualified bidders. (B2024-138)

Official Resolution#	2024001474						
Meeting Date	10/01/2024						
Introduced Date	10/01/2024						
Adopted Date	10/01/2024						
Agenda Item	k-1						
CAF #							
Purchase Req. #	B2024-138						
Result	Adopted						
COUNTY COMMISSIONER	PRES.	ABS.	MOVE	SEC	AYE	NAY	ABST.
Crea	<				<		
Quinn	<				<		
Haines	<			<	<		
Kelly	<		<		<		
Sadeghi	<				<		

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING REFERENCED THEREON

Michelle I. Gunther

Clerk Of The Board

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

NO. **B2024-138**

RESOLUTION

October 1, 2024

WHEREAS, on August 6, 2024, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor, sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder

Batteries Plus – 1071
255 Rt. 35, Suite #4
Eatontown, NJ 07724
732-440-4660

Central Jersey Equipment
670 Rt. 40
Elmer, NJ 08318
856-358-2880

Kings Dream, LLC
158 South 9th Street
Newark, NJ 07107
908-342-7503

Name and Address of Bidder

East Coast Battery of NJ, LLC.
180 Main Street
Keansburg, NJ 07734
732-222-4114

Dapi/Pj's
301 New York Avenue
Washington, D.C. 20019
202-602-9706

Van Wickle Auto Supply, Inc
201 Hwy 71
Spring Lake Hgts 07762
732-449-0100

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to specifications, be accepted, namely that of, BATTERIES PLUS-1071 and EAST COAST BATTERY OF NJ, LLC .

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of Batteries for Various Equipment for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through September 30, 2025, a period of one (1) year, OR until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. BATTERIES PLUS - 1071. for twenty-nine (29) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1, 2, 3, 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24,
25, 26, 27, 28 and 29.

For a Total Lump Sum Award Section I (Item Nos. 1 - 29) of \$80,964.80.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants, Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

B. EAST COAST BATTERY OF NJ, LLC., for thirteen items (13), to
wit:

ITEM NOS. 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41 and 42.

For a Total Lump Sum Award Section II (Item Nos. 30 - 37) of \$4,850.00.

For a Total Lump Sum Award Section III (Item Nos. 38 - 40) of \$7,425.00.

For a Total Lump Sum Award Section IV (Item Nos. 41 and 42) of \$12,400.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants, Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. Funds for the materials shall be available within the following funding
Source: Vehicle Services Department O.E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2024-138.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made available to the County Auditor, County Department of Purchase, Department of Finance and Vehicle Services the successful bidders.

[BATTERIES PLUS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
 Bid No. TBD
 BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments
✓ 1	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 4D As Specified	20	EA	\$159.99	\$3,199.80		
✓ 2	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 8D As Specified	25	EA	\$175.00	\$4,375.00		
✓ 3	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 8D As Specified	10	EA	\$196.00	\$1,960.00		
✓ 4	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 24 As Specified	15	EA	\$79.00	\$1,185.00		
✓ 5	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 24F As Specified	10	EA	\$79.00	\$790.00		
✓ 6	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 26 As Specified	10	EA	\$72.00	\$720.00		
✓ 7	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 27 As Specified	5	EA	\$95.00	\$475.00		
✓ 8	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 27F As Specified	5	EA	\$95.00	\$475.00		
✓ 9	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 30H As Specified	5	EA	\$95.00	\$475.00		
✓ 10	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 31 As Specified	135	EA	\$85.00	\$11,475.00		
✓ 11	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 31P As Specified	35	EA	\$85.00	\$2,975.00		
✓ 12	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 34 As Specified	30	EA	\$92.00	\$2,760.00		
✓ 13	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 41 As Specified	5	EA	\$105.00	\$525.00		
✓ 14	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 47 As Specified	25	EA	\$95.00	\$2,375.00		
✓ 15	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 48 As Specified	5	EA	\$105.00	\$525.00		
✓ 16	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 49 As Specified	15	EA	\$125.00	\$1,875.00		
✓ 17	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 58 As Specified	10	EA	\$75.00	\$750.00		
✓ 18	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 58R As Specified	30	EA	\$72.00	\$2,160.00		
✓ 19	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 65 As Specified	224	EA	\$95.00	\$21,280.00		

Introduced on: October 1, 2024
 Adopted by: Resolution # 2024001474
 Official Register: October 1, 2024
 BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

[BATTERIES PLUS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments
✓ 20	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 75 As Specified	10	EA	\$81.00	\$810.00		
✓ 21	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 75/86 (Dual Terminal) As Specified	5	EA	\$94.00	\$470.00		
✓ 22	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 78 As Specified	10	EA	\$87.00	\$870.00		
✓ 23	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 94R As Specified	15	EA	\$145.00	\$2,175.00		
✓ 24	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 96R As Specified	35	EA	\$101.00	\$3,535.00		
✓ 25	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: AGM48 As Specified	30	EA	\$160.00	\$4,800.00		
✓ 26	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: AGM 94R-850 As Specified	30	EA	\$180.00	\$5,400.00		
✓ 27	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: H7 AGM As Specified	5	EA	\$180.00	\$900.00		
✓ 28	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 91, Amp Hour: 240 AH, 700 CCA, Cranking Amperage: 860 A, Manufacturer Part Number: 691MF, As Specified	5	EA	\$180.00	\$900.00		
✓ 29	Trade-In Allowance for Section I (DEDUCT) As Specified, the Trade-In Allowance shall be the price the vendor pays the County for each core. The core price MUST be included in the price of the battery.	750	EA	\$1.00	\$750.00		
TOTAL					\$80,964.80		

SECTION II - SPECIALTY BATTERIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments
30	Golf Cart Batteries BCI Group Number: 570 MF As Specified	10	EA	\$75.00	\$750.00		

Introduced on: October 1, 2024

Adopted by: BATTERIES PLUS RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resolution #: 2024001474

Bid: BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

✓ **SECTION I – AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES**

✓ **ITEM # 1 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 1000
 Voltage: 12
 BCI Group Number: 4D
 Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 1050
 Reserve Capacity: 145 AH
 Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
 Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
 Product Code Number: SLI4DA

✓ **ITEM # 2 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 1100
 Voltage: 12
 BCI Group Number: 8D
 Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 1100
 Reserve Capacity: 163 AH
 Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
 Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
 Product Code Number: SLI8DB

✓ **ITEM # 3 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 1400
 Voltage: 12
 BCI Group Number: 8D
 Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 1425
 Reserve Capacity: 220 AH
 Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 months
 Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
 Product Code Number: SLI8DAFT

✓ **ITEM # 4 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 650
 Voltage: 12
 BCI Group Number: 24
 Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 650

Reserve Capacity: 58 AH

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra

Product Code Number: SLI 24

SECTION I - AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES (CONT'D)

✓ ITEM # 5 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 650

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 24F

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 650

Reserve Capacity: 58 AH

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra

Product Code Number: SLI 24F

✓ ITEM # 6 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 540

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 26

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 540

Reserve Capacity: 40 AH

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra

Product Code Number: SLI 26

✓ ITEM # 7 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 710

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 27

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 710

Reserve Capacity: 60 AH

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra

Product Code Number: SLI 27

✓ ITEM # 8 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 710
 Voltage: 12
 BCI Group Number: 27F
 Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 710
 Reserve Capacity: 60 AH
 Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months
 Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
 Product Code Number: SLI 27F

SECTION I – AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES (CONT'D)

✓ ITEM # 9 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 650
 Voltage: 12
 BCI Group Number: 30H
 Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 760
 Reserve Capacity: 85 AH
 Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 18 months
 Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
 Product Code Number: SLI 31B

✓ ITEM # 10 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 950
 Voltage: 12
 BCI Group Number: 31
 Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 950
 Reserve Capacity: 88 AH
 Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 18 months
 Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
 Product Code Number: SLI 31SA

✓ ITEM # 11 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 950
 Voltage: 12
 BCI Group Number: 31P
 Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 950
 Reserve Capacity: 88 AH
 Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 18 months
 Manufacturer and Brand Name: Dura cell Ultra
 Product Code Number: SLI 31P

✓ **ITEM # 12 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 800
 Voltage: 12
 BCI Group Number: 34
 Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 800
 Reserve Capacity: 58 AH
 Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 36 months
 Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
 Product Code Number: SLI 34M

SECTION I - AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES (CONT'D)

✓ **ITEM # 13 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 650
 Voltage: 12
 BCI Group Number: 41
 Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 650
 Reserve Capacity: 50 AH
 Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months
 Manufacturer and Brand Name: Magna Power
 Product Code Number: SLI 41

✓ **ITEM # 14 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 600
 Voltage: 12
 BCI Group Number: 47
 Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 650
 Reserve Capacity: 60 AH

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 36 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
Product Code Number: SLI 47 H5M

✓ **ITEM # 15 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 680
Voltage: 12
BCI Group Number: 48
Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 680
Reserve Capacity: 70 AH
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
Product Code Number: SLI 48 H6

✓ **ITEM # 16 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 900
Voltage: 12
BCI Group Number: 49
Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 900
Reserve Capacity: 100 AH
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 36 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
Product Code Number: SLI 49 H8M

SECTION I - AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES (CONT'D)

✓ **ITEM # 17 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 500
Voltage: 12
BCI Group Number: 58
Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 586
Reserve Capacity: 43 AH
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
Product Code Number: SLI 58

✓ **ITEM # 18 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 580
Voltage: 12
BCI Group Number: 58R
Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 580
Reserve Capacity: 43 AH
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
Product Code Number: SLI 58R

✓ ITEM # 19 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 850
Voltage: 12
BCI Group Number: 65
Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 850
Reserve Capacity: 75 AH
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
Product Code Number: SLI 65M

✓ ITEM # 20 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 650
Voltage: 12
BCI Group Number: 75
Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 650
Reserve Capacity: 45 AH
Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months
Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
Product Code Number: SLI 75

SECTION I – AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES (CONT'D)

✓ ITEM # 21 - Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 525
Voltage: 12
BCI Group Number: 75/86 (Dual Terminal)
Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 650
 Reserve Capacity: 45 AH
 Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months
 Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
 Product Code Number: SLI 75ADT

✓ ITEM # 22 – Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 690 / (CA) 820
 Voltage: 12
 BCI Group Number: 78
 Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 690
 Reserve Capacity: 55 AH
 Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months
 Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
 Product Code Number: SLI 78

✓ ITEM # 23 – Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 765
 Cranking Amp: 910
 Voltage: 12
 BCI Group Number 94R
 Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 790
 Reserve Capacity: 70 AH
 Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 36 months
 Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
 Product Code Number: SLI 94RH7M

✓ ITEM # 24 – Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 590
 Voltage: 12
 BCI Group Number: 96R
 Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 600
 Reserve Capacity: 45 AH
 Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 24 months
 Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra
 Product Code Number: SLI 96R

SECTION I – AUTOMOTIVE BATTERIES (CONT'D)

✓ ITEM # 25 – Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 760

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: AGM48

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 760

Reserve Capacity: 70 AH

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 48 months

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra

Product Code Number: SLI48AGM

✓ ITEM # 26 – Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 850

Voltage: 12

Reserve Capacity: 150

BCI Group Number: AGM94R

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 880

Reserve Capacity: 80 AH

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 36 months

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Optima

Product Code Number: OPT7094-194

✓ ITEM # 27 – Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 800

Voltage: 12

Reserve Capacity: 140

BCI Group Number: H7 AGM

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 800

Reserve Capacity: 80 AH

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 48 months

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra

Product Code Number: SLI94RAGM

✓ ITEM # 28 – Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 700

Voltage: 12

Reserve Capacity: 100

BCI Group Number: 91

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 24 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 700

Reserve Capacity: 50 AH

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 36 months

Manufacturer and Brand Name: Duracell Ultra

Product Code Number: SLI 91 TEM

[EAST COAST BATTERY OF NJ, LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments
20	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 75 As Specified	10	EA	\$85.00	\$850.00		
21	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 75/86 (Dual Terminal) As Specified	5	EA	\$85.00	\$425.00		
22	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 78 As Specified	10	EA	\$120.00	\$1,200.00		
23	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 94R As Specified	15	EA	\$115.00	\$1,725.00		
24	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 96R As Specified	35	EA	\$119.00	\$4,165.00		
25	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: AGM48 As Specified	30	EA	\$184.00	\$5,520.00		
26	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: AGM 94R-850 As Specified	30	EA	\$184.00	\$5,520.00		
27	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: H7 AGM As Specified	5	EA	\$184.00	\$920.00		
28	Automotive and Heavy Duty Equipment Batteries BCI Group Number: 91, Amp Hour: 240 AH, 700 CCA, Cranking Amperage: 860 A, Manufacturer Part Number: 691MF, As Specified	5	EA	\$161.00	\$805.00		
29	Trade-In Allowance for Section I (DEDUCT) As Specified, the Trade-In Allowance shall be the price the vendor pays the County for each core. The core price MUST be included in the price of the battery.	750	EA	-\$5.00	-\$3,750.00		
TOTAL					\$90,710.00		

SECTION II - SPECIALTY BATTERIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments
✓ 30	Golf Cart Batteries BCI Group Number: 570 MF As Specified	10	EA	\$75.00	\$750.00		

[EAST COAST BATTERY OF NJ, LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
 Bid No. TBD
 BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments
✓ 31	Golf Cart Batteries BCI Group Number: GC12 As Specified	5	EA	\$210.00	\$1,050.00		
✓ 32	Golf Cart Batteries BCI Group Number: GC8 As Specified	5	EA	\$150.00	\$750.00		
✓ 33	Golf Cart Batteries BCI Group Number: GC2 As Specified	5	EA	\$140.00	\$700.00		
✓ 34	Lawn Mower Batteries BCI Group Number: U1L As Specified	10	EA	\$35.00	\$350.00		
✓ 35	Military Batteries BCI Group Number: 6TL As Specified	5	EA	\$180.00	\$900.00		
✓ 36	Auxiliary Battery BCI Group Number: 400 Amp Hour: 12AH, 200 CCA, Cranking Amperage: 250 A, Manufacturer Part Number: AUX14, As Specified	5	EA	\$90.00	\$450.00		
✓ 37	Trade-In Allowance for Section II (DEDUCT) As Specified, the Trade-In Allowance shall be the price the vendor pays the County for each core. The core price MUST be included in the price of the battery.	20	EA	-\$5.00	-\$100.00		
TOTAL					\$4,850.00		

SECTION III - DEEP CYCLE BATTERIES

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments
✓ 38	Deep Cycle Batteries BCI Group Number: 24 As Specified	20	EA	\$90.00	\$1,800.00		
✓ 39	Deep Cycle Batteries BCI Group Number: 31 As Specified	50	EA	\$120.00	\$6,000.00		
✓ 40	Trade-In Allowance for Section III (DEDUCT) As Specified, the Trade-In Allowance shall be the price the vendor pays the County for each core. The core price MUST be included in the price of the battery.	75	EA	-\$5.00	-\$375.00		
TOTAL					\$7,425.00		

SECTION IV - VOTING MACHINE BATTERIES

[EAST COAST BATTERY OF NJ, LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT

Line Item	Description	Quantity	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Total Cost	No Bid	Comments
41	Voting Machine Batteries As Specified (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)	200	EA	\$64.00	\$12,800.00		
42	Trade-In Allowance for Section IV (DEDUCT) As Specified, the Trade-In Allowance shall be the price the vendor pays the County for each core. The core price MUST be included in the price of the battery.	200	EA	-\$2.00	-\$400.00		
TOTAL					\$12,400.00		

SECTION II – SPECIALTY BATTERIES

✓ITEM # 30 – Golf Cart Batteries

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 525 / (CA) 665

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: 570 MF

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 24 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 525

Reserve Capacity: 85

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 6 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: CLARIOS / INTERSTATE

Product Code Number: SP-70

✓ITEM # 31 – Golf Cart Batteries

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: GC12

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 24 Months

Reserve Capacity: 280

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: TROJAN / INTERSTATE

Product Code Number: GC12-HCL-UTL

✓ITEM # 32 – Golf Cart Batteries

Voltage: 8

BCI Group Number: GC8

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 24 Months

Reserve Capacity: 295

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: TROJAN / INTERSTATE

Product Code Number: GC8-HCL

✓ITEM # 33 – Golf Cart Batteries

Voltage: 6

BCI Group Number: GC2

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 24 Months

Reserve Capacity: 447

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: TROJAN / INTERSTATE

Product Code Number: GC2-ECL-UTL

Introduced on: October 1, 2024
Adopted on: October 1, 2024
Official Resolution#: 2024001474

SECTION II – SPECIALTY BATTERIES

✓ **ITEM # 34 – Lawn Mower Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 200

Voltage: 12

BCI Group Number: U1L

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 250

Reserve Capacity: 24

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 6 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: STRYTEN / INTERSTATE

Product Code Number: SP-30

✓ **ITEM # 35 – Military Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 750

Voltage: 12

BCI Group: 6TL

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 825

Reserve Capacity: 215

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 6 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: TROJAN / INTERSTATE

Product Code Number: 6TL

✓ **ITEM # 36 – Auxiliary Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps (CCA): 200

Voltage: 12

Reserve Capacity: 18

BCI Group: 400

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 Months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 220

Reserve Capacity: 20

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: CLARIOS / INTERSTATE

Product Code Number: MFX-AUX14

SECTION III – DEEP CYCLE BATTERIES

✓ **ITEM # 38 – Deep Cycle Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps: 400

Voltage 12

BCI Group Number 24

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 405

Reserve Capacity: 100

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: CLARIOS / INTERSTATE

Product Code Number: HD24-DP

✓ **ITEM # 39 – Deep Cycle Batteries**

Minimum Cold Cranking Amps: Minimum of 800

Voltage 12

BCI Group: 31

Battery Warranty Month of Service: 12 months

Cold Cranking Amps (CCA) @ 0° of the battery being proposed: 845

Reserve Capacity: 210 *Reserve Capacity: must be over 200*

Warranty Period for 100% Full Replacement @ No Additional Cost: 12 MONTHS

Manufacturer and Brand Name: CLARIOS / INTERSTATE

Product Code Number: SRM-31

BATTERIES FOR VARIOUS EQUIPMENT – SCOPE OF WORK - SECTION IV

SECTION IV – VOTING MACHINE BATTERIES**✓ ITEM # 41 – Voting Machine Batteries, East Penn MU-1 SLD G (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)**

Valve-Regulated, Gelled-Electrolyte Battery	
Nominal Voltage (V)	12V
Capacity at C/100	36 Ah
Capacity at C/20	31.6 Ah
Capacity at C/5	26.8 Ah
Weight	23 lbs. (10.5 kg)
Plate Alloy	Lead Calcium
Posts	Forged Terminals & Bushings
Container/Cover	Polypropylene
Operating Temperature Range	-76°F (-60°C) - 140°F (60°C)
Charge Voltage @ 77°F (25°C)	
Cycle	13.8 – 14.6 volts
Float	13.4 – 13.6 volts
Vent	Self-sealing
Electrolyte	Sulfuric acid thixotropic gel
Terminal	Y (T873)

DIMENSIONS

Length	7.71 inches
Width	5.18 inches
Height	7.22 inches

Warranty: 1 yr. full replacement

✓ ITEM # 42 – Trade-In Allowance for Section IV (DEDUCT)

The Trade-In Allowance shall be the price the vendor pays the County for each core. The core price MUST be included in the price of the battery. (FIXED PRICE)