Res-Pg:j.1-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey
Director Joseph H. Vicari

08754-2191
Deputy Director Gary Quinn (732)929-2005
Commissioner Barbara Jo Crea (732)505-1918
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Commissioner John P. Kelly
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: November 15, 2023 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL
EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES to Guaranteed Products, Inc. dba The Photo Center and Unique Photo, the
lowest qualified bidders. No bids were received on Item Nos. 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 21, 22, 23, 29, 31, 32, 42,
43,44, 47,49, 52, 53,56, 57,59,72,73,75,76, 77,91, 92, 93, 94, 101 and 102. Recommendation is made
to reject Item Nos. 87, 88, 89, 90, 103, 104, 105 and 106 as unresponsive. All no bid and rejected items will be
rebid. (B2023-177)

Official Resolution# (2023001615

Meeting Date 11/15/2023

Introduced Date 11/15/2023

Adopted Date 11/15/2023

Agenda ltem -1

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2023-177

Result Adopted
A
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Vicari v v

Quinn v

Crea v v |v

Haines v

Kelly v v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michotie \. Gurstnor”

Clerk Of The Board



Res-Pg:j.1-2

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
PAPERS, DOGUMENTS, INVQIGES, VOUCHERS

RESOLUTION

November 15, 2023

WHEREAS, on September 26, 2023, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO
AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES, County of Ocean, State of New Jersey; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Guaranteed Products, Inc. dba Unique Photo

The Photo Center 123 Route 46

1930 Route 88 Fairfield, NJ 07004

Brick, NJ 08724 (973) 216-9421

(908) 216-3971

Toshiba Business Solutions, a division of
Toshiba America

319 Commerce Court, Ste. 108
Pottstown, PA 19464

(610) 539-1456
;and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bid, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely that of GUARANTEED PRODUCTS,
INC. DBA THE PHOTO CENTER and UNIQUE PHOTO.

No bids were received on Item Nos. 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 21, 22, 23, 29, 31,
32, 42, 43, 44, 47, 49, 52, 53, 56, 57, 59, 72, 73, 75, 76, 77, 91, 92, 93, 94, 101 and 102,
Recommendation is made to reject items 87, 88, 89, 90, 103, 104, 105 and 106 as they were
unresponsive. All no bid and rejected items will be rebid.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY QF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authotized and directed to
entet into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of Photographic, Audio and Visual
Equipment and Suppiies for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award
through November 14, 2024, a period of one (1) year or until delivery is complete unless
otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to
N.ES.AL40A:11-15.

Introduced on: November 15, 2023
Adopted on: November 15, 2023
Official Resolufipn#: 2023001615




BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 NOVEMBERRes Xg3j.1-3

A, GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC. DBA THE PHOTQ CENTER for

twenty six (26) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1, 4, 5, 8, 30, 33, 34, 38, 39, 40, 41, 45, 46, 48, 50, 51, 54, 55, 58, 60, 63, 64, 65,
66, 68 and 69,

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

B. UNIQUE PHOTOQ, INC. for forty (40) items, to wit;
ITEM NOS. 2,3,6,7,15,16, 17, 18,19, 20, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 35, 36, 37, 61, 62, 67,70, 71,
74,78, 79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 95, 96, 97, 98, 99, 100 and 107.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants.

2. Payments for the equipment and supplies to be acquired by this contract shall
be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance
with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations
and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and
vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2023-177.

4. Be it further resolved that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made
available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance, Sheriff’s
Office and the successful bidders.

Introduced on| November 15, 2023
Adopted on: November 15, 2023
Official Resolution#: 2023001615
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GUARANTEED PRODUCTS, INC. DBA THE PHOTO CENTER
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

3 Batteries, 10 E4 $£14.99 $149.59G eneloop 8847
Rechargeabla Ans
i 4 Batteries, 5 £a SEE.0D $250.00 promaster | 1207
Rechargeanle for

/\ 5 Battery Charger, 15 A $23.99 $449.85 eneloap 2064

PHOTQGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

If providing a product other than the items specified, please provide product information. Upload any attachments to the Vendor
Questionnaire under "Additional Vendor Documentation”

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Mo Bid Manufacturer  Product Name  Delivery, AR, Camments

{Fequired) andfar No.
[Required)

SECTICH |- BATTERIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

1 Battery, Canon LP- 2 EA $32.00 $64.00 promaster 9456
E10
Z Batterigs, 35 = $14 99 S524.65 enelcop 86

Rechargeable, Af,
Ni-#H, 2500 mzh

Canori EQS 70 and
S0 #ark [ and Bl
Camera, LP-E5H

Promaster AA
#4165

[ Eattery Charger, s EA $72.00 S360.00 canon lces
Canan LT-FG, for
LP-£G Li-on

7 Battery Charger, 5 EA $64.00 S320.00 canon le-e10
Canon Charger LC-
E1G

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - PHOTGGRAPHIC, AUDIC AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPUES
Page &

2023

November 15,

Introduced on:
Adopted on:

November 15, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023001615
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Res-Pg

GUARANTEED PRODUCTS, INC. DBA THE PHOTO CENTER
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIC AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line [tem Cescription Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Mo Bid Manufacturer  Product Mame  Delivery, ARQ. Comments

{Required} andfor Mo,
{Required}

Battery Charger,
Nikon Qurick
Charger IMH-25

g Battery Charger, Ta No Bid No Bid %
Watson §-Bay

Rapid Charger for
Al ABANIMH or
MiCd Rechargeable
Batteries

SECTION [1- AUDIC & VIDEG SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

10 [Disc, Compact, PALZK
Imitaticn Brand
CO-RW, 25/pack

Cisc, Compect,
Seny COR Msdia,
TO0MH, S0foack

Cisc, Mini, No Bid
Compact,
Recordable,
156ME, for Mavica
MCR-1564,
S0fpack

Disc, #ini Sony
DWD-R, 30 min.,
1.4 GB

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIC AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page 7

November 15, 2023
November 15

Introduced on:
Adopted on:

, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023001615
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Res-Pg

GUARANTEED PRODUCTS, INC. DBA THE PHOTO CENTER
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Itermn Descriptian Quantity f Measura Unit Cost Total Cost MNa Bid Manufacturer

Product Names  Delivery, AR.0. Cammenis
{Required} andfor No.
{Required)

29 MP3 Flayer, EA No Bid No Bid X
SanDisk Clip lzm, &
G8, SanDisk, or
Equal

30 Moise Canceli ng 3 EA 355.00 $177.00 sony midrzx110nc
Headphcnes, Sony
Wodel

WIORNCT/MORMCE

31 Philips LFH334 EA Na Bid No Bid %
Headset, or equal

32 Philips LFH338 SET Mo Bid No Bid ¥
Replacement
Headset Pads, 7
pads/set

SECTION Il - PHOTOGRAPHIC PAPER AMD FILM - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

33 Photo Paper, 8 5 PACK 531.00 S155.00 ho croda
1/2"% 11" HP
HUREG4A, Gloss
Finish, 5C
SheetsfPack

34 Cancn 15 EA $94.50 $1,482 .50 promaster 3351
Heavyweight
tatte Coated
Paper for Inkjet -
36" wide Roll -
10C" Long

W
i

FujiFilm 8x213 15 EA $74.55 $1.124.25 promaster 9554
OX100 Inkiet Paper
Glossy for
Frontier-5 DX16G
Printer

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIC AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page 10

November 15, 2023
November 15, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023001615

Introduced on:
Adopted on:
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Res-Pg

GUARANTEED PRODUCTS, INC. DBA THE PHOTO CENTER

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REFPORT

Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line ltem

Description

FujiFilm 5x213
DX100 Inkjet Paper
Glossy for
Frontier-5 DX100
Printer

Quantity

15

Unit of Measure

Unit Cast

£54.95

Total Cost.

582425

Marnufacturer

{Required)

promaster

Product Name
andfor Mo.
{Reguired]

9540

Delivery, &.R.O.

Comments

37

FujiFilm 6x213
E9{1G0 Inkjet Paper
Glossy for
Frontier-5 DX1G0
Printer

15

EA

$54.95

$824.25

profasier

3547

SECTION IV - CAMERAS, CAMUORDERS & ACCESSORIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS

SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

38

Camera, Canon
EDS 50 Mark (11, As
Specified, or Equal

4

EA

$2,398.00

$9,592.00

LaEnan

1483002

39

Camera, Canon
ECS 505 R DSLR,
As Specified, or
Egual

i
b

33458.00

$10.494.00

LaENan

4147c002

40

Carmera, Canon
EO5 70 Mark I, As
Specified, or Equal

EA

$1,198.00

$3,594.00

canon

3616c002

41

~ NSNS

Camera, Cancn
PowerShot G7x
pdark [l

$520.00

51.860.00

canon

1066c001

42

Camera, Canan
£05 8O0 DSLR
gundle, As
Specified, or Eguzl

EA

No Bid

Na Bid

43

Camerz, Niken
3500

No Bid

No Bid

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT BEPORT

Bid - PHOTOGRAFHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Page 11

November 15, 2023
November 15, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023001615

Introduced on:
Adopted on:
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GUARANTEED PRODUCTS, INC. DBA THE PHOTO CENTER
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line ltem Descripticn Qusntity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Ne Bid IManufacturer Praduct Name ry, A.R.O. Comments

[Required) and/cr No.
{Required)

44 Camera, Nikon EA No Bid No Bid X
C710G
45 Camera, Mikon 20 E $895.00 $17,820.00 nikon 1634
/\ 7500 DSLR

{Camera, Body Cnly

5000 AF
Speedlight Flash,
R[5
SUBSTITUTIGHS

/\ 45 Flash - Hiken SB- 15 A 5365,00 $8.450.00 nikon 4815

a7 Miken 5G - 31R E& No Bid No Bid X
Reglacement
Panel for Built-in
Flash

./\ 18 Mikon MC-DC2Z 15 EA $1350 S292.50 promaster 1857
Remote Release

Cord

45 Bolt ¥m-160 LED E& No Bid No Bid )4
kAacre Ring Light

PRCPGSAL DOCUMENT REPGRT
Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AMND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page 12

November 15, 2023
November 15, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023001615

Introduced on:
Adopted on:



GUARANTEED PRODUCTS, INC. DBA THE PHOTO CENTER
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

A1-9

j

Res-Pg

Lire ftem Description Quantity Unit of Measure unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer  Product Name  Delivery, AR.O. Camments

[Required) andfor MNo.
{Required)

Professional HEX
Circular Polerizing
Filter, 62 mm with

"REPELLARM &X" ,
Flement Resistant
_
1
|
_

/\ 50 Promaster 15 A $74.88 $1,123.2C 8837

Ceating; repels
maisture,
fingerprints, dust,
dirt, and grime.
Uhtra hardened
aptical glass resists
surface scratching
and stands up to
heavy-duty use.

wn
R

Promaster 15 EA $83.75 $1,256.25 promaster 6844
Professional HGX

/\ Circular Polarizing
Filter, B7mm with
“"REPELLAMAN
Elermeant Besistant
Caating; repels
moisture,
fingergrints, dust,
dirt, 2nd grime.
Ultra hardened
optical giass resists
surface scratching
znd stands up ta
heavy-duty use.

B2 Filter, Hoya 62mm EA No Bid No Bid X
HD UV, Mfg#
XHDBZUY

November 15, 2023
November 15, 2023

53 Filter, Hova 67mm EA No Bid Ne Bid 4
HD UY, Mg #
XHDB7UY

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIC AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page 13

Official Resolution#: 2023001615

Introduced on:
Adopted on:
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Res-Pg

GUARANTEED PRODUCTS, INC. DBA THE PHOTO CENTER
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Filter, Tiffen 62mm 15 5585,00 tiffen
COrange
/\ 55 Filter, Tiffen 62mm 15 EA $39.00 $585.00 tiffen 52125
Red
56 Filter, Tiffen 62mm EA No Bid No Bid X
Skylight/Uv
57 Filter, Tiffen 62mm Ea No Bid Na Bid X
Yellow
&8 Filter, Tiffen 67 15 EA 54400 SH60.00 tiffen B7or2l
man Orange
59 Filter, Tiffer 67mm Ea No Bid Ma Bid X
13373
[518] Camera Bag, 14" L 10 EA S175.00 S1,750.00 wraith wraith2d
/\ x 7" W x11"D, As

l\ £3 tens, Canon EF 24- 2 EA $1,245.00 $2,498.00 canan 1380c002

{ine [temn Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cast Manufacturer Product Mame  Delivery, AR.D. Comments
{Required) andfor No.
[Required)

Specified or Equal

&1 Backpack, Think g EA s180.08 2200.00 thinkdtank 720475
Tank Phota Strest
walker Pro ¥2.0,
Black

57 Lens, Canon EF 16-
25mm FLELT
USkM

[

EA $2,145.00 54,250.00 Canon 0573002

105mm f/aList
UsSM with a Canon
kount, Mgf #
13800002

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - PHOTGGRAPHIC, AUDIO AMD VISUAL FQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page 14

November 15, 2023

Introduced on:
Adopted on:

November 15, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023001615
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GUARANTEIED PRODUCTS, INC. DBA THE PHOT® CENTER

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line [tern

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cast

fanufacturer

{Reguired}

Product Nams
andfor Ho.

Delivery, A R.0. Coammenis

I\ &4

Lens, Canon EF 70-
200mm: F2.8LIs
LSk, tafg #
25654004

EA

51,449.00

52,898.00

sigma

{Required}
Re0as4

Vi

Lens - Canon - 70-
200mm - Canon
mount

EA

$1,449.00

45,796.00

sigma

580954

Vi

Lens, Canan EF
100-40Cmm f/4.5-
5.BLIS I LS, rMig
# 9524800244

$2,350.00

$11,750.00

Canon

S524boo?aa

67

Lens, Mikon AF-S
D¥ 18-140k0A
Lens, f/3.5-5.6G
EC YR Lens

is

$598.00

58,970.00

rikon

20104

/\ 63

Lens, Mikon AF-P
UA MIKKOR 18-
55mm f/3.5-5.6G
YR Lens

20

E&

5189.95

$3,799.00

nikori

20060

/\ 63

Lans, Mikan AF
Micro Mikkor
E0mm 1:2: 80

15

Ea

38,500.00

N

20103

Lens, Kikor 70-
300mm

EA

$1,725.00

niken

061

Remote, Mikon
Wireless Bemote
Control kL -1

EA

Mo Bid

No Bid

November 15, 2023

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIC AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page 15

Introduced on:
Adopted on:

November 15, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023001615
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Res-Pg

UNIQUE PHOTO

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIC AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
If providing a product other than the items specified, please provide product information. Upload any attachments to the Vendor
Questionnaire under "Additional Vendor Documentation”
Line Item Description Cuantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Mo Bid Manufacturer  Praduct Name  Delivery, A RO, Comments
{Required}) andfor No.
{Reguired)
SECTION I - BATTERIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL
1 Esttery, Canon LP- 2 EA 542,00 S8R.00
E10
2 Batteries, 5 E& 55.50 $192.50
Rechargeahle, Ad,
Mi-MH, 2500 mah
i\ 3 Batteries, 10 EA 5450 $45.00
Rechargeakble 484
4 Batteries, £ EA 573.00 $390.00
Rechargeable for
Carcn EOS 7D znd
50 Mark [l and 1l
Camera, LP-E&GM
5 Battery Charger, EA Nao Bid No Bid x
Promaster A4
#4155
/\ 6 Battery Charger, 5 EA S57.00 S3285.00
Cancn LC-ES, for
LP-EB Li-ign
l\ 7 Battery Charger, s Ea 347 00 $210.00 .
Canon Chargar LC-
E1Q *

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPGRT
Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL FEGUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Page &

2023

November 15,

Introduced on:
Adopted on:

November 15, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023001615
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Res-Pg

UNIQUE PHOTO
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measura Unit Cost Fotal Cost N Bid Manufacturer  Product Mame  Delivery, AR.D,

comments
{Required} and/or No.

AA A A S X

14

WD-R Archival
Gold, Write Once
Recordable DVD,
4. 7GE starage
capacity, up to 8%
write speed,
10/pack

PACK

No Bid

No Bid

[Required}

15

Flash Drive, San
Cisk Cruzer Giide
USB 2.0, & GB

EA

58,25

$41.25

TRAMSCEND

GHND3E14

1s

Flash Drive, San
Disk Cruzer Glide
JSB 2.0, 16 B

EA

54955

TRANSCENMED

GMND2962

i7

Flash Drive, San
Oisk Cruzer, 32GB,
UsB

[¥al

EA

$10.25

$31.25

TRANSCEND

GND3612

18

Flash Drive, San
Disk Cruzer Glide
UZB 2.0, 64 GB

45

EA

$10.49

S$472.05

TRANSCEND

GND29e7

15

Flash Drive, San
Disk £xtreme USE
3.0, 16 GB

25

EA

5999

£243 75

TRANSCEND

GHDZ23562

20

Flash Drive, San
Disk Extrerne USE
3.0, 64 GB

15

EA

$10.49

815735

TRANSCEND

GHD2967

fd
=

Hard Dtive,
Portable, Macle]
H#3DSSDEST, 1TB,
San Gisk, or Equal

No Bid

No Bid

PROFPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid - PHOTCGGRAPHIC, AUDIC AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Page 8

November 15, 2023

Introduced on:
Adopted on:

November 15, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023001615




UNIQUE PHOTO
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line 'tem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Tatal Cost Manufacturer  Product MName  Dslivery, ARG Comments

{Required] andfor No.
{Reguired)

22 tMemory Card, 1 i E& No Bid Na Bid X
GB 50 for Canen
Powsershot A550

2z Memaory Card, £4 No Bid Neo 8id X
Prormaster
Prafessional Hi-
Speed Compact
Flash Memary
Card 4GB #8470

24 Mamory Card, & 75 E& 58,49 $636.75 TRAMSCEND GND2201
5B Sandisk Secure
Disk

75 IMemory Card, 5 EA 5769 $39.35 TRANSCEND GNDZ5%4
SanDisk Extreme

PLUS SOHC UHS-1 g
Card, 15 GB :

Sanbisk Extreme
FLUS 5CHEC UHS-1
Card, 64 GB

A temory Card, 20 A $71.35 $1,425.00 TRAMNSCEND GND1Z28%
Sanlisk Extremea
Campact Flash
Memary Card, 128
GB

22 temory Card, 20 EA $34.50 51,035.00
SanDisk Exireme
Compact Flash
temary Card, 32
G

/\ 26 Memery Card, 30 EA 31049 $314.70 TRANSCEND GND2398

PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REFORT
Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIC AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
Fage 9

November 15, 2023
November 15, 2023

Official Resolution#: 2023001615

Introduced on:
Adopted on:



UNIQUT PHOTO

:1.0 PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

~  BidNo. TBD

5  PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
o

)

Q

o

Linie Ttem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Taotal Cost M Bid Marnufacturer  Product Nama  Delivery, ARQ. Camments

{Reqguired} andfor Mo.
{Reguired}

29 P32 Player, EA No Bid N Bid x
SanDisk Clip lam, 8
GE, SanDisk, or
Equal

EXY Moise Canceling EA No Bid No Bid X f
Headphones, Sory |
radel "
MORHCTZ/MORMCE 7

21 Philips LFH334 EA No Bid No Bid X

Replacement
Hezdset Fads, 2
pads/set

SECTICON LI~ PHOTOGRAFHIC PAPER AND FILM - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

33 Photo Papger, 8 PACK No Bid Na Bid X
1/2"x 11" HP
HCREGAA, Gloss

Fimigh, 50
Sheets/Pack
34 Canon EA No Bid No Bid X “ ™
Heawywaight S8
Matte Caated :Zq, “,
Paper for Inkjet - TTw
36" Wide Roll - g8
I o
100" Long m m 3
33y
35 FujiFilm 8x213 15 EA S68.00 $1,020.00 FUNFILRA B¥213 BX100 1G DAYS ZZaQ
/\ DX100 Inkjet Paper - GLOSSY M
Glossy for k=)
Frontier-5 DX10G = 5
Printer o = w
goo
S35
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPGRT K w_..m
Bid - PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIC AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES M M W

Page 10

Headset, ar equal
32 Philips LFH334 SET No Bid No 8id X
_
!
i
|
!
A
_
i
_
|
“



UNIQUE PHOTO

(=]
= PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REFPORT
= Bid No. TBD ;
" —
o)) PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIOC AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
o
1
(73]
[}
(14
ting [tem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cast Mo Bid Manufacturer  Product Name  Dalivery, AR.O. Comments
{Required) andfer No.
{Required]
3G Fujiriim 5x213 15 EA 542.00 564500 FUTIFHLRA 5XZ213 DX100 10 DAYS
,I\ X100 Inkjet Paper GLOSSY

Glossy for

Frontier-5 DX100

Printer

37 FujiFilm 6x213 15 Ea $49.00 $735.00 FUHFILM 6X212 D100 10 DAYS
l\ C¥100 Inkjet Paper s GLOSSY

Glossy for

Frantier-5 GA10G

Frinter

SECTION I¥ - CAMERAS, CAMCUORDERS & AUCESSORIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

3g Camers, Canon EA No Bid No Bid x
EOS 5D Mark [1I, As
Specified, or Equal

39 Camera, C2non
EQS 505 R DSLR,
As Specified, or
Equz!

m
=]

Na Bid No Bid X

qac Camera, Canon EA N Bid No 8id X
£0S 70 Mark !, As
Specified, or Equal

41 Camera, Canan EA ] No Bid Mo Bid X
PowerShot G7x
FAark Il

42 Camera, Canon Ea Na Bid No Bid X
F{5 8500 DSLR
Bundle, &5
Specified, or Equal

43 Camera, Mikon Ea No Big Na 8id k4
D3EG0
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. UNIQUE PHOTO
- PROPGSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

—
o PHOTOGRAPRIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EGUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
o
1
(]
[V}
(14
Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost tal Cost No Bid Manufacturer  Product Name  Delivery, AR.O. Comments
{Required} andior No.
{Requirad}
54 Fitter, Tiffen 62rmm Ea No Bid Ne Bid X
Crange
55 Filter, Tiffen G2Zrmm EA Ne Bid No Bid X
Red
56 Filter, Tiffen 62mm E& No Bid N Bid X
Skylight/Uv
57 Filter, Tiffen 62mm EA No Bid No Bid %
Yellow
58 Filter, Tiffen &7 EA No Bid No Bid X
M Orange
59 Filter, Tiffen 67mm 2 No Bid No Bid X
[91%
&0 Camera Bag, 14" L A No Bid Ng Bid X
7" W 11", Ais
specified or Equat
&l Backpack, Think 5 EA 5181.00 $E05.G0 THINK TANK STREET WALKER | 10 DAYS
Tank Phota Street PRO V2.0
Walker Fro W20,
Black
./\ 52 Lens, Canarn EF 16- 2 E& 51,988.00 $3,972.00 CANDN EF 15-35 FZ.E 111 |10 DAYS
35mm FZ3L1
USkA
63 Leris, Canom EF 24- 2 EA 51,290.00 $2,580.00 CANDH 24-105 FAL IS {10 DAYS )
105mm f/aL sl
USH with a Canar
rMaunt, Maf &
1380002
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UNIQUE PHOTO
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid Ma. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

1-18

j

Res-Pg

Line item Descriotion Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost i Menufacturer  Product Mame  Delivery, ARC. Comments

{Required] andfor N,
{Required}

G4 Lens, Canon EF 70 EA No Bid No Bid x
200mm f2.8L15 1
Ush, mfg &
25698004

65 Lens - Canon - 70- 4 Ea $1,495.00 35,980.00 CANON FO200 F4LIST |10 DAYS
200mem - Canon
mount

ES Lens, Zanon EF Ea No Bid No Bid ¥
180-400mm /4.5~
5.6LISH UsSH, mig
#G534B0C2AA

D¥ 18-140004 140F3.5-5.6
Lens, f/3.5-5.66
EDVE Lens

/\ &7 | Lens, Nikon AF-3 15 Ea S47R.E0 5719250 NIKON AF-7 DX 18- 10 DaYs

m
ped

65 Lens, Miken AF-P 20 323900 S4,780.00 MIKON AFP 18-55 F3.5- |10 DAYS
CX HIKKOR 18- 5.6G
55mm {/3.5-5.60
¥R Lens

69 Lens, Mikon AF EA NoBid No Bid b4
Ficra Kikkor
e0mm 1:2:8 0

f\ 70 Lens, Mikon 70- 5 EA $341.00 $1,705.00 NIKON 70-3.00 F4.5-6.3 | 10 DAYS
F00mm

1\ 71 Remote, Miken 1D Ea $16.95 5169.50 IMIKON MIL-L13
Wireless Remote WIRELESS
Controt ML -L REMOTE
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UNIQUE PHOTO
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

1-19

j

Res-Pg

Line Item Cescrigtion Quantity Lnit of Msasure Unit Cost Total Cost Mo Bid Manufzcturer Praduct Name  Delivery, ARQ,

Comments
{Required] andfar Mo,
{Required}

72 Tripod, Manfrotto Ea Mo Bid No Bid A
186, Aluminum 4
Section
KMI190XPRC4-BH

73 Tripod, Manfrottc A Na Bid N Bid X
MRKZ0XTAZ-
2WUS 290 Xira
Aluminum with
128 8¢ Micre Fluid
Head and Quick
Release

/\ 74 Tripod with Head, 1¢ Ea $185.00 $1,890.00 vanguard pro

Yanguard Alta Pro 263agh/g100
263AGH 3 Section :

Aluminumm Trigod
with GH-100 Pistal
Grip Ball Head

75 Tripod, Manfrottc- EA No Bid Na Bid X
49GRICZ Compact
Balt Head wW/R2

76 Kingston A No Bid Ns Bid X
MMobilelite Plus S0
Card Beader

77 Abundant Supnly Ea No Bid No Bid b4
Company
Unidentified
Flashdrive
Organizer Case
{Black]
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UNIQUE PHOTO
S PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

" — .
o PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES
e
(73]
2
Line [tem Description Quaniity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer Product Nama  Delivery, A.R.Q. Comments
{Required] and/or Ne.
{Required}
78 Peak Design Cuff 15 EA $26.585 5404.2% PEAK DESIGN CUFF CAMERS | 10 DAYS
/\ Camera Wrist WRIST STRAP
Strap [Black), NG BLACK
SUBSTITUTICNS

SECTION ¥ - PHOTG PRINTERS AMD SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

79 Fuisfilm DX100 2 EA $2,248.00 $4,496.00 FUJIFILM DX 100 10 DAYS
Smartlab Frentier- SMARTLAB
S Inkjet Printer PRINTER

20 Fujifilm Waste ink 15 A 34250 $637.50 FUTNFILM WASTE TANK 10 DAYS
Tank for Frontier-S DX100
O£100 Printer

81 Fupifilm 16393045 15 EA S58.00 587000 FUIIFILRA 15293045 10 BAYS
Yellow Ink
Cartridge 200m|
for Fujifilm

Frontier-S UX100

a2 Fujifilm 16393019 15 EA $5B.00 $870.00 FUNIFILM 1639301% 10 DAYS
 Biack Ink Cartridge
200ml far Fujifilm
Frontier-5 DX100

83 Fujifilm 16353069 15 EA $58.00 S870.C0 FUJIFILM 16353069 10 D&YS
Pink ink Cartridge
200ml for Fujifilm
Frentier-5 X100

~NOAL AL AN A

ﬁ B4 Fujifiley 16393021 15 EA 858.00 S870.00 FUIIFILM 15353021 10 DAYS
Cyan Ink Cartridge
200ml for Fujifilm
Frontier-5 OX100
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PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

UNIQUE PHOTO

Res-Pg

iine ltem

Description

Fujifilrm 16333057
Sky Blue Ink 200mi
far Fujifiirm
Frontier-5 DX100

Quantity

Unit of Measure

EA

Unit Cost

358.00

Total Cost

$870.00

Mo Bid

{Reguired]

FUGIFILRA

Marufzcturer

Froduct Name
ardfor No.

{Recuirad]

16393057

Celivery, A RO,

10 DAYS

Comments

85

Fusifilm 163930332
Magenta Ink
Cartridge 200l
for Fujifiim
Frontier-5 DX100

15

EA

$58.00

$870.00

FUJIFILRA

16383033

10 DAYS

g7

Entrust DuraGard
Larninate, 1 mil,
Clear, ltem
H#508785-501, for
use with Datacard
CO-CLM
Laminator/Printer
CLEao, 200
printers per rall

ROLL

No Bid

Na Bid

Entrust DuraGard
Laminate, 0.6 mil,
hola, tem
H50G8808-032, for
use with SLM-CLM
Desktop
Larinater, 350
privts per roll

ROLL

No Bid

No Bid
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UNIQUE PHOTO
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Cuantity Jnit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer Froduct Narme  Delivery, AR.0. Commenis

{Required} andfar Mo,
[Reguired}

a3 Board, Savage, CiN No Bid No Bid x
Pre-Stax Pressure
Sensitive, Light
Waight, 8" x 10"

54 Crescent
Mounting Board-
8" x 10, Single,
White, Self-
Adhesive

oyl
ped

No Bid No Bid X

a5 Carnan Pl - 120 5 E& $84.50 542250 CANCN PFRI-120MAETTE
hatte Black Ink BLK

Cartidge {130ml}

151 Cancn PRl - 120 5 EA 584,50 $4722.50 CANOM PFI-120 BLACK
Bleck Ink Carticlge
{130mlj

97 Cznon PFI-120 0 E& S84.50 $845.00 CANCHN PFI-F120 CYAN
Cyan Ink Cartridge
{130mL} -

a8 Canen PR-12G i0 : EA SB4A.50 3845.00 CANGHN PH-12%

Magenta Ink IMAGENTA
Cartridge (130mLj

SUENULNIEN

%9 Canch PFI-120 10 EA $84.50 $845.00 CANOM PF-120 YELLOW
Yellow (nk
Cartridge {130mL]

L
m
s
L
2

l\ ico Canon 5 £A . $337,50 CANON MC-21
Maintenancs

Cartridge MC-31

I i
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UNIQUE PHOTO
PROPOSAL DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD :
PHOTOGRAFHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Cuantity Unit of Measurs unit Cost Totzl Cost Mo Bid Kanufacturer Product Name  Delivery, ARQ. Comments

{Bequired] andg/or Mo,
{Required]

106 DataCard YMCKT- PKG No Bid No Bid %
KT Colar Rinbon
Kit Cptimized far
use with DataCard
CP/CD Series Card
Frinters

107 Tabte Top Passport 5 EA 388.00 3440.00 UNITUE GNM203
I Pheto Die

Cuceer Punch, 27z
gn
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