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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

08754-2191

(732)929-2005
Commissioner Robert S. Arace (732)505-1918

Director John P. Kelly
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi

Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione

Commissioner Virginia E. Haines

Board Meeting Agenda

Date: June 4, 2025 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICE FOR VARIOUS VEHICLES
UNDER 15,000 GVWR to Able Ford of New Jersey, Inc., dba All American Ford, Subaru and Isuzu; Celebrity
Motors of Toms River; Freehold Ford, Inc.; Houpert Fleet Services LLC; and United Ford LLC, the lowest
qualified bidders. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 1, 2, 3,4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9 and 10 as unresponsive.
They will be rebid. Item No. 17 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2025-66)

Official Resolution# [2025000741
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| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michaite \. Guanor”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on]
Adopted on:
Official Resolu

t

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON A
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

RESOLUTION

June 4, 2025

WHEREAS, on April 1, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefore,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICE FOR
VARIOUS VEHICLES UNDER 15,000 GVWR for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Able Ford of New Jersey, Inc., Celebrity Motors Of Toms River
dba All American Ford, Subaru And Isuzu 360 Route 37 E

3698 Rt. 9 South Toms River, NJ 08753

Old Bridge, NJ 08857 (732) 349-2240

(732) 242-0456

Freehold Ford, Inc. Houpert Fleet Services LLC
3752 Route 9 115 S. Atlantic Avenue
Freehold, NJ 07728 Berlin, NJ 08009

(732) 462-2982 (856) 767-2828

United Ford LLC Jerry’s Auto Body LLC

290 Secaucus Road 456 West Commodore Blvd
Secaucus, NJ 07094 Jackson, NJ 08527

(201) 617-0700 (732) 928-0003

Larson Ford, Inc. Orchard’s Hydraulic Service, Inc.
1150 Ocean Avenue 604 White Horse Pike
Lakewood, NJ 08701 Cologne, NJ 08213

(732) 363-8100 (609) 965-2923

;and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, be accepted, in each instance, namely, ABLE FORD OF NEW JERSEY, INC.,
DBA ALL AMERICAN FORD, SUBARU AND ISUZU; CELEBRITY MOTORS OF
TOMS RIVER; FREEHOLD FORD, INC.; HOUPERT FLEET SERVICES LLC and
UNITED FORD LLC. Recommendation is made to reject Item Nos. 1,2, 3,4,5,6,7,8,9
and 10 as unresponsive. All rejected items will be rebid. Item No. 17 will be rebid to obtain

additional vendors.

June 4, 2025
June 4, 2025

on#: 2025000741
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BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 JUNE 4, 2025

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts, accepting bids for the furnishing and delivery of Repair Service for
Various Vehicles under 15,000 GVWR for the County of Ocean, for the contract period shall
be from July 1, 2025 through June 30, 2027, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise
stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A.
40A:11-15.

A. ABLE FORD OF NEW JERSEY, INC., DBA ALL AMERICAN FORD,
SUBARU AND ISUZU for six (6) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 11,12, 13,14, 15 and 17.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

B. CELEBRITY MOTORS OF TOMS RIVER for six (6) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 11,12,13,14, 15 and 17.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

C. FREEHOLD FORD, INC for six (6) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 11, 12, 13, 14, 15 and 17.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

D. HOUPERT FLEET SERVICES LLC for two (2) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 16 and 17.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

E. UNITED FORD LLC for two (2) items, to wit:
ITEMS NOS. 16 and 17.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Payments for the materials and services to be acquired by these contracts
shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in
accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of
Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase
Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations

and needed quantities shall be indicated.

3. Funds for the equipment shall be available within the following funding

Sources: Vehicle Services O.E.

June 4, 2025
June 4, 2025
bn#: 2025000741
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BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 3 JUNE 4, 2025

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-66.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Purchasing Department, Department of Finance,

Vehicle Services and the successful bidders.

June 4, 2025
June 4, 2025
bn#: 2025000741
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[ABLE FORD OF NEW JERSEY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
REPAIR SERVICE FOR VARIOUS VEHICLES UNDER 15,000 GVWR

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Comments
Measure

10 Dodge Hybrid ' No Bid No Bid X
\// 11 Ford Automobile 90 HR $110.00 $9,900.00
\-/12 Ford Truck/SUV 420 HR $110.00 | $46,200.00
\/ 13 Ford Van 40 HR $110.00 $4,400.00
\‘/ 14 Ford Bus 140 HR $110.00 | $15,400.00

P
L/ 15 Ford Hybrid 30 HR $110.00 $3,300.00
CATEGORY 2: NON-OEM REPAIRS: AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
16 Category 2: Non-OEM Repairs: Automatic Transmission Repair/Replacement HR No Bid No 8id X

DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE (%) ON PARTS

Enter your company's percentage (%) discount from manufacturer's most recent suggested retail price list. This shall be a firm fixed
minimum discount for the term of the contract.

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No 8id
Measure (%)

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN". For bid purposes assume parts at
$72,000.00 for the two (2) year term.

$44,712.00

Introducedon:  June 4, 2025
Adopted gYBE FORDJURNERO2ERSEY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resolutiopi: r2O2RAMIAE0R VARIOUS VEHICLES UNDER 15,000 GVWR
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[CELEBRITY FORD OF TOMS RIVER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
REPAIR SERVICE FOR VARIOUS VEHICLES UNDER 15,000 GVWR

Line Item

Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments

Measure

10 Dodge Hybrid

No Bid No Bid

\// 11 Ford Automobile 90 HR $125.00 | $11,250.00
\// 12 Ford Truck/SUV 4 | 420 HR $125.00 | $52,500.00
\// 13 Ford Van ‘ 40 HR $125.00 | $5,000.00
\4//14 Ford Bus 140 HR $125.00 $17,500.00
\// 15 Ford Hybrid A 30 HR $125.00 $3,750.00

CATEGORY 2: NON-OEM REPAIRS: AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION REPAIR/REPLACEMENT

16 Category 2: Non-OEM Repairs: Automatic Transmission Repair/Replacement HR No Bid No Bid X

DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE (%) ON PARTS

Enter your company's percentage (%) discount from manufacturer's most recent suggested retail price list. This shall be a firm fixed
. minimum discount for the term of the contract.

e

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount No Bid
Measure (%)

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN?". For bid purposes assume parts at $50,400.00
$72,000.00 for the two (2) year term.

Introduced-on: June 4, 2025
AdoptedGHLEBRITY FORT GRIZAMS RIVER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official ResolitioRfi SLRRARY#HR VARIOUS VEHICLES UNDER 15,000 GVWR

Page 7
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[FREEHOLD FORD INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
REPAIR SERVICE FOR VARIOUS VEHICLES UNDER 15,000 GVWR

~ Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments

Measure

10 |Dodge Hybrid - » HR No Bid No Bid X
ou Ford Automobile : 90 HR $125.00 | $11,250.00
v
v 12 Ford Truck/SUV 420 HR $125.00 | $52,500.00
\// 13 Ford Van 40 HR $125.00 $5,000.00
yd S
l// 14 Ford Bus 140 HR $125.00 $17,500.00
V/ 15 Ford Hybrid 30 HR $125.00 $3,750.00
CATEGORY 2: NON-QEM REPAIRS: AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
- 16 Category 2: Non-OEM Repairs: Automatic Transmission Repair/Replacement HR No Bid No Bid X

DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE (%) ON PARTS

Enter your company's percentage (%) discount from manufacturer's most recent suggested retail price list. This shall be a firm fixed
minimum discount for the term of the contract.

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No Bid
Measure (%)

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN?". For bid purposes assume parts at
$72,000.00 for the two (2} year term.

$39,456.00

Introduced on: June 4, 2025 :
g?;?r!tfd PREIEIt-jOLQ #@R%ﬂ,ﬂg?ﬁESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
icial Resolufiondia A2RMEEHOR VARIOUS VEHICLES UNDER 15,000 GYWR

Page 7
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[HOUPERT FLEET SERVICE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
REPAIR SERVICE FOR VARIOUS VEHICLES UNDER 15,000 GVWR

\

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments
Measure

10 Dodge Hybrid HR No Bid No Bid X
11 Ford Automobile HR No Bid No Bid X
12 Ford Truck/SUV HR No Bid No Bid X
13 Ford Van HR No Bid No Bid X
14 Ford Bus ] HR No Bid No'Bid X
15 Ford Hybrid ’ HR No Bid No Bid X
CATEGORY 2;: NON-OEM REPAIRS: AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION REPAIR/REPLACEMENT
A\l 16 Cateéory 2: Non-OEM Repairs: Automatic Transmission Repair/Replacement 100 HR $75.00 $7,500.00

DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE (%) ON PARTS

Enter your company's percentage (%) discount from manufacturer's most recent suggested retail price list. This shall be a firm fixed
minimum discount for the term of the contract.

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No Bid
Measure (%)

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN®". For bid purposes assume parts at $57,600.00
$72,000.00 for the two (2) year term.

Introduced an: lune 4_2025 .
Adopted®PERT FLARRYERV2SE] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Resolytipntr 2PRRARY DR VARIOUS VEHICLES UNDER 15,000 GVWR
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[UNITED FORD LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
REPAIR SERVICE FOR VARIOUS VEHICLES UNDER 15,000 GVWR

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments
Measure
12 Ford Truck/SUV 420 HR $195.00 $81,900.00
13 Ford Van 40 HR $195.00 $7,800.00
14 Ford Bus 140 HR $195.00 $27,300.00
15 Ford Hybrid ’ 30 HR $195.00 | $5,850.00

CATEGORY 2: NON-OEM REPAIRS: AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION REPAIR/REPLACEMENT -+ 215 42872+
ya ’ :
/ 16 Category 2: Non-OEM Repairs: Automatic Transmission Repair/Replacement 100 HR $195.00 | $19,500.00

V

DISCOUNT PERCENTAGE (%) ON PARTS

Enter your company's percentage (%) discount from manufacturer's most recent suggested retail price list. This shall be a firm fixed
minimum discount for the term of the contract.

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total No Bid
Measure (%)

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN?". For bid purposes assume parts at $50,400.00

$72,000.00 for the two {2) year term.

Introduced on: June 4, 2025

Adopte
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