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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE 101 Hooper Avenue
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS .
Toms River, New Jersey

Director John P. Kelly

08754-2191
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi (732)929-2005
Commissioner Robert S. Arace (732)505-1918
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Board Meeting Agenda
Date: April 2, 2025 - 4:00 PM
Location:  Administration Building

Room 119
101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of DUCTILE IRON CULVERT PIPE to Brent
Material Company; Ferguson Enterprises LLC; Civic Bridges and Raritan Group, Inc., the lowest qualified
bidders. (B2025-59)

Official Resolution# |2025000422
Meeting Date 04/02/2025
Introduced Date 04/02/2025
Adopted Date 04/02/2025
Agenda ltem m-21

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2025-59
Result Adopted
COUNTY g s g o lw [ !5;
COMMISSIONER § a g gi ﬁ g %
Kelly v v
Sadeghi v v
Arace v v |v
Bacchione v v v
Haines v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS

RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING
REFERENCED THEREON

Michaie . Guainer”

Clerk Of The Board
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CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON ALL
DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

v B0QS ~59

RESOLUTION
April 2, 2025

WHEREAS, on February 4, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of DUCTILE IRON CULVERT
PIPE for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Brent Material Company Ferguson Enterprises LLC
325 Columbia Turnpike, Suite 308 507 Oak Glen Road
Florham Park, NJ 07932 Howell, NJ 07731

(973) 325-3030 (848) 992-2132

Civic Bridges Raritan Group, Inc.

1846 1% Street Ste# 1006 301 Meadow Rd.

Idaho Falls, ID 83401 Edison, NJ 08817

(208) 538-9897 (732) 985-5000

Atlantic Plumbing Supply Core & Main LP

702 Joline Avenue 5142 Hurley Pond Road
Long Branch, NJ 07740 Farmingdale, NJ 07727
(732) 229-0334 (732) 938-6370

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance, namely that of, CIVIC BRIDGES; BRENT MATERIAL
COMPANY; FERGUSON ENTERPRISES LLC AND RARITAN GROUP, INC., be
accepted.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts accepting bids for the furnishing and delivery of Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe
for the County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through April 1, 2026, a
period of one (1) year, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County
reserves the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15, as
follows:

A. CIVIC BRIDGES for three (3) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 2, 7 and 8
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

Introduced on April 2, 2025
Adopted on: April 2, 2025
Official Resoldt{on#: 2025000422
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B. BRENT MATERIAL COMPANY for four (4) items, to wit:
ITEMNOS. 1,3,4and 5
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

C. FERGUSON ENTERPRISES, LLC for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 9.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

D. RARITAN GROUP, INC for one (1) item, to wit:
ITEM NO. 6.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidder in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities

shall be indicated.

3. Funds for the equipment shall be available within the following funding

Sources: Roads Department O.E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-59.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance,

Roads Department and the successful bidders.

April 2, 2025
April 2, 2025

on#: 2025000422




[FERGUSON WATER WORKS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
DUCTILE IRON CULVERT PIPE
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DUCTILE IRON CULVERT PIPE

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure

8" Ductile lron Culve& Pipe, Class 52 $41.13  |$106,938.00

.2 10" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 2,600 LF $53.90 5140,140.00

3 12" Ductile Iron CuIv_ert Pipe, Class 52 4,000 LF $67.88 |$271,520.00

4 14" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,500 LF $83.84 $125,760.00

5 16" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,500 LF $98.22  15147,330.00

6 18" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,100 LF $112.99 [$124,289.00

7 24" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,200 LF $161.70 [$194,040.00

8 36" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,200 LF $349.43 [$419,316.00

\ , ] Filter Cloth, Hanes N0O45 12.5' X 360' (500 Sq. Yd. Per Roll), As Specified, or Equal 12 ROLL $244.66 $2,935.92

Introduced-on: Alr_\ril '), 2025
AdoptefF&ERGUSON WPTER 20ZBRKS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official fesolyitien: 2HeGRP43RVERT PIPE
Page 6
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[BLUE GROUP LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
DUCTILE IRON CULVERT PIPE

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Comments:

Measure

1 8" Ductile iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 ' 2,600 LF $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

V, 2 10" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 2,600 LF $40.07 $104,182.00
3 12" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 4,000 LF $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
4 14" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,500 LF $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
5 16" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,500 LF $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
6 18" Ductile iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,100 LF $0.00 $0.00 No Bid
7 24" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,200 LF $105.58 [$126,696.00

v’ 8 36" Ductile iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,200 LF $203.28 [$243,936.00
9 Filter Cloth, Hanes N04S 12.5' X 360' {500 Sa. Yd. Per Roll), As Specified, or Equal 12 ROLL $905.45 $10,865.40

. Introduced on: April 2, 2025
Offcial Res kiR A Babi R ESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - DUCTILE IRON CULVERT PIPE

Page 6



Res-Pg:m.21-6
[RARITAN GROUP INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
DUCTILE IRON CULVERT PIPE

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:
Measure
1 8" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 2,600 LF $41.11 $106,886.00
2 10" Ductile tron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 2,600 LF $53.88 $140,088.00
3 12" Ductile tron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 4,000 LF $67.85 [$271,400.00
4 14" Ductile tron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,500 LF $83.97 |$125,955.00
5 16" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,500 LF $98.18 [$147,270.00
N 6 18" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,100 LF $112.94 [S$124,234.00
7 24" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 ; 1,200 LF $161.63 |$193,956.00
8 36" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,200 LF $349.28 |$419,136.00
9 Filter Cloth, Hanes NO45 12.5' X 360" (500 Sq. Yd. Per Roll), As Specified, or Equal 12 ROLL $437.50 $5,250.00
Introduced_on: Alnril 2 2025

Adopted FRARITAN GROHJR,IRE2$ RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Rgsplufion#| 202R8MA432)  VERT PIPE
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[BRENT MATERIAL COMPANY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
DUCTILE IRON CULVERT PIPE

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Comments:

Measure

V 1 8" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, dasg 52 o S '2-;600' b LF . $40.92 $106,39200
2 10" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 2,600 LF $53.63 $139‘,438.00
V/ 3 12" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 4,000 LF $67.53 [$270,120.00
b 4 14" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,500 LF $83.42 $125,130.00
»/ 5 16" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,500 LF $97.72 $146,580.00
6 18" Ductile fron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,100 LF $113.41 ([$124,751.00
7 24" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,200 LF $162.30 [$194,760.00
8 36" Ductile Iron Culvert Pipe, Class 52 1,200 LF $350.69 |$420,828.00
9 Filter Cloth, Hanes N0O45 12.5' X 360' (500 Sa. Yd. Per Roll), As Specified, or Equal 12 ROLL $353.00 $4,236.00
Introduced on: April 2, 2025

Adopted oR;
prei g REE&ENJM%IIJ%B% PANY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid - DUCTILE IRON CULVERT PIPE
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