Res-Pg:1.2-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director John P. Kelly

Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi
Commissioner Robert S. Arace
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione

Commissioner Virginia E. Haines

Board Meeting Agenda
Date:
Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

October 15, 2025 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL
EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES to Guaranteed Products, Inc. dba The Photo Center; Star Data Products; and
Toshiba America Business Solutions, Inc. dba Card Data Systems, the lowest qualified bidders. No bids were
received on Item Nos. 44, 45, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 88, 94, 101 and 102. They will be rebid. (B2025-141)

Official Resolution# (2025001474
Meeting Date 10/15/2025
Introduced Date 10/15/2025
Adopted Date 10/15/2025
Agenda ltem -2

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2025-141
Result Adopted
COUNTY o IO R R~
COMMISSIONER |¢¢ | o % > g @
Kelly v v
Sadeghi v v
Arace v v v
Bacchione v v |v
Haines v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michaite \. Guanor”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on|

Adopted on:
Official Resol

!

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON Ies-Pg:.
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

NO. B&DQS ~ IKH

RESOLUTION
October 15, 2025

WHEREAS, on September 3, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND
VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES, County of Ocean, State of New Jersey; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

following bidders:

Name and Address of Bidder Name and Address of Bidder
Guaranteed Products, Inc. Star Data Products

dba The Photo Center 175 E. Main Street

1930 Route 88 Ramsey, NJ 07446

Brick, NJ 08724 (201) 565-9876

(732) 840-1333

Toshiba America Business Solutions, Inc.
dba Card Systems
319 Commerce Court, Suite 108
Pottstown, PA 19464
(610) 656-2221
; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely that of GUARANTEED PRODUCTS,
INC., DBA THE PHOTO CENTER, STAR DATA PRODUCTS and TOSHIBA AMERICA
BUSINESS SOLUTIONS, INC., DBA CARD SYSTEMS. No bids were received on Item
Nos. 44, 45, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 88, 94, 101 and 102. All no bid Items will be rebid.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed to
enter into contracts for the furnishing and delivery of Photographic, Audio and Visual
Equipment and Supplies for the County of Ocean; for the contract period of one (1) year from
date of award, beginning November 6, 2025 through November 5, 2026, or until delivery is
complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the

contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

October 15, 2025
October 15, 2025
ion#: 2025001474




Introduced on:
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Res-Pg:1.2-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 OCTOBER 15, 2025

A. GUARANTEED PRODUCTS, INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER for thirty-one

(31) items, to wit:

ITEM NOS. 3,4, 5,7, 8,28, 43, 51, 54, 55, 62, 67, 68, 75, 77, 78, 84, 86, 87, 93, 95, 97, 103,
105,110,111, 112,113,114, 116 and 142.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK—-02-OC.

B. STAR DATA PRODUCTS for ninety (90) items, to wit:
ITEMNOS. 1,2,6,9,10, 11, 12,13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 29,
30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41, 42, 46, 47, 48, 49, 50, 52, 53, 61, 63, 64, 65, 66,
69, 70,71, 72,73, 74,76, 79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 85, 89, 90, 91, 92, 96, 98, 99, 100, 104, 106, 115,
117,119, 120, 121, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 127, 128, 130, 135, 137, 138, 140, 141 and 142.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

C. TOSHIBA AMERICA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS, INC., DBA CARD SYSTEMS
for twelve (12) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 107, 108, 109, 118, 129, 131, 132, 133, 134, 136, 139 and 142.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK—-02-OC.

2. In the event of tie bids, pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-6.1(d), bids are
awarded to the bidder(s) in the closest distance to the Ocean County Administration Building
at 101 Hooper Avenue, Toms River, NJ using the address indicated on their bid

documentation.

3. Pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:30-5.4, the County has established a reasonable
estimated maximum dollar value of $35,000.00 for the term of this contract, based on
historical procurement data for comparable goods or services. The County further reserves
the right to increase quantities by up to twenty percent (20%) of the maximum awarded

amount at the unit prices bid, in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:30-11.3.

4. Funds for these services shall be available within the following funding
sources: Business Development & Tourism, Clerk of the Board, County Clerk, County
Connection, Engineering, Fire Marshal, Fire/First Aid Training Center, Information
Technology, Medical Examiner, Parks Department, Prosecutor’s Office, Public Information,

Sheriff’s Office and Vehicle Services.

October 15, 2025
October 15, 2025
bn#: 2025001474
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BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 3 OCTOBER 15, 2025

5. Payments for the materials to be acquired by these contracts shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities

shall be indicated.

6. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-141.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Purchasing Department, Finance Department, Business
Development & Tourism, Clerk of the Board, County Clerk, County Connection, Engineering,
Fire Marshal, Fire/First Aid Training Center, Information Technology, Medical Examiner,

Parks Department, Prosecutor’s Office, Public Information, Sheriff’s Office and Vehicle

Services.
Introduced on: October 15, 2025
Adopted on: October 15, 2025
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[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ' ,
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-5

Line Item

Description

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid Manufacturer
(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.

Comments

Delivery, A.R.Q.

Batteries,
Rechargeable for
Canen EOS 7D and
50 Mark Hand i1l
Camera, LP-E6N

25

EA

$42.00

$1,050.00

PROMASTER

(Required)
1207

Battery, Canon
EOS R7

10

EA

$37.00

$370.00

PROMASTER

1207

Battery, Canon LP-
E6NH

10

EA

$78.00

$780.00°

CANON

6537C001

Battery, Canon LP-
E10

EA

$75.00

$375.00

CANON

5108B002

Battery Charger,
Canon EOS R7

10

EA

$48.00

] $480.00

PROMASTER

ILC 70120

Battery Charger,

Canon LC-ES, for
LP-E6 Li-ion, SKU:
33488001

EA

$79.00

$395.00

CANON

6537C001

Battery Charger,
Canon LC-E10

EA

$55.00

$275.00° -

CANON

51098001

10

Battery Charger,
Nikon Quick
Charger MH-25

20

- EA

$64.00

$1,280.00

NIKON

27148

11

| Battery Charger,
Promaster AA
#4165

EA

' No Bid

No Bid

Introduced on:
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[(GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-6

Line Item

Description

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Manufacturer
{Required)

Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
and/or No.

26

Memory Card, 1
GB SD for Canon
Powershot A550

EA

No Bid

No Bid

{Required)

27

Memory Card, 4
GB Sandisk Secure
‘| Disk

EA

No Bid

No Bid

28

Memory Card,
Promaster
Professional Hi-
Speed Compact
Flash Memory
Card 4GB #8470

EA

$21.00

$105.00

PROMASTER

8470

29

Memory Card,
SanDisk Extreme
PLUS SDHC UHS-1
Card, 16 GB

EA

No Bid

No Bid

30

Memory Card,
SanDisk Extreme
PLUS.SDHC UHS-1
Card, 64 GB

EA

No Bid

No Bid

31

Memory Card,
SanDisk Extreme
Compact Flash
Memory Card, 128
GB

EA

No Bid

No Bid

32

Memory Card,
SanDisk Extreme
Compact Flash
Memory Card, 32
G8

EA

No 8id

No Bid

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025
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[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:1.2-7

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Item

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid Manufacturer
(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

40

FujiFilm 6x213
DX100 Inkjet Paper
Glossy for
Frontier-S DX100
Printer

20

‘EA

$120.00

* $2,400.00

FUJIFILM

(Required)
600023643

41

FujiFilm 8x213
DX100 Inkjet Paper
Glossy for
Frontier-S DX100
Printer

20

EA

$144.00

$2,880.00

FUJIFILM

600023628

42

Photo Paper, 8
1/2" x 11" HP
#CRG664A, Gloss
Finish, 50
Sheets/Pack

PACK

No Bid

No Bid

SECTION [V - CAMERAS, CAMCORDERS & ACCESSORIES - ALL ITEMS ARE

AS SPECIFIED OR

EQUAL

43

%

Backpack, Think
Tank Photo Street
Walker Pro V2.0,
Black

10

EA

$239.00

$2,390.00

THINKTANK

THINKTANK
WALKER PRO 24 L
EQUIVALENT
720506

44

Cable, USB-C,
100W Power
Delivery

EA

No Bid

No Bid

45

Camera Bag, 14" L
x7"Wx 11" D, As
Specified or Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025
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[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE YPHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:1.2-8

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Iltem

Description

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid Manufacturer
(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.

Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

46

Camera Bag,
Cityscape 30
Camera Bag, Color:
Charcoal Grey,
Part # 4373,
Dimensions: 8.5" x
7.0" x 5.0", Rain
cover that tucks
away in a special
compartment
when not in use;

25

EA

$98.00

$2,450.00

PROMASTER

(Required)
4373

47

Camera, Body

' Only, Canon EOS

RS, SKU: 4147C002

EA

$3,900.00

$19,500.00

CANON

R511 4147C002

48

Camera, Canon
EOS 7D Mark II, As
Specified, or Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

49

Camera, Canon -
EOS 80D DSLR
Bundle, As
Specified, or Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

50

Camera, Nikon
07100

EA

No Bid

No 8id

/51

Camera, Nikon
D7500 DSLR
Camera, Body Only

15

EA

$950.00

$14,250.00

NIKON

D7500 1581

52

Camera, Nikon 25
11 W/24-200MM
KIT

15

EA

$2,550.00

$38,250.00

NIKON

251t W/24-200MM

KIT 1688

Introd :
Adopte|
Official
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[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-9

Line ltem

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Manufacturer

(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.
(Required)

Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Cuff, Black, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

Strap, Peak Design

53 Camera, Nikon Z8 S EA 54,295.00‘ $21,475.00 NIKON Z8 MIRRORLESS
Mirrorless with WITH FTZHADAPTER
FTZ Il Adapter Kit . KIT 1695,4264
/ 54 Camera Wrist 20 EA 537.00 $740.00 PEAK DESIGNS | CFBL3

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025
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[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-10

Product Name
and/or No.
{Required)

Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer
Measure {Required)
55 Canon R7 KIT: 10 EA $2,285.00 $22,850.00 ’ CANON
Camera: Canon
A EOS R7, 18-
150mm Lens,
Image

Stabilization, Part
#5137C009, As
Specified, NO
SUBSTITUTION
Flash: Canon Flash
ELS Speedlight
Part # 5654C002,
As Specified, NO
SUBSTITUTION
Memory: Pro
Master Rugged
SDxC memory
card, waterproof,
64GB, Part #5421,
As Specified, NO
SUBSTITUTION
Bag: Cityscape 30
Camera Bag, Color:
Charcoal Grey,
Part # 4373,
Dimensions: 8.5" x
7.0"x5.0", Rain
cover that tucks
away in a special
compartment
when not in use;
Filter: Promaster
HGX, Prime UV,
filter SSmm, Part
#6704, As
Specified, NO
SUBSTITUTION

5137C008,
564C002,5421,6704

Introduced on: October 15, 2025
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Res-Pg:1.2-11

[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD ‘ . '
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line item Description Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Product Name Delivery, A.R.Q. Comments

Measure (Required) and/or No.
{Required)

60 Case, Unidentified . EA No Bid No Bid X
Flashdrive -

Organizer Case,
Abundant Supply
Company, Black

61 Flash - Nikon SB- 15 EA $625.00 $9,375.00 NIKON 4815

5000 AF
Speedlight Flash,
NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

62. Filter, Canon 5 EA $189.00 $945.00 PROMASTER 6865

/ Circular Polarizer ’ . REPLACEMENT
\W (CPL) Filter, 82mm EQUIVALENT

for 24-70mm and
15-35mm

63 Filter, Canon 5 . EA $285.00 $1,425.00 CANON 19538001

Circular Polarizer
(CPL) Filter, 82mm
for 24-70mm and
15-35mm

64 Filter, Hoya 62mm EA No Bid No Bid X
HD UV, Mfg &
XHD62UV

65 Filter, Hoya 67mm EA No Bid No Bid X
' HD UV, Mfg #
XHD67UV

66 Filter, Promaster ' EA No Bid No Bid ' X
HGX, Prime UV, -

55mm, Part #6704
As Specified, NO
SUBSTITUTION

Introduced on: October 15, 2025
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o Res-Pg:1.2-12
[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Measure (Required) and/or No.
(Required)

67 Filter, Promaster 25 EA $89.00 $2,225.00 PROMASTER 6837
Professional HGX
Circular Polarizing,
62 mm with
“REPELLAMAX”

Element Resistant . ~
/ Coating; repels ) i :
moisture, . .

fingerprints, dust,
dirt, and grime.
Ultra hardened
optical glass resists
surface scratching
and stands up to
heavy-duty use.

68 Filter, Promaster 25 EA $99.00 $2,475.00 ' PROMASTER 6844
Professional HGX :
] Circular Polarizing,
67mm with
/ “REPELLAMAX”
WU Element Resistant
Coating; repels
moisture,
fingerprints, dust,
| dirt,.and grime.
Ultra hardened
optical glass resists
surface scratching
and stands up to
heavy-duty use.

69 ‘| Filter, Tiffen 62mm : EA No Bid No Bid X
Orange :
70 Filter, Tiffen 62mm EA NoBid No Bid X
Red
Introduced on: October 15, 2025
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Res-Pg:1.2-13
[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
Measure (Required) and/or No.

{Required)
71 Filter, Tiffen 62mm EA No Bid No Bid X '
Skylight/Uv
72 Filter, Tiffen 62mm EA . No Bid No Bid X
Yellow
73 Filter, Tiffen 67 EA No Bid - No 8id X
mm Orange
74 Filter, Tiffen 67mm EA No Bid No Bid X
uv
75 Flash, Canon Flash -5 EA $309.00 $1_,545.00 CANON 5654002
/ R ELS Speedlight :
Vi Part # 5654C002,
As Specified, NO
SUBSTITUTION

76 Flash (External) for EA No Bid No Bid X

Canon EOS RS : '
SKU: 5790C002, or
Equal

77 - |Flash, GODOX 15 EA $121.00 $1,815.00 GODOX TT68SIIN
TT6851I N FLASH :

78 Flash Trigger, 15 EA $84.00 $1,260.00 GODOX X3N
Wireless, GODOX '
X3 TTL({N)

NN

79 Lens, Canon EF 16- 5 EA $2,200.00 Sll,OOO.OOY CANON 0573C002
35mm F2.8L1I
USM

Introduced on: October 15, 2025 .
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[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-14

Line ltem

Description

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid Manufacturer
{Required)

Product Name
and/or No.

Delivery, AR.O.

Comments

80

Lens, Canon EF 24-
105mm f/4L ISl
USM with a Canon
Mount, Mgf #
1380€002

EA

$1,399.00

$6,995.00

CANON

(Required)
1380C002

81

Lens, Canon EF 70-
200mm f2.8L 1S Il
Usm, Mfg #
2569A004

EA

$2,499.00

$12,495.00

CANON

2569A004

82

Lens, Canon 70-
200mm - Canon
mount

EA

No Bid

No Bid

83

Lens, Canon EF
100-400mm f/4.5-
S.6L 1S I USM, Mfg
#9524B002AA

EA

$2,599.00

$12,995.00

CANON

9524B002AA

84

Lens, Canon EOS
R7, 18-150mm
Lens, Image
Stabilization, Part
#5137C009, As
Specified, NO
SUBSTITUTION

EA

$1,885.00 -

$9,425.00 -

CANON

5137C009

85

Lens, Canon RF 15-

35Smm f/2.8L1S
USM SKU:
3682C002 Ultra-
Wide Zoom

EA

$2,295.00

$11,475.00

CANON

3682C002

Introduced on:
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[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:1.2-15

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Item

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Manufacturer
(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

Lens, Canon RF 24-
70mm f/2.8L 1S
USM: SKU:
3680C002,
Standard Zoom

EA

$2,295.00

$11,475.00

CANON

{Required)
3680C002

Lens, Canon RF
100mm f/2.8L
Macro IS USM
SKU: 4514C002
Macro Lens

EA

$1,099.00

$5,495.00

CANON

4514C002

88

Lens Cleaning Kit,
ProOptic Complete
Optics Care and
Cleaning Kit, SKU:
PROXCPK1, or
Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

89

Lens, Nikon 70-
300mm

10

EA

$680.00

$6,800.00

NIKON

20068

90

Lens, Nikon AF
Micro Nikkor
60mm 1:2:8D

EA

No Bid

No Bid

91

Lens, Nikon AF-P
DX NIKKOR 18-
55mm f/3.5-5.6G
VR Lens

EA

No Bid

No Bid

92

Lens, Nikon AF-S
DX 18-140MM
Lens, f/3.5-5.6G
ED VR Lens

15

EA

$685.00

$10,275.00

NIKON

2213

Vs

%

tens, Nikon Z
50mm F2.8MC
5

Introduced-on:
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[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:1.2-16

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Item

Description

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid Manufacturer
{Required)

Product Name
and/or No.

Comments

Delivery, A.R.O.

94

Measuring Scales
Forensic Kit,
Standard Photo
Scale Kit, SKU: A-
6600SK or Equal

EA

No 8id

No Bid

(Required)

95

Memory Card, Pro
Master Rugged
SDxC memory
card, waterproof,
64GB, Part #5421,
As Specified, NO
SUBSTITUTION.

15

EA

$19.00

$285.00

PROMASTER

5421

96

Remote, Nikon
Wireless Remote
Control ML -L

EA

$49.00

$245.00

NIKON

25952

Remote Release
Cord, Nikon MC-
DC2

EA

$35.00

$175.00

NIKON

25395

98

Replacement
Panel for Built-in
Flash, Nikon SG -
31R

EA

No Bid

No Bid

99

SanDisk Extreme
Pro CFexpress
Type B, 256GB, for
Canon EOS RS,
SKU:
0081792700305,
or Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid
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[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:1.2-17

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Ltine Item

Description

Unit of
Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Manufacturer
(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.

Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

100

SanDisk Extreme
Pro UHS-1I SDXC
V90, 128GB, for
Canon EOS RS,
SKU:
0619659170369
(UPC), or Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

{Required)

101

SanDisk Extreme
PRO CFexpress
Card Reader, SKU:
SDCFE-0000-A46,
or Equal ~

EA

No 8id

No Bid

102

SD Card Reader,
Kingston
Mobilelite Plus

EA

No Bid

Nog Bid

103

v

Tripod, Manfrotto
190, Aluminum 4
Section
M190XPRO4-BH

EA

$295.00

$1,475.00

MANFROTTO

M190XPRO4-BH

104

Tripod, Manfrotto

496RC2, Compact

Ball Head W/R2

EA

No Bid

No Bid

\//105

Tripod, Manfrotto
MK290XTA3-
2WUS 290 Xtra
Aluminum with
128 RC Micro Fluid
Head and Quick
Release

EA

$255.00

$1,275.00

| MANFROTTO

MK290XTA3-2WUS
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Res-Pg:1.2-18

[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD . | S
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

Measure {Required) and/or No.
(Required)
109 Entrust DuraGard ROLL .No Bid No Bid ’ X
Laminate, 1 mil, ’
Clear, item

#508785-501, for
use with Datacard
CD-CLM
Laminator/Printer
CD800, 300
Prints/Roll

110 Fujifilm 16393019 | 15 EA $79.00 $1,185.00 FUJIFILM 16393018
/ Black Ink Cartridge .

vV 200m for Fujifilm
Frontier-S DX100

111 Fujifilm 16393021 15 EA $79.00 $1,185.00 FUJIFILM 16393021
/ Cyan Ink Cartridge .

200ml for Fujifilm
Frontier-S DX100

112 Fujifilm 16393033 15 EA $79.00 $1,185.00 FUJIFILM 16393033
/ Magenta Ink ’ .

LV Cartridge 200ml
for Fujifilm
Frontier-S DX100

113 Fujifilm 16393045 15 EA $79.00 $1,185.00 FUJIFILM 16393045
/ Yellow Ink '
u Cartridge 200mt
for Fujifilm
Frontier-S DX100

Sky Blue ink 200ml
for Fujifilm
Frontier-S DX100

/"114 Fujifilm 16393057 15 EA $79.00 $1,185.00 FUJIFILM 16393057
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Res-Pg:1.2-19

[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
Measure (Required) and/or No.

(Required)

115 - Fujifilm 16393069 . 15 ’ EA $89.00 $1,335.00 ) FUJIFILM 16393069
Pink Ink Cartridge :

200ml for Fujifilm

Frontier-S DX100 .

116 Fujifilm DX100 S EA $2,395.00 $11,975.00 ° FUKIFILM 600022355

\’/ Smartlab Frontier-

S Inkjet Printer .

. 117 Fujifilm Waste Ink EA No 8id No Bid X
Tank for Frontier-S
DX100 Printer

118 ID Cards, CR80 BX No Bid No Bid X
NOCO, CR-79/CR-
80 Compatible ID
Cards, Item #
54563 81754,
500/Box

SECTION V! - MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

119 Backpack, Tenba EA . NoBid No Bid X
Axis V2, 16L or
20L, Rugged, Good
Access Points, or
Equal

120 Canon EA No Bid . NoBid X
Maintenance
Cartridge MC-31

121 Ink Cartridge, 5 EA $95.00 - - $475.00 CANON 2884C001AA
Canon PFl- 120
Matte Black,
130ml
Introduced on: . October 15, 2025
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Res-Pg:1.2-20

[GUARANTEED PRODUCTS INC DBA THE PHOTO CENTER] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD )
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments

Measure

' 142 Discount Percentage (%) for Photographic, Audio and Visual Equipment and % 2%
Supplies (NOT LESS THAN), As Specified :
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_ Res-Pg:1.2-21
[TOSHIBA AMERICA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS/ CARD DATA SYSTEMS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer  Product Name  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

(Required) and/or No.
{Required)

106 Tripod with Head, " EA No Bid- No Bid COX
Vanguard Alta Pro
263AGH 3 Section
Aluminum Tripod
with GH-100 Pistol
Grip Ball Head

SECTION V - PHOTO PRINTERS AND SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

107 Customized 150 ROLL $214.00 $32,100.00
Laminates, User ’
Department will
provide
customized
information for

’ imprinting; Entrust
. DuraGard
\/ Laminate, 0.6 mil,
holo, item
#508808-032, for
use with SLM-CLM |’
Desktop
Laminator, 350

Prints/ Roll

108 Entrust DuraGard 100 ROLL $219.00 $21,900.00
Laminate, 0.6 mil,” .

Holo, Item
. / #508808-032, for
\4 Use with SLM-CLM |~
Desktop

Laminator, 350
Prints/Roll
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. Res-Pg:1.2-22
[TOSHIBA AMERICA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS/ CARD DATA SYSTEMS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
“ PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

(Required) and/or No.
(Required)

109 Entrust DuraGard 150 ROLL $78.00 $11,700.00

Laminate, 1 mil, S

Clear, ltem
#508785-501, for

\_ use with Datacard

CD-CLM

Laminator/Printer

CD800, 300
Prints/Rol}

110 Fujifilm 16393019 EA No Bid No Bid X

| Black Ink Cartridge
200m| for Fujifilm

Frontier-S DX100

111 Fujifilm 16393021 . EA No Bid No Bid X
Cyan Ink Cartridge
200mt for Fujifilm
Frontier-S DX100

112 Fujifilm 16393033 EA No Bid No Bid X
Magenta Ink ’ ;

Cartridge 200m!
for Fujifilm
Frontier-S DX100

113 Fujifilm 16393045 EA No 8id No Bid ' X
Yellow Ink .
Cartridge 200mi
for Fujifilm
Frontier-S DX100

114 .Fujiﬁlm 16393057 EA . No Bid No Bid X
Sky Blue Ink 200ml
for Fujifilm
Frontier-S DX100
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- Res-Pg:1.2-23
[TOSHIBA AMERICA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS/ CARD DATA SYSTEMS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer  Product Name Delivery, AR.O. Comments

(Required) and/or No.
(Required)

115 Fujifilm 16393069 EA No Bid No Bid X
Pink Ink Cartridge ’
200ml for Fujifilm
Frontier-S DX100

116 Fujifilm DX100 EA No Bid No Bid X
Smartlab Frontier- ~
S Inkjet Printer

117 Fujifilm Waste Ink EA No Bid No Bid - X
. | Tank for Frontier-S :
DX100 Printer

118 ID Cards, CR80 100 BX ) '$45.00 $4,500.00
/ NOCO, CR-79/CR-
80 Compatible 1D
\% Cards, Item #
54563 81754,
500/Box

SECTION V! - MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

119 Backpack, Tenba EA No Bid No Bid X
Axis V2, 16L or
20L, Rugged, Good
Access Points, or
Equal

120 Canon : EA No Bid No Bid X
Maintenance
Cartridge MC-31

121 Ink Cartridge, EA No Bid No Bid X
Canon PFI- 120 :

Matte Black,
130mi
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, o Res-Pg:1.2-24
[TOSHIBA AMERICA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS/ CARD DATA SYSTEMS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer  Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
(Required) and/or No.
(Required)
129 0.10 mil PVC . 5 BX $81.00 $405.00
Plastic White
Graphics Quality
/ Cards for use in
M the DataCard

Entrust Sigma
Printer, 1000/Box

130 0.015 mil PVC 150 BX $94.00- $14,100.00
Plastic White
Graphics Quality
Cards for use in
the DataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printer, 1000/Box

131 0.30 mil PVC 50 BX $45.00 $2,250.00

Plastic White
Graphics Quality
L Cards for use in

the DataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printer, 500/Box

132 Brady People ID 5 EA $33.00 $165.00
3928-1000 Blue

L Cloth Backdrop w/

Grommets -

Capture Photo ID
Background,
Product # 3928-
1000
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Res-Pg:1.2-25

[TOSHIBA AMERICA BUSINESS SOLUT!ONS/ CARD DATA SYSTEMS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost i Manufacturer  Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
(Required) and/or No.
(Required)
133 Brady People 5 EA $150.00 $750.00
3943-1100 Photo
/ ID Equipment
U Supplies, Hand
Held Punch-

3/16(5MM) Hole,
Minimum Order
Quantity

134 Crocodile Clip with 50 PKG $28.00 $1,400.00
Transparent Strap,
/ Fitted with Press

\) Stud Button,
Material,
Metal/PVC, item #

56200-0000, 100
Pieces/Box

135 Datacard YMCKF- S0 PKG $204.00 $10,200.00
KT Color Ribbon
Kit P/N: 535000-
011, NO
EXCEPTIONS

136 DataCard YMCKT 200 PKG $81.00 $16,200.00
Color Ribbon Kit

/ Optimized for use

with DataCard

Entrust Sigma
Printers

137 DataCard YMCKT- 50 PKG $208.00 $10,400.00
KT Color Ribbon
Kit Optimized for
use with DataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printers
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Res-Pg:1.2-26

[TOSHIBA AMERICA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS/ CARD DATA SYSTEMS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Iltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer  Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

(Required) and/or No.
{Required)

138 Datacard Color 50 PKG $309.00 $15,450.00
Ribbon, YMCKT-KT i

Compatible with

CD800, ttem #

535000-006, NO

EXCEPTIONS

139 Datacard Color 50 PKG $225.00 $11,250.00
Ribbon, YMCKT-KT

/ Compatible with
\ CD80O, Item
#535000-005, NO
EXCEPTIONS

140 Steel Split Ring, 1 PKG No Bid No Bid X
3/16" {(30mm) ’

Nickel-Plated

Heat-Treated,
1000/Pack

141 Table Top Passport ' EA No Bid No Bid X
ID Photo Die
Cutter Punch, 2" x
2ll

- SECTION IX - DISCOUNT % ON ITEMS NOT LISTED HEREIN

The County expects there may be a need for new Photographic, Audio and Visual Equipment and Supplies that are similar in nature
but not already included in these specifications. For these unlisted items, the vendor shall offer a discount off current pricing. This
section shall be awarded to the vendors awarded any of the other eight (8) sections. The County reserves the right to award multiple
contracts for this section only. The department shall request quotes from various awarded vendors to determine the lowest price

' before placing their order. ’ : -
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Res-Pg:1.2-27

[TOSHIBA AMERICA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS/ CARD DATA SYSTEMS] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description

Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments
Measure

Discount Percentage (%) for Photographic, Audio and Visual Equipment and
Supplies (NOT LESS THAN), As Specified
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Res-Pg:1.2-28

[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

12. Submission of Bid Package*
By submitting a response to this solicitation, the Vendor understands and acknowledges that all required documents to this
solicitation must be submitted and that failure to do so may be cause for rejection.

Bidder also understands that only one (1) bid submission shall be considered. Please DO NOT Submit a manual bid response.
Submitting a manual response in addition to the electronic response is cause for rejection of your bid.

Confirmed

.UPRICETABLES = -
PHOTOGRAPHIC AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

If providing a product other than the items specified, please provide product information. Upload any attachments to the Vendor
Questionnaire under "Additional Vendor Documentation". ‘

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer  Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

(Required) and/or No.
{Required)

SECTION | - BATTERIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

1 - | Batteries, 95 EA $2.49 $236.55
/ Rechargeable, AA,
\1 NI-MH, 2500 mah

2 Batteries, 5 EA $2.49 $12.45
Rechargeable AAA '

3 Batteries, 25 EA : $89.00 $2,225.00
Rechargeable for
Canon EOS 7D and
SD Mark Il and ill
Camera, LP-E6N
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Res-Pg:1.2-29
[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT '

Bid No. TBD N
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer  Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

(Required) and/or No.
(Required)

4 Battery, Canon 10 EA $89.00 $890.00
EOS R7
5 Battery, Canon LP- 10 EA $89.00 $8390.00 .
E6NH
/ 6 Battery, Canon LP- 5 EA $55.00 $275.00
V] E10
7 Battery Charger, 10 EA $69.00 $690.00

Canon EOS R7

8 Battery Charger, S EA $89.00 $445.00
Canon LC-E§, for
LP-E6 Li-ion, SKU:
3348B001

9 Battery Charger, S EA . $38.00 $190.00
Canon LC-E10

<

NERNE

10 Battery Charger, .20 EA $62.00 $1,240.00
Nikon O,u_ick :
Charger MH-25

11 Battery Charger, 20 . . EA $90.00 $1,800.00
Promaster AA
#4165

(o

12 Battery Charger, 15 EA $75.00 $1,125.00
Watson 8-Bay

/ ) Rapid Charger for

\W AA / AAA NiMH or

NiCd Rechargeable
Batteries

SECTION [ - AUDIO & VIDEO SUPPLIES - ALL I[TEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL
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[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD '
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-30

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost

Manufacturer

(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.
(Required)

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

13 Disc, Compact, 5 PACK $18.00 $90.00

. / imitation 8rand

™ CD-RW, 25/Pack

14 Disc, Compact, 5 PACK $25.00 $125.00
\// Sony CDR Media, -
700MH, 50/Pack

15 Disc, Mini, 5 . PACK $93.00 $465.00

. Compact,
/ Recordable,
V1 156MB, for Mavica
MCR-156A,

50/Pack

17 DVD-R Archival 60 PACK $22.00 $1,320.00
Gold, Write Once x

Recordable DVD,
V] 4.7GB storage
capacity, up to 8X
write speed,
10/Pack

16 Disc, Mini Sony 5 PACK $60.00 $300.00
u DVD-R, 30 min.,
1.4GB

18 DVD-R Ultralife 30 PACK $126.00 $3,780.00
Gold Archival

/ Grade, #
% VER95355, 4.7 GB,
16x, Spindle, Gold,
50/Pack

/ 19 Flash Drive, San 55 . EA $6.00 $330.00
V] Disk Cruzer Glide )
USB 2.0, 8 GB
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[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

Res-Pg:l.2-31

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Item

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Manufacturer

(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.
{Required)

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

Flash Drive, San
Disk Cruzer Glide
USB 2.0, 16 GB

75

EA

$7.00

$525.00

Flash Drive, San

usB

Disk Cruzer, 32GB,

55

EA

$7.30

$401.50

22

Flash Drive, San
Disk Cruzer Glide
USB 2.0, 64 GB

75

EA

$7.48

$561.00

23

Flash Drive, San
Disk Extreme USB
3.0,16GB

40

EA

$17.00

$680.00

24

. <
N\

Flash Drive, San
Disk Extreme USB
3.0,64 GB

15

EA

$55.00

$825.00

25

Hard Drive,
Portable, Mode!
#SDSSDE6], 178,
San Disk, or Equal

10

EA

$109.00

-$1,090.00

-

Memory Cavrd, 1
GB SD for Canon
Powershot AS50

EA

$6.00

$30.00

”
e
g

<~

Memory Card, 4

Disk

GB Sandisk Secure

20

EA

$5.00

$100.00
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[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-32

Line item

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Manufacturer

{Required)

Product Name
and/or No.
(Required)

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

Memory Card,
Promaster
Professional Hi-
Speed Compact
Flash Memory
Card 4GB #8470

EA

$34.00

$170.00

Memory Card,
SanDisk Extreme
PLUS SDHC UHS-1
Card, 16 GB

40

EA

$17.00

$680.00

Memory Card,
SanDisk Extreme
PLUS SDHC UHS-1
Card, 64 GB

45

EA

$55.00

$2,475.00

Memory Card,
SanDisk Extreme
Compact Flash
Memory Card, 128
GB

10

EA

$75.00

$750.00

Memory Card,
SanDisk Extreme
Compact Flash
Memory Card, 32
GB

10

EA

$25.00

$250.00

Memory Card,
SanDisk
MicroSDHC with
Adaptor, 32GB

EA

$25.00

$125.00

v

Introduce
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MP3 Player,
SanDisk Clip Jam, 8
GB, SanDisk, or
Equal

I 15 20908

EA

$59.00

$295.00
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Res-Pg:1.2-33
[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD : ‘
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer  Product Name  Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
{Required) and/or No.

(Required)

35 [NoiseCanceling | 5 | ea $57.00 | $285.00

Headphones, Sony
v Model

MDRNC7/MDRNC8

/ 36 Philips LFH334 5 EA $99.00 $495.00
9% Headset, or Equal

37 Philips LFH334 5 SET $24.00 $120.00
Replacement

U Headset Pads, 2
) Pads/Set

SECTION it - PHOTOGRAPHIC PAPER AND FILM - ALL iTEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

38 Canon 15 EA $166.00 $2,490.00
Heavyweight '
/, Matte Coated

Paper for Inkjet -
M ‘ 36" Wide Roll -
100’ Long

DX100 Inkjet Paper
Glossy for

Frontier-S DX100 )
Printer : : : )

/39 FujiFilm 5x213 20 EA $68.00 $1,360.00

40 FujiFilm 6x213 20 EA $48.00 $960.00
DX100 Inkjet Paper
L . Glossy for
Frontier-S DX100
Printer
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Res-Pg:1.2-34
[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD .
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIE

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer  Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
(Required) and/or No.

(Required)

a1 FujiFilm 8x213. 20 EA $58.00 $1,160.00
DX100 inkjet Paper . '

/ Glossy for
\ Frontier-S DX100

Printer

42 Photo Paper, 8 S PACK $29.00 $145.00

/ 1/2" x 11" HP
u #CRE64A, Gloss
i Finish, 50
Sheets/Pack

SECTION IV - CAMERAS, CAMCORDERS & ACCESSORIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

43 Backpack, Think EA No Bid No Bid X
Tank Photo Street :

Walker Pro V2.0,
Black

44 Cable, USB-C, . ) EA No Bid © No Bid X
100W Power
Delivery

45 Camera Bag, 14" L EA No Bid No Bid X
x7"Wx11"D, As :
Specified or Equal

46 Camera Bag, 25 e EA - $96.00 $2,400.00
Cityscape 30
Camera Bag, Color:

Charcoal Grey,
/ Part # 4373, »
\/ Dimensions: 8.5" x

7.0" x 5.0", Rain
cover that tucks
away in a special
compartment
when not in use;

Introducedon: October1526025
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[STAR DATA CO]
Bid No. TBD

RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-35

Line ltem

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Manufacturer

(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.
{Required)

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

47

Camera, Body
Only, Canon EOS
RS, SKU: 4147C002

EA

$2,995.00

$14,975.00

48

Camera, Canon
EQS 70 Mark li, As
Specified, or Equal

20

EA

$1,661.00

$33,220.00

49

Camera, Canon
£0S 80D DSLR
Bundle, As
Specified, or Equal

EA

$1,899.00

$9,495.00

50

Camera, Nikon
D7100

EA

$899.00

$4,495.00

51

Camera, Nikon
D7500 DSLR
Camera, Body Only

15

EA

$962.00

$14,430.00

/52

Camera, Nikon Z5
it W/24-200MM
KIT

15

EA

$2,495.00

$37,425.00

53

Camera, Nikon 28
Mirrorless with
FTZ Il Adapter Kit

EA

$4,140.00

$20,700.00

54

Camera Wrist
Strap, Peak Design
Cuff, Black, NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

20

EA

$67.00

$1,340.00
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[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT .
Bid No. TBD '

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-36

Line Item

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Manufacturer

{Required)

Product Name
and/or No.
(Required)

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

60

Case, Unidentified
Flashdrive
Organizer Case,
Abundant Supply
Company, Black

EA

No Bid

No Bid

61

Fiash - Nikon SB-
5000 AF
Speedlight Flash,
NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

15

EA

$593.00

$8,895.00

62

Filter, Canon
Circular Polarizer
(CPL) Filter, 82mm
for 24-70mm and

15-35mm

EA

$249.00

$1,245.00

/63
U

.Filter, Canon

Circular Polarizer
(CPL) Filter, 82mm
for 24-70mm and
15-35mm )

EA

$249.00

$1,245.00

: 64
N

Filter, Hoya 62mm
HD UV, Mfg #
XHDB2UV

30

EA

$219.00 -

$6,570.00

/65

Filter, Hoya 67mm
HD UV, Mfg #
XHD67UV

25

" EA

$219.00

$5,475.00

%

Filter, Promaster
HGX, Prime UV,

55mm, Part #6704 |

As Specified, NO
SUBSTITUTION

EA

$147.00

$735.00
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Bid No. TBD .
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPME

NT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-37

Line Item

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Manufacturer

(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.
(Required)

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

67

Filter, Promaster
Professional HGX
Circular Polarizing,
62 mm with
"REPELLAMAX"
Element Resistant
Coating; repels
maoisture,
fingerprints, dust,
dirt, and grime.
Ultra hardened
optical glass resists
surface scratching
and stands up to
heavy-duty use.

25

EA

$133.00

$3,325.00

68

Filter, Promaster
Professional HGX
Circular Polarizing,

| 67mm with

“REPELLAMAX”
Element Resistant
Coating; repels
moisture,
fingerprints, dust,
dirt, and grime.
Ultra hardened
optical glass resists
surface scratching
and stands up to
heavy-duty use.

25

EA

$145.00

$3,625.00

/ 69

Filter, Tiffen 62mm
Orange

EA

$79.00

$395.00

VAR

Filter, Tiffen 62mm
Red .

EA

$79.00

$395.00
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Res-Pg:1.2-38
[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD |
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line ltem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer  Product Name  Delivery, AR.O. Comments

(Required) and/or No.
(Required)

71 Filter, Tiffen 62mm 5 ’ EA $79.00 $395.00
Skylight/UV

72 Filter, Tiffen 62mm S EA $79.00 $395.00
Yellow

73 Filter, Tiffen 67 5 EA $79.00 $395.00
mm Orange .

N N NN

74 Filter, Tiffen 67mm 10 . EA $79.00 $790.00
uv

75 - | Flash, Canon Flash 5 EA $359.00 $1,795.00
ELS Speedlight ’
Part # 5654C002,
As Specified, NO
SUBSTITUTION

76 Flash (External) for 5 EA $359.00 $1,795.00
. Canon EOS RS
J v SKU: 5790C002, or
» Equal

77 Flash, GODOX 15 EA ~ $123.00 $1,845.00
TT685II N FLASH

78 Flash Trigger, 15 EA $108.00 $1,620.00
Wireless, GODOX
X3 TTL(N)

/ 79 Lens, Canon EF 16- 5 EA $1,219.00 $6,095.00
35mm F2.8L 11
usm

Introduced on: October 15, 2025
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- Res-Pg:1.2-39
[STAR DATA CO} RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer  Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

(Required) and/or No.
{Required)

80 Lens, Canon EF 24- 5 EA $1,290.00 $6,450.00
105mm f/4L ISl

. USM with a Canon
V1 Mount, Mgf #
1380C002

] 81 Lens, Canon EF 70- S EA $2,080.00 $10,450.00
/ 200mm f2.8L S II : .
iy *|usm, mfg #
2569A004

200mm - Canon
mount

/‘ 82 tens, Canon 70- 5 EA $1,292.00 $6,460.00.

83 Lens, Canon EF 5 EA $2,400.00 $12,000.00
/ 100-400mm f/4.5-
\ } 5.6L15 Il USM, Mfg

# 9524B002AA

84 Lens, Canon EOS 5 EA $1,948.00 $9,740.00
R7, 18-150mm
Lens, Image
Stabilization, Part
#5137C0089, As
Specified, NO
SUBSTITUTION

85 Lens, Canon RF 15- 5 EA $2,240.00 $11,200.00
3Smm f/2.8L 1S
1USM SKU: V

3682C002 Ultra-
Wide Zoom
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[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-40

Introduced-on:-————O\
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Line Item

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Manufacturer

(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

86

Lens, Canon RF 24-
70mm f/2.8L IS
USM: SKU:
3680C002,
Standard Zoom

EA

$2,397.00

$11,985.00

(Required)

87

Lens, Canon RF
100mm f/2.8L
Macro IS USM
SKU: 4514C002
Macro Lens

EA

$1,659.00

$8,295.00

88

Lens Cleaning Kit,
ProOptic Complete
Optics Care and
Cleaning Kit, SKU:
PROXCPK1, or
Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

Lens, Nikon 70-
300mm

10

EA

$340.00

$3,400.00

/90

Lens, Nikon AF
Micro Nikkor
60mm 1:2:8D

15

EA

$977.00

$14,655.00

91

Lens, Nikon AF-P
DX NIKKOR 18-
55mm f/3.5-5.6G
VR Lens

EA

$293.00

$1,465.00

92

Lens, Nikon AF-S
DX 18-140MM
Lens, f/3.5-5.6G
ED VR Lens

15

EA

$253.00

. $3,795.00

93

ced-on——ON
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[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD _ <
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-41

Line Item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost

Manufacturer

{Required)

Product Name
and/or No.
(Required)

Delivery, AR.O.

Comments

- 94 Measuring Scales EA No Bid No Bid
Forensic Kit,
Standard Photo
Scale Kit, SKU: A-
6600SK or Equal

95 Memory Card, Pro 15 EA $53.00 $795.00
Master Rugged
SDxC memory
card, waterproof,
64GB, Part #5421,
As Specified, NO
SUBSTITUTION

Wireless Remote
Control ML -L

96 Remote, Nikon 5 EA $44.00 $220.00
\,/

97 Remote Release S EA $35.00 $175.00
Cord, Nikon MC-
DC2 :

98 Replacement 15 EA $29.00 $435.00
: Panel for Built-in
\// Flash, Nikon SG -

31R

99 SanDisk Extreme 5 EA $93.00 $465.00
Pro CFexpress

Type B, 256GB, for
/ Canon EOS RS,

1V SKU:
0081792700305,
or Equal
Introduced on: October 15, 2025
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[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-42

Line [tem

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Manufacturer

(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.
(Required)

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

100

SanDisk Extreme
Pro UHS-II SDXC
V90, 128GB, for
Canon EOS RS,
SKU:
0619659170369
(UPC), or Equal

EA

$76.00

$380.00

101

SanDisk Extreme
PRO CFexpress
Card Reader, SKU:
SDCFE-0000-A46,
or Equal

EA

No Bid

No Bid

102

SD Card Reader,
Kingston
Mobilelite Plus

EA

No Bid

No Bid

103

Tripod, Manfrotto
190, Aluminum 4
Section
M190XPRO4-8H

EA

$310.00

$1,550.00

Tripod, Manfrotto
496RC2, Compact
Ball Head W/R2

EA

$173.00

$865.00

105

Tripod, Manfrotto

| MK290XTA3-

2WUS 290 Xtra
Aluminum with
128 RC Micro Fluid
Head and Quick
Release

EA

$393.00

$1,965.00

Introduced on:

October 15, 2025 -

AdoptefkqiR DATA

Page 22

e _ ‘NﬁP‘?N@?@OCUMENT REPORT
tetal Ko BYBTH GRAFRIE AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES



[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-43

Line ltem

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No 8id

Manufacturer

(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.
(Required)

Delivery, AR.O.

Comments

106

N

Tripod with Head,
Vanguard Alta Pro
263AGH 3 Section
Aluminum Tripod

with GH-100 Pistol
Grip Ball Head

15

EA

$292.00

$4,380.00

SECTION V - PHOTO PRINTERS AND SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

107

Customized
Laminates, User
Department will
provide

-| customized
information for
imprinting; Entrust
DuraGard
Laminate, 0.6 mil,
holo, Item
#508808-032, for
use with SLM-CLM
Desktop
Laminator, 350
Prints/ Roll

150

ROLL

$269.00

. $40,350.00

108

Entrust DuraGard
Laminate, 0.6 mil,
Holo, Item
#508808-032, for
Use with SLM-CLM
Desktop
Laminator, 350
Prints/Roll

100

ROLL

$269.00

$26,900.00
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: Res-Pg:1.2-44
[STAVR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD | |
_PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line item Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost Manufacturer  Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments
(Required) and/or No.
(Required)
115 Fujifilm 16393069 15 EA $85.00 $1,275.00 ) : ‘
/ Pink Ink Cartridge : ’
u 200m| for Fujifilm

Frontier-S DX100

116 Fujifilm DX100 S EA $2,975.00 $14,875.00
Smartlab Frontier-
S Inkjet Printer

117 Fujifilm Waste Ink 15 EA $141.00° $2,115.00
l// | Tank for Frontier-S
DX100 Printer
118 1D Cards, CR80 100 BX $69.00 $6,900.00

NOCO, CR-79/CR-
80 Compatible 1D
Cards, ltem #
54563 81754,
500/Box

SECTION VI - MISCELLANEQUS SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

119 Backpack, Tenba 5 EA $237.00 $1,185.00 : ,
Axis V2, 16L or
/ 20L, Rugged, Good
% ' Access Points, or
Equal : ' /

120 Canon 5 EA " $70.00 $350.00

/ - | Maintenance
|

Cartridge MC-31

121 Ink Cartridge, 5. EA $75.00 . $375.00
Canon PFI-120
v Matte Black,
130m|
Introduced on: October 15, 2025
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[STAR DATA COJ RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
“Bid No. TBD |
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-45

Line Item

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Manufacturer

(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.
{Required)

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

122

Ink Cartridge,
Canon PFI- 120
Black, 130ml

EA

$75.00

$375.00

123

Ink Cartridge,
Canon PFI-120
Cyan, 130ml

EA

$75.00

$375.00

124

Ink Cartridge,
Canon PFI-120
Magenta, 130ml

EA

$75.00

$375.00

125

Ink Cartridge,
Canon PFi-120
Yellow Ink
Cartridge, 130m!

EA

$75.00

$375.00

NTNTNTNTS

126

Mounting Board,
Crescent 8" x 10",
Single, White, Self-
Adhesive

1,000

"EA

$5.62

$5,620.00

L

127

Uline High-Tack
Adhesive Foam
Core Board - 24 x
36", 3/16" Thick

10

PKG

$88.00

$880.00

SECTION VII - DARKROOM SUPPLIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS

SPECIFIED OR EQUAL

N

128

Usl Roll
Laminating Film
27" W x 250' Lx
3.0 mil. Gauge
Gloss Finish

25

EA

$99.00

$2,475.00

SECTION VIl - PASSPORT PHOTO SYSTEM ACCESSORIES - ALL ITEMS ARE AS SPECIFIED OR EQUAL
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Res-Pg:1.2-46

' [STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD -
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line {tem Description Est. Qty. Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Cost No Bid Manufacturer  Product Name Delivery, A.R.O. Comments

{Required) and/or No.
{Reguired)

129 0.10 mil PVC 5 BX $83.00 $415.00
Plastic White '
Graphics Quality
Cards for use in
the DataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printer, 1000/Box

130 0.015 mil PVC 150 BX $80.00 $12,000.00
Plastic White . '

Graphics Quality
‘-\.,/ : Cards for use in
the DataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printer, 1000/Box

131 0.30 mil PVC 50 BX ’ $130.00 $6,500.00
Plastic White
Graphics Quality
Cards for use in
the DataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printer, 500/Box

132 Brady People ID 5 EA $344.00 $1,720.00

13928-1000 Blue '
Cloth Backdrop w/
Grommets -
Capture Photo ID
Background,
Product # 3928-
1000

Introduced on: October 15, 2025
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[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

- PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-47

Line item

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

Manufacturer

(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.
(Required)

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

133

Brady People
3943-1100 Photo
ID Equipment
Supplies, Hand
Held Punch-
3/16(SMM) Hole,
Minimum Order
Quantity

EA

$293.00

$1,465.00

134

Crocodile Clip with
Transparent Strap,
Fitted with Press
Stud Button,
Material,
Metal/PVC, ltem #
56200-0000, 100
Pieces/Box

50

PKG

$133.00

$6,650.00

135

Datacard YMCKF-
KT Color Ribbon
Kit P/N: 535000~
011, NO
EXCEPTIONS

50

PKG

$200.00

$10,000.00

136

DataCard YMCKT
Color Ribbon Kit -
Optimized for use
with DataCard

Entrust Sigma

Printers

200

© PKG

$95.00

$19,000.00

137

v

DataCard YMCKT-
KT Color Ribbon
Kit Optimized for
use with DataCard
Entrust Sigma
Printers

50

PKG

$200.00

$10,000.00
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[STAR DATA COJ] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Res-Pg:1.2-48

Line Item

Description

Est. Qty.

Unit of Measure

Unit Cost

Total Cost

No Bid

Manufacturer

(Required)

Product Name
and/or No.
(Required)

Delivery, A.R.O.

Comments

138

Datacard Color
Ribbon, YMCKT-KT
Compatible with
CD80O, item #
535000-006, NO
EXCEPTIONS

50

PG

$199.00

'$9,950.00

139

Datacard Color
Ribbon, YMCKT-KT
Compatible with
CD80Q, Item
#535000-005, NO
EXCEPTIONS

50

PKG

$244.00

$12,200.00

140

N

Steel Split Ring, 1
3/16" (30mm}
Nickel-Plated
Heat-Treated,
1000/Pack

PKG

$88.00

$440.00

‘ /’141 '
y

Table Top Passport
ID Photo Die
Cutter Punch, 2" x
"

EA

$80.00

$400.00
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- Res-Pg:1.2-49

[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PHOTOGRAPHIC, AUDIO AND VISUAL EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLIES

Line Item Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments

Measure

' 142 Discount Percentage {%) for Photographic, Audio and Visual Equipment and % 34% .
Supplies (NOT LESS THAN]), As Specified
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