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Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director Frank Sadeghi

Deputy Director Jennifier Bacchione
Commissioner Robert S. Arace
Commissioner Sam Ellenbogen

Commissioner Ray Gormley

Board Meeting Agenda
Date:

Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

January 21, 2026 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding a Contract for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND
MAINTENANCE FOR ENGINEERING NO. Il to K. Moorea Co LLC dba Traffic Plan, the sole qualified bidder.

No bids were received on ltem Nos. 1, 2,4, 5,7, 12, 13, 15, 16, 17,

rebid. ltem No. 26 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors. (B2026-

18, 19, 20, 21, 23 and 24. They will be
01)

Official Resolution# [2026000043
Meeting Date 01/21/2026
Introduced Date 01/21/2026
Adopted Date 01/21/2026
Agenda ltem j-1

CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2026-01
Result Adopted
cowry _ Tal, T8 T [
COMMISSIONER & % % %ﬁ % % %
Sadeghi v v
Bacchione v v |v
Arace v v v
Ellenbogen v v
Gormley v v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

WMichate |, Guathar”

Clerk Of The Board
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Adopted on:
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PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE ON AtReS-PQ:]."

o, D202 -0\

RESOLUTION
January 21, 2026

WHEREAS, on December 9, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements
therefor, sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of EQUIPMENT
PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR ENGINEERING NO. II for the County
of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, one (1) response was received from the

following bidder:

Name of Bidder Address of Bidder

K. Moorea Co LLC 5300 Asbury Road

dba Traffic Plan Farmingdale, NJ 07727

(732) 984-1697
; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County
Purchasing Agent has now recommended to this Board that the sole qualified bid,
according to specifications, namely that of, K. MOOREA CO LLC DBA TRAFFIC PLAN,
be accepted. No bids were received on Item Nos. 1, 2, 4, 5,7, 12, 13, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19,
20,21, 23 and 24. They will be rebid. Item No. 26 will be rebid to obtain additional vendors.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, as
follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and directed
to enter into a contract for the furnishing and delivery of Equipment Parts, Repairs and
Maintenance for Engineering No. II for the County of Ocean, for the contract period of one
(1) year from January 21, 2026 through January 20, 2027, or until delivery is complete
unless otherwise stated. The County reserves the right to extend the term of the contract

pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. K. MOOREA CO LLC DBA TRAFFIC PLAN for ten (10) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 3,6, 8,9, 10, 11, 14, 22, 25 and 26.
This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System
Participants, Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Pursuant to N.J.A.C. 5:30-5.4, the County has established a reasonable
estimated maximum dollar value of $50,000.00 for the term of this contract, based on
historical procurement data for comparable goods or services. The County further reserves
the right to increase quantities by up to twenty percent (20%) of the maximum awarded

amount at the unit prices bid, in accordance with N.J.A.C. 5:30-11.3.

January 21, 2026
January 21, 2026
on#: 2026000043
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3. Funds for the materials or services described herein shall be made
available through operating and expense (O&E) accounts, trust accounts, grant accounts,
or capital accounts maintained by, but not limited to, the following departments:

Engineering Department.

4. Payments for the materials and services to be acquired by these contracts
shall be made upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in
accordance with the requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board
of Commissioners customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a
Purchase Order issued by the Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery

locations and needed quantities shall be indicated.

5. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices

and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2026-01.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall
be made available to the County Auditor, Purchasing Department, Finance Department,
Engineering Department and K. Moorea LLC dba Traffic Plan, the successful bidder.

Introduced on: January 21, 2026
Adopted on: January 21, 2026
Official Resolutipn#: 2026000043
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[K. MOOREA CO. LLC D/B/A TRAFFIC PLAN] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR ENGINEERING NO. I

SECTION | - MAINTENANCE ON VARIOUS TYPES OF EQUIPMENT

Line Item Description 1 Year Unit of Unit Cost Total No Bid Comments:
Estimated Measure
Quantity

1 Annual Preventative Maintenance, As Specified . EA No Bid No Bid X

2 Annual Electrical Inspection, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X

American Signal Compliterized LED Variable Message Board Sign #CMS-T333'

V3 Annual Preventative Maintenance, As Specified 6 EA $1,062.00 | $6,372.00

Kubqta,_bles"el. Motor, 3—(,ycle A

FVRS

4 Annual Preventative Maintenance, As Specified EA No Bid

M;;rk Rite‘Uhequulpr‘r‘léntth‘).q.-'!_;Wlﬁ.vl",,(')foo lbs.fhérh\o Plastic Pre—Mel‘ting.}Ke'ttIe”Syst'er.rnl_ 1500 N

5 Annual Preventative Maintenance, As Specified EA No Bid

Precislon. Solar ‘(,fdhtrals;lr‘ic;ﬁ-"Ml‘h»l Varjable M§§§é’3_e Bo

s Bl iy

/ 6 Annual Preventative Maintenance, As Specified 1 EA $1,062.00 | $1,062.00

EA No Bid No Bid X

$1,062.00 | $2,124.00

Intro :

duced-oni——January 24,2026
Adoptfé SADOREA CQarludnDZB/20Z8 AFFIC PLAN] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Officigi Resplytiopka E202GIRRG43 REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR ENGINEERING NO. II
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Res-Pg:j.1-5
[K. MOOREA CO. LLC D/B/A TRAFFIC PLAN] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR ENGINEERING NO. Il

1 Year Unit of Unit Cost No Bid Comments:
Estimated Measure
Quantity

Line Item Description

$1,062.00 | $2,124.00

Annual Preventative Maintenance, As Specified

Annual Preventative Maintenance, As Specified 1 EA $1,062.00 | $1,062.00

v 11 Annual Preventative Maintenance, As Specified 2 EA $1,062.00 | $2,124.00

St - Auger, Kadel #8T120C

12 Annual Preventative Maintenance, As Specified EA No Bid No Bid X

SECTION Il - HOURLY LABOR RATE FOR VARIOUS ENGINEERING EQUIPMENT

Line item Description 1 Year Unit of Unit Cost Total Comments:
Estimated Measure
Quantity
13 Air Tech Equipment, Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
\// 14 American Signal, Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate 75 HR $165.00 | $12,375.00
15 DCS, Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No 8id X
16 Fine Line Industries, Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
17 Graco Equipment, Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
18 Honda Generators, Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
19 Kubota, Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
20 Mark Rite Line Equipment, Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
Introduredom———January 2172026

Adoptq omOOREA GRNUEEYTYBLAZERAFFIC PLAN] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
OfficiabResolufinphy 2R36PRPIE REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR ENGINEERING NO. II
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Res-Pg:j.1-6
[K. MOOREA CO. LLC D/B/A TRAFFIC PLAN] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
EQUIPMENT PARTS, REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR ENGINEERING NO. II

Line item Description 1 Year Unit of Unit Cost No 8id Comments:
Estimated Measure
Quantity
21 Mark Il Equipment, Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
\// 22 Precision Solar Controls Equipment, Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate 75 HR $165.00 $12,375.00
23 Skydritl Equipment, Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate RR No Bid No Bid X
24 Smith Manufacturing, Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate HR No Bid No Bid X
\// 25 Solar Technology Equipment, Repair Service - Hourly Labor Rate 75 HR $165.00 | $12,375.00

SECTION Il - PARTS - DISCOUNT % FOR ITEMS 1 - 25

Bidders MUST bid on this item to be considered for award of any items on this bid. Parts needed for preventative maintenance items
#1-12 will use this line item.

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Unit Cost Discount Total Comments: Delivery,
Measure (%) A.R.O.

Enter your discount percentage in the "DISCOUNT % COLUMN?". For bid purposes $67,500.00
assume parts at $75,000.00 for a one {1) year term.

Introduced on: ____January 21 2026
Adoptd oMOOREA GRnUbEyRABZAZERAFFIC PLAN] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

OfficialgResqlpfion 2RACRAAPHS REPAIRS AND MAINTENANCE FOR ENGINEERING NO. I
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