Res-Pg:m.19-1

Ocean County Board of Commissioners

OFFICE OF THE
OCEAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

Director John P. Kelly
Deputy Director Frank Sadeghi
Commissioner Robert S. Arace
Commissioner Jennifier Bacchione
Commissioner Virginia E. Haines
Board Meeting Agenda
Date:

Location:

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, New Jersey
08754-2191

(732)929-2005
(732)505-1918

April 2, 2025 - 4:00 PM

Administration Building
Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue
Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Awarding Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of PRINTER CARTRIDGES to B2B Supplies USA,
LLC dba Printing Supplies USA, LLC; Central Jersey Office Equipment dba State Toner; GCS Imaging, Inc.;
Star Data Products and The Tree House, Inc. dba The Supply Branch, Inc., the lowest qualified bidders.

(B2025-35)

Official Resolution# |2025000420
Meeting Date 04/02/2025
Introduced Date 04/02/2025
Adopted Date 04/02/2025
Agenda ltem m-19
CAF #

Purchase Req. # B2025-35
Result Adopted
COMMISSIONER § a g gi ﬁ % %
Kelly v v
Sadeghi v v
Arace v v v
Bacchione v v v
Haines v

| HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS
RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS, NJ AT THE MEETING

REFERENCED THEREON

Michaie . Guainer”

Clerk Of The Board



Introduced on
Adopted on:
Official Resoly

County of Ocean; and

following bidders:
Name and Address of Bidder

B2B Supplies USA LLC dba
Printing Supplies USA LLC
10 Schalks Crossing Road

o B2035-35

CONTRACT NO. MUST BE
PAPERS, DOCUMENTS, INVOICES, VOUCHERS

RESOLUTION
April 2, 2025

WHEREAS, on February 11, 2025, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor,
sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of PRINTER CARTRIDGES for the

WHEREAS, at the advertised time, responses were received from the

Name and Address of Bidder

Central Jersey Office Equipment
dba State Toner
2 Howell Road

Suite 501A-301
Plainsboro, NJ 08536
(609) 799-3800

Freehold, NJ 07728
(833) 446-8872

Star Data Products
1245 Hewlett Plaza
Hewlett, NY 11557
(201) 565-9876

GCS Imaging, Inc.
217 Hergesell Avenue
Maywood, NJ 07607
(201) 365-6101

CVR

1606 S. Bowling Green Dr.
Cherry Hill, NJ 08003
(856) 857-0355

The Tree House, Inc.

dba The Supply Branch, Inc.
40 Prospect Avenue
Norwood, MA 02062

(800) 595-6651

Office Basics, Inc.
22 Creek Circle
Boothwyn, PA 19061
(610) 471-1000

Rasix Computer Center, Inc dba
Academic Supplier

3519 Main Street-Suite 401
Chula Vista, CA 91911

(800) 266-2892

Staples Contract & Commercial, LLC
500 Staples Drive

Framingham, MA 01702

(407) 475-4434

JTF Business Systems
7370 Steel Mill Drive

Springfield, VA 22150
(703) 658-2000

W.B. Mason Co., Inc.
59 Centre St.
Brockton, MA 02301
(888) 926-2766

Tech Advanced Computers, Inc.
1508 Creighton Road
Pensacola, Florida 32504

(850) 221-0382

; and

WHEREAS, after the receipt and examination of same, the County Purchasing
Agent has now recommended to this Board that the lowest qualified bids, according to
specifications, in each instance, be accepted, namely, B2B SUPPLIES USA LLC DBA
PRINTING SUPPLIES USA, LLC; CENTRAL JERSEY OFFICE EQUIPMENT DBA
STATE TONER; GCS IMAGING, INC.; STAR DATA PRODUCTS and THE TREE
HOUSE, INC., DBA THE SUPPLY BRANCH, INC.

April 2, 2025
April 2, 2025
ton#: 2025000420




Res-Pg:m.19-3
BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 2 APRIL 2, 20

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the BOARD OF
COMMISSIONERS of the COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY as follows:

1. The Director and Clerk of this Board are hereby authorized and
directed to enter into contracts, accepting bids for the furnishing of Printer Cartridges for the
County of Ocean, for the contract period from date of award through May 1, 2025 through
April 30, 2027, or until delivery is complete unless otherwise stated. The County reserves

the right to extend the term of the contract pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A:11-15.

A. B2B SUPPLIES USA, LLC DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA, LLC for one
hundred, eleven (111) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 79, 80, 81, 82, 83, 84, 85, 86, 87, 88, 89, 90, 91, 92, 93, 94, 95, 96, 97, 98, 99,
100, 101, 102, 103, 104, 105, 106, 107, 108, 109, 110,111, 112, 113, 114, 115, 116, 117, 118,
119, 120, 121, 122, 123, 124, 125, 126, 127, 128, 129, 130, 131, 132, 133, 134, 135, 136, 137,
138,139, 140, 141, 142, 143, 144, 145, 146, 147, 148, 149, 150, 151, 152, 153, 154, 155, 156,
157,158,159, 160, 161, 162, 163, 164, 165, 166, 167, 168, 169, 170, 171, 172,173,174, 175,
176,177,178, 179, 180, 181, 182, 183, 184, 185, 186, 187, 188 and 209
For a Total Lump Sum Award Section E (Item Nos. 79 - 188) of $667,011.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

B. CENTRAL JERSEY OFFICE EQUIPMENT DBA STATE TONER fin‘ four (4)
items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 189, 190, 191 and 192.
Tor a Total Lump Sum Award Section F (Item Nos. 189 - 192) of $5,000.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

C. GCS IMAGING, INC. for sixteen (16) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 4, 5, 6, 7, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 77 and 78.
For a Total Lump Sum Section B (Item Nos. 4 - 17) of $9,040.30.
For a Total Lump Sum Award Section D (Item Nos. 77 - 78) of $3,560.40.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,

Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

D. STAR DATA PRODUCTS for twenty-two (22) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 193, 194, 195, 196, 197, 198, 199, 200, 201, 202, 203, 204, 205, 206, 207, 208,
210,211,212, 213,214 and 215.
For a Total Lump Sum Award Section G (Item Nos. 193-201) of $20,830.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

Introduced on: April 2, 2025
Adopted on: April 2, 2025
Official Resolutibn#: 2025000420




Res-Pg:m.19-4

BID AWARD RESOLUTION PAGE 3 APRIL 2, 2025

E. THE TREE HOUSE, INC., DBA THE SUPPLY BRANCH, INC. for sixty-two
(62) items, to wit:
ITEM NOS. 1, 2, 3, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36,
37,38, 39,40,41,42, 43, 44, 45, 46, 47, 48, 49, 50, 51, 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 60, 61,
62, 63, 64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75 and 76. |
For a Total Lump Sum Award Section A (Item Nos. 1 - 3) of $1,107.00.
For a Total Lump Sum Section C (Item Nos. 18 - 76) of $161,252.00.

This vendor has extended this contract to County Cooperative Contract System Participants,
Identifier No. CK-02-OC.

2. Payments for the materials to be acquired by this contract shall be made
upon the approval of vouchers submitted by the successful bidders in accordance with the
requirements of the Board of Commissioners and subject to the Board of Commissioners
customary procedures. Delivery shall be made upon receipt of a Purchase Order issued by the
Ocean County Department of Purchase, upon which delivery locations and needed quantities

shall be indicated.

3. Funds for the materials shall be available within the following funding

Sources: Purchasing O.E.

4. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and

vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2025-35.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be
made available to the County Auditor, Department of Purchasing, Department of Finance and
the successful bidders.

Introduced on April 2, 2025
Adopted on: April 2, 2025
Official Resolytjon#: 2025000420




[CENTRAL JERSEY OFFICE EQUIPMENT] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Res-Pg:m.19-5

Line [tem

Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.
180 W2113A - 100 EA $59.00 $5,900.00
Magenta (HP
206A)
181 W2120X - ({High 90 EA $190.00 $17,100.00
Yield: Black)
182 W2121X - (High 55 _EA $270.00 $14,850.00
Yield: Cyan)
-183 W2122X - (High S5 EA $270.00 $14,850.00
Yield: Yellow)
184 W2123X - (High 55 EA $270.00 $14,850.00
Yield: Magenta)
185 W2310A - Black 10 EA $40.00 $400.00
186 W2311A - Cyan 10 EA $42.00 $420.00
187 W2312A - 10 EA $42.00 $420.00
Yellow
188 W2313A - 10 EA $42.00 $420.00
Magenta
TOTAL $720,231.50

Line Item

SECTION F - HEWLETT PACKARD - PAGEWIDE PRINTER CARTRIDGES (NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Description

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Price

Total Price

Comments

Mfr./Pkg.

Delivery, A.R.O.

‘ / 189 FET84AN - Black 20 EA $100.00 $2,000.00
(W (HP 972X) .
L’ 190 LOR98AN - Cyan 10 EA $100.00 $1,000.00
Y {HP 972X)
Introduc i H2:
Adopted nENTRAL JBRoiEe,26B5CE EQUIPMENT] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Res@lupiomiT 2RZSARRMDGES

Page 22



Res-Pg:m.19-6
[CENTRAL JERSEY OFFICE EQUIPMENT] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg. Delivery, A.R.O.
/ 191 LOSO1AN - 10 EA $100.00 $1,000.00
Magenta (HP
v 972X)
. 7
/ 192 LOSO4AN - 10 EA $100.00 $1,000.00
\ Yellow (HP
972X}
TOTAL $5,000.00

SECTION G - BROTHER {NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price No Bid Comments Mfr./Pkg. Delivery, A.R.O.
193 TN 350 - Black EA No Bid No Bid X
194 TN 430 - Black EA No Bid No Bid X
195 TN 450 - High EA No Bid No Bid X

Yield Black
196 TN 460 - Black EA No Bid No Bid X
197 TN 720 - Black EA No Bid No Bid X
198 DR-350- Drum - EA No Bid No Bid X
Kit
199 DR-400 - Drum EA No Bid No Bid X
Kit
200 DR-420 - Drum EA No Bid No Bid X
Kit
201 DR-720- Drum EA No Bid No Bid X
: Kit

Introduced-eri———April-2, 2026
Adopted JRENTRAL JRBSEY, @928CE EQUIPMENT] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official Regglutpqki TEREMFRIDGES
Page 23




[GCS IMAGING INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Res-Pg:m.19-7

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.
1 CL 241 - Color 20 EA $22.43 $448.60
2 PG 240XL - Black 20 EA $54.02 $1,080.40
3 PGl 35 - Black 10 EA $14.40 $144.00
TOTAL $1,673.00

Line Item

Description

EPST676X1120 -
Black

Quantity
20

SECTION B - INKJET CARTRIDGES - EPSON (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Unit of Measure

EA

Unit Price

$37.02

Total Price

$740.40

Comments

Mfr./Pkg

Delivery, AR.O.

EPS T676XL220 -
Cyan

20

EA

$23.80

$476.00

EPS T676XL320 -
Magenta

20

EA

$23.80

$476.00

EPS T676XL420 -
Yellow

20

EA

$23.80

$476.00

Epson 502, (3-
Pack: CMY
Bottles)
(T502520-S)

30

EA

$37.69

$1,130.70

Epson 502,
Black (T502120-
s)

40

EA

$18.43

$737.20

10

Epson 502, Cyan
(T502220-5)

20

EA

$12.57

$251.40

Introduced-on:

Alnril 2.2025

Adopted fBCS I_MAGIAIﬁi’iII‘QQ%SPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official RgsglupRiifr AR 2ARMADGES

Page 7



Res-Pg:m.19-8
[GCS IMAGING INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Iltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, AR.O.
11 Epson 502, 20 EA $12.57 $251.40
V/ Magenta
{T502320-S)
12 Epson 502, 20 EA $12.57 $251.40
\4/ Yellow
(T502420-5)
/ 13 Epson T542, 40 EA $27.66 $1,106.40
v Black Ink Bottle
/ 14 Epson T542, 20 EA $20.96 $419.20
\
Cyan Ink Bottle
/‘ 15 Epson T542, 20 EA $20.96 $419.20
\ Magenta Ink
Bottle
\/ 16 Epson T542, 20 EA $20.96 $419.20
. Yellow Ink Bottle
/ 17 |EpsonTS42, (3- 30 EA $62.86 $1,885.80
v - Pack: CMY
Bottles)
TOTAL . $9,040.30

SECTION C - INKJIET CARTRIDGES AND VALUE PACKS - HEWLETT PACKARD (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.

18 3JAODAN#140 - 150 EA $35.88 $5,382.00
: Cyan (HP 962XL)

19 3JAO1AN#140 - 130 EA $35.88 $4,664.40
Magenta (HP
962XL)

Introduced on: April 2, 2025
Adopted ¢GCS IMAGMGIIREIRESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official RegglutinniiTeleedfitces

Page 8




[GCS IMAGING INC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Res-Pg:m.19-9

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, AR.O.
75 T6M14AN (HP 10 EA $44.65 $446.50
902XL) - Black
76 X4EO7AN - (4- EA No Bid No Bid X
Pack: CMYK) (HP
952)
TOTAL $154,266.30

SECTION D - LASER — TONER CARTRIDGES - CANON (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.
v 77 120 - Black 20 EA $84.00 $1,680.00
/
‘/ 78 128 - Black 20 EA $94.02 $1,880.40
TOTAL $3,560.40

SECTION E - LASER — TONER CARTRIDGES - HEWLETT PACKARD (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.

C4129X - Black EA No Bid No 8id X
(HP 29X)

80 C4182X - Black 4 EA $60.00 $240.00
(HP 8150)

81 C8061X - Black EA No Bid No Bid X
(HP 61X)

82 C9720A - Black EA No Bid No Bid X

83 C9721A - Cyan 4 EA $95.00 $380.00

Introduced on: April 2, 2025

Adopted JiGCS |MAGAREI AN@IHESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Resojutigadir3 2 RRHoGES

Page 14



. Res-Pg:m.19-10
[B2B SUPPLIES USA LLC DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price No Bid Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.

75 T6M14AN (HP
902XL) - Black
76 X4EO7AN - (4~ EA No 8id No Bid X
Pack: CMYK) {(HP
952)
TOTAL $0.00

SECTION D - LASER — TONER CARTRIDGES - CANON (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.
77 120 - Black EA No Bid No Bid X
78 128 - Black EA No Bid No Bid X
TOTAL . $0.00

SECTION E - LASER — TONER CARTRIDGES - HEWLETT PACKARD (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price No Bid Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.
/ 79 C4129X - Black 20 EA $5.00 $100.00
V/ {HP 29X)
/ 80 C4182X - Black 4 EA $5.00 $20.00
v (HP 8150) *
7
/ 81 C8061X - Black 4 EA $5.00 $20.00
v (HP 61X)
Pl
\,/ 82 C9720A - Black 4 EA $5.00 $20.00
/.
\,/ 83 C9721A - Cyan 4 EA $5.00 $20.00

Introduced-on

Adopted 38 SUPPLIERGHEA, bbGeDBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC) RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official BR$OIRRI¥ERGRRIPBGES :
Page 14




Res-Pg:m.19-11
[B2B SUPPLIES USA LLC DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.

v/ 84 C9722A - Yellow 4 EA $5.00 $20.00
/ 85 C9723A- 4 EA $5.00 $20.00
Vv Magenta
7/
v/ 86 CB400A - Black 4 EA $40.00 $160.00
ya
v/ 87 CB401A-Cyan 4 EA $40.00 $160.00
b
‘// 88 CB402A - Yellow 4 EA $40.00 $160.00
ya
89 CB403A - 4 EA $40.00 $160.00
Vi Magenta
/
v 90 CC364A - Black 10 EA $115.00 $1,150.00
/.
v// 91 CC530A - Black 40 EA $99.00 $3,960.00
v 92 CC531A-Cyan 40 EA $97.00 $3,880.00
/
v 93 CC532A - Yellow 40 EA $97.00 $3,880.00
4 94 CC533A- 40 EA $97.00 $3,880.00
V] Magenta
ya
V/ 95 CE90X - Black 70 EA $174.00 $12,180.00
{High Yield)
/
\/ 9 CE255A - Black 30 EA $90.00 $2,700.00
/ 97 CE255X - Black 30 EA $134.00 $4,020.00
V (High Yield)
\‘/ o8 CE390A - Black 4 EA $104.00 $416.00
\/ 99 CE400A - Black 20 EA $93.00 $1,860.00
/
\/ 100 CE401A - Cyan 10 EA $139.00 $1,390.00

Introdueed-on* Apri 2, 2025
AdoptelBa® SUPPLIER b/ 463DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official fRgsoRRINFE RROAFIPRABGES
Page 15



Res-Pg:m.19-12
[B2B SUPPLIES USA LLC DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.
. 101 CE402A - Yellow 10 EA $139.00 $1,390.00
/ 102 CE403A - 10 ] EA $139.00 $1,390.00
V Magenta
4
V/ 103 CE410A - Black 50 EA $55.00 $2,750.00
£
V/ 104 CE411A - Cyan 50 EA $78.00 $3,900.00
/
V/ 105 CE412A - Yellow 50 EA $78.00 $3,900.00
£
/ 106 CE413A - S0 EA $78.00 $3,900.00
Vi Magenta )
/
V/ 107 CE505A - Black 30 EA $51.00 $1,530.00
/ 108 CES05X - Black 10 EA $100.00 $1,000.00
v (High Yield)
/
V/ 108 CE740A - Black 50 EA $100.00 $5,000.00
/
\// 110 CE741A - Cyan 30 EA $40.00 $1,200.00
/
\,/ 111 CE742A - Yellow 230 EA $40.00 $9,200.00
/ ~112 CE743A- 230 EA $40.00 $9,200.00
vV / Magenta
V/ 113 CF226A - Black 30 EA $71.00 $2,130.00
/
\/ 114 CF230A - Black 150 EA $57.00 $8,550.00
/ 115 CF230X - Black 80 EA $83.00 $6,640.00
\ (High Yield)
/[
\/ 116 CF232A - Black 70 EA $83.00 $5,810.00
/ : :
v/ 117 CF237A - Black 80 EA $147.00 $11,760.00
Introduced-on: Apnl2, 2025

Adopted [82B S_UPPLIEErIBBAZOBE DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Rgzplusief#re025RMRB GES
Page 16



Res-Pg:m.19-13
[B2B SUPPLIES USA LLC DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.

CF237X - Black 50 EA $230.00 $il,500.00
v (High Yield) ,
V/ 119 CF258A - Black 40 EA $82.00 $3,280.00
;
- 120 CF281A - Black 80 " EA $149.00 $11,920.00
\
/ 121 CF281X - Black 50 EA $244.00 $12,200.00
v (High Yield)
pa
/ 122 CF287X - Black 40 EA $251.00 $10,040.00
M (High Yield)
/ 123 HP89X (CF289X) 10 EA $194.00 $1,940.00
v - Original High
/ Yield - Black
V/ 124 CF360A - Black 70 EA $135.00 $9,450.00
/ 125 CF360X - Black 90 EA $187.00 $16,830.00
Vv (High Yield)
> A
V/ 126 CF361A - Cyan 40 EA $168.00 $6,720.00
/
/ 127 CF361X - Cyan 70 EA $257.00 $17,990.00
Y {High Yield)
/
/ 128 CF362A - Yellow 40 EA $168.00 $6,720.00
\Y
129 CF362X - Yeliow 70 EA $257.00 $17,990.00
(v
(High Yield)
P
“/ 130 CF363A - 40 EA $168.00 $6,720.00
Magenta
131 CF363X - 70 EA $257.00 $17,990.00
AV, Magenta (High
Yield}

Introduced-en:——April-2,-2625—
Adopted B32B SUPPLIESrYS/0b0E DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official RgrpLUBRINTI0250RTHADGES
Page 17




Res-Pg:m.19-14

[B2B SUPPLIES USA LLC DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CAR

TRIDGES

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.
v/ 132 CF410A - Black 40 EA $78.00 $3,120.00 .
/ 133 CF410X - Black 30 EA $128.00 $3,840.00
v (High Yield)
134 CF410XD - (2- 30 EA $254.00 $7,620.00
v/ Pack: High Yield
Black)
7/
v 135 CF411A - Cyan 30 EA $100.00 $3,000.00
/ 136 CF411X - Cyan 30 EA $169.00 $5,070.00
\ {High Yield)
/
\‘/ 137 CF412A- Yellow 30 EA $100.00 $3,000.00
/ 138 CF412X - Yellow 30 EA $169.00 $5,070.00
\V (High Yield)
/ 139 CF413A- 30 EA $100.00 $3,000.00
“ Magenta
/ 140 CF413X - 30 EA $169.00 $5,070.00
v Magenta (High
Yield)
y
/ 141 CF450A - Black 30 EA $178.00 $5,340.00
U {HP 655A)
/ 142 CF451A - Cyan 30 EA $220.00 $6,600.00
AV (HP 655A)
/ 143 CF452A - Yellow 30 EA $220.00 $6,600.00
v {HP 655A)
144 CF453A - 30 EA $220.00 $6,600.00
v Magenta (HP
655A)

Introdu : i2;
Adopted(BRB SUPPLIEM&,\MDBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official Rggalption-EROZAFORRIGES

Page 18



: Res-Pg:m.19-15
[B2B SUPPLIES USA LLC DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT :
Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price No Bid Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.

145 CF460X - {High 30 EA $275.00 $8,250.00
/ Yield: Black) {HP
v 656X)

4 E

/ 146 CF461X - (High 30 EA $386.00 $11,580.00
Yield: Cyan) {(HP

656X)

/ 147 CF462X - (High 30 EA $386.00 $11,580.00
Yield: Yellow)
(HP 656X)

/ 148 CF463X - (High 30 EA $386.00 $11,580.00
Yield: Magenta)
{HP 656X}

149 CFSO00A - Black 20 EA $56.00 $1,120.00

150 CF500X - {High 100 EA $82.00 $8,200.00
Yield: Black} (HP
202X)

151 CFSO1A - Cyan 20 EA $66.00 $1,320.00

152 CF501X - (High 100 EA $86.00 $8,600.00
Yield: Cyan) (HP :
202X)

153 CF502A - Yellow 20 EA $66.00 $1,320.00

154 CF502X - (High 100 EA $86.00 $8,600.00
Yield: Yellow)
(HP 202X)

\
SN SN S AN

155 CF503A- 20 EA $66.00 - $1,320.00
Magenta

Introdu

Adopted(BaB .SUPPLIgHSd:\m,ﬂ;DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official RpgalpReNERIZAFIOIAIGES

Page 19




Res-Pg:m.19-16
[B2B SUPPLIES USA LLC DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.

156 CF503X - {High 100 EA $86.00 $8,600.00
Yield: Magenta)
{(HP 202X)

157 Q2612A - Black 10 EA $53.00 $530.00
(HP 12A)

V4
/ 158 Q7551A / 51A- 10 EA $40.00 $400.00
e

\u Black
159 Q7553X /53X - 10 EA $143.00 $1,430.00

\ Black
V 160 W1120A - Black 10 EA ) $209.00 | $2,0%0.00
N 161 W2020A Black 120 EA $75.00 $9,000.00

ra
/ 162 W2020X (High 180 EA - $148.00 $26,640.00
\V Yield: Black)
/

v/ 163 W2021A Cyan 100 EA $96.00 $9,600.00

164 W2021X - (High 150 EA $200.00 $30,000.00
Yield: Cyan)

165 W2022A Yellow 90 EA $96.00 $8,640.00

166 W2022X - (High 150 EA $200.00 $30,000.00
Yield: Yellow)

<

<

Magenta

168 W2023X - (High 100 EA $200.00 $20,000.00
Yield: Magenta)

/

/,

/ 167 W2023A 100 EA $96.00 $9,600.00
/

/

169 W2060A - Black 10 EA $51.00 $510.00

Introdueed-en————April-2,-2025
AdoptedfodB SUPPLIERPASA, Ro26DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Official BrpolBRHE REZBRTIILGES
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Res-Pg:m.19-17
[B2B SUPPLIES USA LLC DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.

\ 170 W2061A - Cyan 10 EA $55.00 $550.00

/ 171 W2062A - 10 EA $55.00 $550.00
Yellow

\ / 172 W2063A - 10 EA $55.00 $550.00
Magenta

173 W2100A - HP 10 EA $94.00 $940.00
/ 210A, Black,
Original LaserJet
Toner Cartridge,
NO
SUBSTITUTIONS

174 W2101A - HP 10 EA $112.00 $1,120.00
/ 210A, Cyan,

Original LaserJet
Toner Cartridge

\/l 175 W2102A - HP 10 EA $112.00 $1,120.00
210A, Yellow,

Original LaserJet

Toner Cartridge

/ 176 W2103A -HP 10 EA $112.00 $1,120.00
\/ 210A, Magenta,
Original LaserJet
Toner Cartridge

/ 177 W2110A - Black 100 EA $60.00 $6,000.00
(HP 206A)

4 178 W2111A - Cyan 100 EA $69.00 $6,900.00
{HP 206A)

179 W2112A - 100 EA $69.00 $6,900.00
Yellow (HP
206A)

Introdu :

ced-on—Apri 22026
Adopted®2B SUPPLIESpHSA R0E5DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Official BpsolpHAu#E Re2RATRIBAGES
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Res-Pg:m.19-18
(B2B SUPPLIES USA LLC DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC]} RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.

W2113A- $6,900.00

<
N

Magenta (HP
206A)
/ 181 W2120X - {{High 90 EA $209.00 $18,810.00
\ Yield: Black)
182 W2121X - {High 55 EA $293.00 $16,115.00
q/ Yield: Cyan)
/ 183 W2122X - (High 55 EA $293.00 $16,115.00
v Yield: Yellow)
/ 184 W2123X - (High 55 EA $293.00 $16,115.00
\ Yield: Magenta}
/
V/ 185 W2310A - Black 10 EA $49.00 $490.00
\4[ 186 W2311A - Cyan 10 EA $52.00 $520.00
P .
/ 187 W2312A - 10 EA $52.00 $520.00
v Yellow
/ 188 W2313A - 10 EA $52.00 $520.00
v Magenta
TOTAL $667,011.00

SECTION F - HEWLETT PACKARD - PAGEWIDE PRINTER CARTRIDGES (NO SUBSTITUTIONS

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg. Delivery, A.R.O.
189 F6T84AN - Black EA No Bid No 8id X
(HP 972X)
190 LOR98AN - Cyan EA No Bid No Bid X
{HP 972X}

Introdu :

eed-or——April-2,2025
AdoptedBAB SUPPLIEpHFA 2b25DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Res-Pg:m.19-19
[B2B SUPPLIES USA LLC DBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg. Delivery, A.R.O.
TOTAL $0.00

SECTION H - NEW ITEMS

Line item Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments
Measure
202 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Brother — Discount Off the Current List Price % No Bid X
203 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Canon - Inklet and Value Packs - Discount Off % No Bid X

the Current List Price

204 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Canon - Laser Toner Cartridges - Discount Off % No Bid X
the Current List Price

205 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Dell - Laser Toner Cartridges - Discount Off the % No Bid X
Current List Price

206 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Epson - InkJet and Value Packs - Discount Off % No Bid X
the Current List Price

207 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Hewlett Packard - Inklet/Deskjet and Value % No Bid X
Packs - Discount Off the Current List Price

208 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Hewlett Packard - Printhead Cartridges - % No Bid X
Discount Off the Current List Price

s 209 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Hewlett Packard — Laser Toner Cartridges - % 47%
v Discount Off the Current List Price
210 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Konica Minolta — Discount Off the Current List % No Bid X
Price
Introducedorm; Aprit2,2025
Adopteﬁg@ UPPLIERAPA bgoddBA PRINTING SUPPLIES USA LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Res-Pg:m.19-20
[STAR DATA CO] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg. Delivery, AR.O.

191 LOSO1AN - 10 EA $135.00 $1,350.00
Magenta (HP
972X)
192 LOSO4AN - 10 EA $135.00 $1,350.00
Yellow (HP
972X)
TOTAL $6,810.00

SECTION G - BROTHER (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg. Delivery, A.R.O.
v 193 TN 350 - Black 20 EA $60.00 $1,200.00
o~
‘/ 194 TN 430 - Black 30 EA $54.00 $1,620.00
v/ 195 TN 450 - High 30 EA $48.00 $1,440.00
Yield Black
‘/ 196 TN 460 - Black 70 EA $75.00 $5,250.00
v
b/ 197 TN 720 - Black 10 EA $57.00 $570.00
/ 198 DR-350 - Drum 10 EA $105.00 $1,050.00
V Kit
V/ 199 DR-400 - Drum 40 EA $149.00 $5,960.00
Kit .
V1
“/ 200 DR-420 - Drum 20 EA $70.00 $1,400.00
Kit
/ 201 DR-720- Drum 20 EA $117.00 $2,340.00
v Kit
Introduced on: April 2, 2025
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Res-Pg:m.19-21
[STAR DATA COJ] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line [tem Description

Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg. Delivery, A.R.O.
' $20,830.00

SECTION H - NEW ITEMS

Line item Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments

Measure

202 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Brother — Discount Off the Current List Price % 42%

<
N

203 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Canon - Inklet and Value Packs - Discount Off % 39%
the Current List Price

<
N

204 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Canon - Laser Toner Cartridges - Discount Off % 42%
the Current List Price

205 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Dell - Laser Toner Cartridges - Discount Off the % 33%
Current List Price

206 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Epson - Inklet and Value Packs - Discount Off % 40%
the Current List Price ’

C

SIS S

207 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Hewlett Packard - Inklet/Deskjet and Value % 45%
Packs - Discount Off the Current List Price

<

/ 208 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Hewlett Packard - Printhead Cartridges - % 41%
v Discount Off the Current List Price

209 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Hewlett Packard — Laser Toner Cartridges - % 43%
Discount Off the Current List Price

/ 210 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Konica Minolta — Discount Off the Current List % 43%
Price

\v

Introduced on: April 2, 2025
Adopted [STAR DATAAIDI RESEINSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Res-Pg:m.19-22
[STAR DATA COJ] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Unit of Percentage No Bid Comments

Measure

b/ 211 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Lexmark — Discount Off the Current List Price % 44%
v/ 212 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Okidata — Discount Off the Current List Price % 42%
\‘/ 213 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Ricoh — Discount Off the Current List Price % 43%
/
\/ 214 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Xerox — Discount Off the Current List Price % 42%
/
215 Purchase of New Printer Cartridges - Muratec - Discount Off the Current List Price % 38%
\/ g
Introduced_on: April 2 2025
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Res-Pg:m.19-23
[THE TREE HOUSE, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, AR.O.
V/ . 1 CL 241 - Color 20 EA $24.25 $485.00
VV 2 PG 240XL - Black 20 EA $24.00 $480.00
. I
y 3 PGI 35 - Black 10 EA $14.20 $142.00 |
|
TOTAL $1,107.00 \\

SECTION B - INKIET CARTRIDGES - EPSON (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.
4 EPS T676XL120 - 20 EA $42.95 $859.00
Black
5 EPS T676XL220 - 20 EA $28.50 $570.00 (
Cyan \
AN
6 EPS T676XL320 - 20 EA $28.50 - $570.00 ) S
Magenta &Y
7 EPS T676XL420 - 20 EA $28.50 $570.00
Yellow
8 Epson 502, (3- EA No Bid No Bid X
Pack: CMY
Bottles)
{T502520-S)
9 Epson 502, EA No Bid No Bid X
Black (T502120-
s)
10 Epson 502, Cyan - EA No Bid No Bid X
(1502220-5)

Introduced-on: April 2, 2025

Adopted[GhiE TREE HOSE, 12025 RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Res-Pg:m.19-24
[THE TREE HOUSE, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.
11 Epson 502, EA No Bid‘ No Bid X
Magenta
(T502320-S)
12 Epson 502, EA No Bid No Bid X
Yellow
(T502420-5)
13 Epson T542, EA No Bid No Bid X

Black Ink Bottle

14 Epson T542, EA No Bid No Bid X
Cyan Ink Bottle

15 Epson T542, EA No Bid No Bid X
Magenta Ink
Bottle

16 Epson 7542, EA No Bid No 8id X

Yellow Ink Bottle

17 Epson T542, (3- EA No Bid No Bid X
Pack: CMY
Bottles)
TOTAL $2,569.00

SECTION C - INKIET CARTRIDGES AND VALUE PACKS - HEWLETT PACKARD (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, AR.O.

3JAQ0AN#140 - 150 EA $29.60 $4,440.00
\/ Cyan (HP 962XL)
/ 19 3JA01AN#140 - 130 EA $29.60 $3,848.00
\/ Magenta (HP
962XL)

Introducedon:—— April 2. 2025 -
Adopted §F{E TREE HPHIGE, 2045] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Res-Pg:m.19-25
[THE TREE HOUSE, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line {tem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, AR.O.
20 3JA02AN#140 - 160 EA $29.60 $4,736.00
/ Yellow (HP
v 962XL)
/‘ 21 3JAO03AN#140 - 150 EA $37.50 $5,625.00
Black (HP 962XL)
U .
22 3YQ26AN#140 - 70 EA $70.70 $4,949.00
{4-Pack: CMYK)
\,/ (HP 910)
/ 23 B6Y15A - Matte 20 EA $307.20 $6,144.00
V Black (HP 771A)
24 B6Y17A- 20 EA $307.20 $6,144.00
/ Magenta (HP
V 771A)
25 B6Y18A - Yellow 20 EA $307.20 $6,144.00
\v {HP 771A)
26 B6Y19A - Lt. 20 EA $307.20 $6,144.00
» Magenta (HP
771A)
27 B6Y20A - Lt. 20 EA $307.20 $6,144.00

Cyan (HP 771A)

28 BSYZIA - Photo 20 EA $307.20 $6,144.00
Black (HP 771A)

<

NN N NN

29 B6Y22A - Lt. 20 EA $307.20 $6,144.00
Grey (HP 771A)

L 30 C2PO4AN - 200 EA $14.80 $2,960.00
V Black (HP 62)
\/ 31 CZPOSAN - Black S0 EA $36.80 $1,840.00
(HP 62XL)

Introduced—on: Aprl2, 2025
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Res-Pg:m.19-26
[THE TREE HOUSE, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.

32 C2PO6AN - Tri 200 EA $17.60 $3,520.00
b/ Color (HP 62)

33 C2PO7AN - (Tri- 50 EA $38.25 $1,912.50
v Color: CMY) (HP #
62XL)

N

34 C2P23AN - Black 90 EA $31.75 $2,857.50
{HP 934XL)
v {High Yield)

N

<
AN

35 C2P24AN - Cyan 70 EA $18.75 $1,312.50
(HP 935XL)

36 C2P2SAN - 70 EA $18.75 $1,312.50
Magenta (HP
935XL)

37 C2P26AN - 70 EA $18.75 $1,312.50
Yellow (HP
935XL)

38 C6656A - Black 40 EA $30.70 $1,228.00 ‘ )
{HP 56)

39 C6656AN - Black 60 EA $30.70 $1,842.00
(HP 56) (High
Yield)

40 C6657A - (Tri- 30 EA $51.75 $1,552.50
Color: CMY) (HP
57)

(

NN YK

C6657AN - (Tri- 50 EA $51.75 $2,587.50
Color: CMY) {HP
57)

<
N
e

Introduced-on.: April 2, 2025
Adopted ofTHE TREE BEISE20RE.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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[THE TREE HOUSE, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD

PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Res-Pg:m.19-27

Line Item

Quantity

Unit of Measure

Unit Price

Total Price

Comments

Mfr./Pkg

42

Description

C8766WN - (Tri-
Color: CMY) (HP
95)

20

EA

$43.40

$868.00

Delivery, A.R.O.

43

C8767WN —
Black {HP 96)

40

EA

$12.00

$480.00

<
N

44

C9353FN - (2-
Pack: CMYK} (HP
96 Black & HP
97 Tri-Color)

40

EA

$24.00

$960.00

45

C9363WN -
Color {(HP 97)

40

EA

$12.00

$480.00

ENES

46

C9364WN -
Black (HP 98)

30

EA

$35.10

$1,053.00

47

CH644A
Maintenance
Cartridge (HP
771)

20

EA

$77.65

$1,553.00

48

CNO45AN -
Black { HP950
XL)

50

EA

$48.65

$2,432.50

49

CNO46AN - Cyan
(HP 951 XL)

60

EA

$33.80

$2,028.00

SN N S

N

50

CNO47AN -
Magenta (HP
951 XL)

60

EA

$33.80

$2,028.00

51

CNO48AN -
Yellow (HP 951
XL)

60

EA

$33.80

$2,028.00

Introduced on:

Alnril 2 2025
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Res-Pg:m.19-28
[THE TREE HOUSE, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT

Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.

CNO49AN - 40 EA $28.95 $1,158.00
L Black (HP 950) '

53 CNO50AN - Cyan 30 EA $20.30 $609.00
(HP 951)

54 CNO51 - 30 EA $20.30 $609.00
Magenta (HP
951 XL)

55 CNOS1AN - 30 EA $20.30 $609.00
Magenta {HP
v 951)

NT NN

56 CNOS2AN - 30 EA $20.30 $609.00
Yellow (HP 951)

<
N\

57 CNOS3AN - 50 EA $39.55 $1,977.50
Black {(HP 932
XL)

S

58 CNOS4AN - Cyan 50 EA $18.15 $907.50
(HP 933XL)

<

59 CNO55AN - 50 EA $18.15 $907.50
Magenta (HP
933XL)

AN

60 CNOS6AN - 50 EA $18.15 $907.50
Yellow {HP
933XL)

61 CNOS8AN - Cyan 10 EA $11.00 $110.00
(HP 933)

NN N

62 CNE26AM - 40 EA $119.65 $4,786.00
Black .

Introduc

edon:  April 2,2025
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Res-Pg:m.19-29
[THE TREE HOUSE, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price No Bid Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.

/ 63 CN627AM - 40 EA $119.65 $4,786.00
LV Magenta
/ 64 CN628AM - 40 EA $119.65 $4,786.00
\ Yellow
/ 65 CN625AM - 40 EA $119.65 $4,786.00
\ Cyan
/ 66 F6U15AN - Black 270 EA $26.75 $7,222.50
\v {HP 952)
/ 67 LOS49AN#140 - 230 EA $18.50 $4,255.00
\ Cyan (HP 952)
68 LOS52AN#140 - 200 EA $18.50 $3,700.00
Magenta {HP
952)
y
69 LOSS55AN#140 - 200 EA $18.50 $3,700.00
\ Yellow (HP 952)
70 NOK27AN - (3- 100 EA $63.45 $6,345.00
W Pack: CMY) (HP

952) (High Yield)

71 TOA39AN - (4- 30 EA $54.15 $1,624.50
Pack: CMYK) (HP
902)

72 T6MO2AN (HP 10 EA $24.75 $247.50
902 XL} - Cyan

73 TEMOGAN (HP 10 EA $24.75 $247.50
902 XL) -
Magenta

P

N NN N YN

74 TEM10AN (HP 10 EA $24.75 $247.50
902 XL} - Yellow

]

Introducedan- Apnal 2 2025
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Res-Pg:m.19-30
[THE TREE HOUSE, INC.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Bid No. TBD
PRINTER CARTRIDGES

Line item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.

75 T6M14AN (HP 10 EA $42.05 $420.50
Vv 902XL} - Black

Vi

76 XA4EO7AN - (4- 10 EA $94.00 $940.00
U Pack: CMYK) (HP
952)
TOTAL $161,252.00

SECTION D - LASER — TONER CARTRIDGES - CANON (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line ltem Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Total Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, AR.O.
77 120 - Black 20 EA $140.25 $2,805.00
78 128 - Black 20 EA $83.90 $1,678.00
TOTAL $4,483.00

SECTION E - LASER — TONER CARTRIDGES - HEWLETT PACKARD (NO SUBSTITUTIONS)

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Price Totat Price Comments Mfr./Pkg Delivery, A.R.O.
79 C4129X - Black 20 EA $10.00 $200.00
(HP 29X)
80 C4182X - Black 4 EA $10.00 $40.00
(HP 8150}
81 C8061X - Black 4 EA $10.00 $40.00
(HP 61X)
82 C9720A - Black 4 EA $10.00 $40.00
83 C9721A - Cyan 4 EA $10.00 $40.00
Introduced on: April 2 2025

Adopted $THE TREE HQUGE,2085.] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Page 14



