

## Ocean County Board of Chosen Freeholders

OFFICE OF THE OCEAN COUNTY FREEHOLDERS

Freeholder Director Joseph H. Vicari Deputy Director Gary Quinn Freeholder Virginia E. Haines Freeholder John P. Kelly Freeholder Gerry P. Little 101 Hooper Ave Toms River, New Jersey 08754-2191

Tel: 732-929-2005 Fax: 732-505-1918

### **Board Meeting Agenda**

Date: May 6, 2020 - 4:00 PM

Location: Administration Building

Room 119

101 Hooper Avenue Toms River, NJ 08754

Agenda: Amending the award of Contracts for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS OR GREATER, due to a clerical error, as follows: Awarding Item No. 57 to On-Site Fleet Service, Inc.; Rescinding Item Nos. 2, 13, 52, 53 and 54 from Johnson & Towers, Inc.; Rescinding Item Nos. 13, 52, 53, 67 and 68 from Beyer Bros. Corp.; Rescinding Item Nos. 13 and 14 from Campbell Freightliner, LLC; Rescinding Item Nos. 52, 53 and 54 from Houpert Fleet Services db ...

Official Resolution#				2020000553				
Meeting Date			05	/06	/202	20		
Introduced Date	;		05	/06	/202	20		
Adopted Date			05	/06	/202	20		
Agenda Item			m-	10				
CAF#								
Purchase Req.	#		B2020-44					
Result			Adopted					
FREEHOLDER	PRES.	ABS.	MOVE	SEC	AYE	NAY	ABST.	
Vicari	~				~			
Quinn	~			~	~			
Haines 🗸			~		~			
Kelly v					~			
Little	~				~			

I HEREBY CERTIFY THAT THIS DOCUMENT IS A TRUE, COMPLETE AND ACCURATE COPY OF THIS RESOLUTION, ADOPTED BY OCEAN COUNTY BOARD OF CHOSEN FREEHOLDERS, NJ AT THE MEETING REFERENCED THEREON

Clerk Of The Board

### RESOLUTION

May 6, 2020

WHEREAS, on March 3, 2020, pursuant to legal advertisements therefor, sealed bids were received for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS OR GREATER for the County of Ocean; and

WHEREAS, on April 15, 2020, Contract B2020-44, Items 2, 13, 52, 53 and 54 were awarded to Johnson & Towers, Inc.; Items 13, 52, 53, 67 and 68 were awarded to Beyer Bros. Corp.; Items 13 and 14 were awarded to Campbell Freightliner LLC.; Items 52, 53 and 54 were awarded to Houpert Fleet Services DBA Houpert Truck Service; Items 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 62, 66, 67 and 81 were awarded to Jerry's Towing & Diesel Repair; Items 52, 53, 54, 62 and 66 were awarded to On-Site Fleet Service, Inc.; Items 56, 57, 58, 59 and 62 were awarded to H.A. DeHart & Son, Inc.; Item 58 was awarded to Robert H. Hoover & Sons Inc.; and Item 58 was awarded to D&W Diesel, Inc.; and

WHEREAS, due to a clerical error, the County Purchasing Agent has requested Items 2, 13, 52, 53 and 54 be rescinded from Johnson & Towers, Inc.; Items 13, 52, 53, 67 and 68 be rescinded from Beyer Bros. Corp.; Items 13 and 14 be rescinded from Campbell Freightliner LLC.; Items 52, 53 and 54 be rescinded from Houpert Fleet Services DBA Houpert Truck Service; Items 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 62, 66, 67 and 81 be rescinded from Jerry's Towing & Diesel Repair; Items 52, 53, 54, 62 and 66 be rescinded from On-Site Fleet Service, Inc.; Items 56, 57, 58, 59 and 62 be rescinded from H.A. DeHart & Son, Inc.; Item 58 be rescinded from Robert H. Hoover & Sons, Inc.; Items 58 and 66 be rescinded from D&W Diesel, Inc.; and

WHEREAS, the County Purchasing Agent has also recommended that Item 57 be awarded to On-Site Fleet Service, Inc.; and

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF CHOSEN FREEHOLDERS OF THE COUNTY OF OCEAN, STATE OF NEW JERSEY, AS FOLLOWS:

1. The aforementioned Resolution and Contract dated April 15, 2020; awarding Items 2, 13, 52, 53 and 54 to Johnson & Towers, Inc.; Items 13, 52, 53, 67 and 68 to Beyer Bros. Corp.; Items 13 and 14 to Campbell Freightliner LLC.; Items 52, 53 and 54 to Houpert Fleet Services DBA Houpert Truck Service; Items 52, 53, 54, 55, 56, 57, 58, 59, 62, 66, 67 and 81 to Jerry's Towing & Diesel Repair; Items 52, 53, 54, 62 and 66 to On-Site Fleet Service, Inc.; Items 56, 57, 58, 59 and 62 to H.A. DeHart & Son, Inc.; Item 58 to Robert H. Hoover & Sons Inc.; and Items 58 and 66 to D&W Diesel, Inc., are hereby rescinded. These items will not be rebid.

Introduced on: Adopted on: Official Resolution#:

May 6, 2020 May 6, 2020 2020000553

- 2. In the event of tie bids pursuant to N.J.S.A. 40A 11-6.1(d), bids are awarded to the bidder(s) in closet distance to the Ocean County Administration Building, 101 Hooper Avenue, Toms River, NJ, using the address indicated on their bid documentation.
- 3. The Freeholder Director and Clerk of the Board are hereby authorized and directed to enter into an Amendatory Contract with On-Site Fleet Service, Inc. for Item 57.
- 4. All other provisions of the Resolution described above shall remain in full force and effect.
- 5. The contract number must be placed on all papers, documents, invoices and vouchers pertaining to said contract, the number being B2020-44.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that certified copies of this Resolution shall be made available to the County Auditor, County Purchasing Agent, Department of Finance, County Parks and Recreation Department, County Road Department, Solid Waste Management, Transportation Department, and Vehicle Services.

Page 25 of 29

Itom #	Description	Est.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
Item #	Cummins	Qty.		out Frice	\$ 19.250.
	Contact Name and Phone # JOHn	125 1 Cones	HR KO 5	SERVICE VYE	NAGER
J 14	Detroit Diesel 856	-234-	6990		8 7700
- 11	Contact Name and Phone # TOKA	50 C	HR VO	SERVICE VI	\$ 1,100.
15	Eldorado 856 -	234-6	990	SENVICE IN	NA CELL
15	Contact Name and Phone #	100	НR	\$	\$
16	Elgin				
10		50	HR	\$	\$
1.77	Contact Name and Phone #	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			_
17	Elliot	50	HR	\$	\$
10	Contact Name and Phone #				
18	Extec	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
19	Ford	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
20	Freightliner	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
21	General Motors	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #		<del></del>		
22	Girardin	150	HR \$	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #		-		
23	Glaval	150	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ф
24	Goodall	50	HR	\$	•
	Contact Name and Phone #	50		Ψ	<b>J</b>
25	Goshen	150	HR	•	6
	Contact Name and Phone #	130	TIK _	\$	\$
26	International Bus	150	ID	•	0
	Contact Name and Phone #	150	HR _	\$	ъ
27	International	100	LIP	Φ.	
	Contact Name and Phone #	100	HR _	\$	\$
28	Isuzu				
	Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR _	\$	\$
	Contact Painte and Phone #				

### JOHNSON & TOWERS, INC.

Page 29 of 29

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price	
Catego	ry 20: Parts Repair/Rebuild					
78	Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Cooler, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	50	HR	\$	\$	
79	Hydraulic Rams	150	HR	\$	\$	
80	Hydraulic Pump Motors	50	HR	\$	\$	
81	PTO	50	HR	\$	\$	_
82	Starters	50	HR	\$	\$	
83	Alternators	50	HR	\$	\$	_
84	Fuel Tanks	50	HR	\$	\$	

### **Group/Price Line 85:**

 $\sqrt{85}$ Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00.

> Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount here) 15%

Example: \$200,000.00 by 11%=\$22,000.00 or \$200,000.00 by .11=\$22,000.00

Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right.

\$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x **/\$**%)=

Introduced on: Adopted on:

May 6, 2020 May 6, 2020 Official Resolution#: 2020000553

Page 24 of 29

Proposal for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER for the County of Ocean.

### VENDOR WILL EXTEND CONTRACT PRICES TO "COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM" PARTICIPANTS.

(X) - YES ( ) - NO

### PRICE SCHEDULE

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
Catego	ry 1: OEM Repairs and Preventive	Maintenance:	Major		
1	Altec	210	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			*	
2	Allison Transmission	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
3	American Rolloff	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ
4	Aquatech	75	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			<u> </u>	Ψ
5	Blue Bird	150	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ
6	Braun	100	HR	\$	¢
	Contact Name and Phone #			<u>.</u>	φ
7	Camel	100	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ
8	Case IH	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #		пк	<b>D</b>	Φ
9	Case Construction	100	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			<b>J</b>	Φ
10	Caterpillar Construction	2,600	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ
11	Chevrolet	50	HR	\$ 152.00/HR	\$7,600.00
-	Contact Name and Phone # <b>JEFF</b>	BONTEMPS SV			
12·	Collins 201-2	<u> १५ <b>५- ३।००</b></u> 50	HR	\$	<b>\$</b>
	Contact Name and Phone #	J0		Ψ	Ψ

Introduced on: Adopted on:

May 6, 2020 May 6, 2020

Official Resolution#: 2020000553

Page 25 of 29

	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
13	Cummins	125	HR	\$152.00/HR	\$ 19,000.00
	Contact Name and Phone # JEFF	BONTEMPS, S	bic MGR	***************************************	
14	Detroit Diesel	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				,
15	Eldorado	100	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
16	Elgin	50	HR	\$ ,	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
17	Elliot	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				Ψ
18	Extec	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ
19	Ford	50	HR	\$	<b>S</b>
	Contact Name and Phone #		IIK	Ψ	Φ
20	Freightliner	50	HR	\$	<b>c</b>
	Contact Name and Phone #		III	Ψ	<b>D</b>
21	General Motors	50	HR	\$ 152.00/HR	°7.600.00
	Contact Name and Phone # JEFF	BONTEMPS, SU	c mgr	\$102.00/1111	\$ .,
22	Girardin 201-9	<b>43-316</b> 150	HR	¢	¢
	Contact Name and Phone #			\$	\$
23	Glaval	150	LID	Φ	<b>¢</b>
	Contact Name and Phone #	130	HR	\$	\$
24	Goodall	50	IID	<b>ው</b>	ф
	Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$	\$
25	Goshen		IID	¢.	φ
	Contact Name and Phone #	150	HR	\$	<u> </u>
26	International Bus	150	IID	Ф	Φ
	Contact Name and Phone #	150	HR	\$	\$
27	International	100	TTD	Φ	Φ
	Contact Name and Phone #	100	HR	\$	\$
28	Isuzu	<b>70</b>	IID	\$152.00/HR	• 7 / A
	Contact Name and Phone # JEFF	50	HR	\$102.001 HK	\$ 1,600.00

Page 27 of 29

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
45	Terex	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
46	Thomas	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ
47	Vac Con	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #		1110	Ψ	Φ
48	Vactor	50	HR	\$	¢
	Contact Name and Phone #	J0		Ψ	Φ
19	Vermeer	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #	30	IIK	<u> </u>	Φ
50	Versalift East	50	TID	¢.	¢.
	Contact Name and Phone #	30	HR	\$	\$
51	Volvo	50	IID	\$152.00/HR	• 7/ 00 00
	Contact Name and Phone # JEFF BONTE	50 <b>MDS SV</b>	HR C mge	\$132.00/HK	\$7,600.00
Categor	ry 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Maint Category 2: Non-OEM Chassis	enance:	Major		
	Preventive Maintenance: Major	50	HR	\$152.00/HR	\$7,600.00
Categor	ry 3: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Minor				
53)	Category 3: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Minor	125	HR	\$ 152.00/HR	\$19,000.00
Categor	ry 4: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Major				
54)	Category 4: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Major	600	HR	\$152.00/HR	\$91,200.00
Categor	ry 5: Non-OEM Repairs: Hoist & Cranes				
55	Category 5: Non-OEM Repairs: Hoist & Cranes	100	HR	\$	\$
Categor	y 6: Non-OEM Repairs: Lift Gates				
56	Category 6: Non-OEM Repairs: Lift Gates	100	HR	\$	\$
_	y 7: Non-OEM Repairs: Wheelchair Lifts	1			
57	Category 7: Non-OEM Repairs: Wheelchair Lifts	125	HR	\$	\$
Categor	y 8: Non-OEM Repairs: Hydraulic System	ns & PT	O's		
58	Category 8: Non-OEM Repairs: Hydraulic Systems & PTO's	100	HR	\$	\$

Page 29 of 29

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
Catego	ry 20: Parts Repair/Rebuild				
78	Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Cooler, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	50	HR	\$	\$
79	Hydraulic Rams	150	HR	\$	\$
80	Hydraulic Pump Motors	50	HR	\$	\$
81	PTO	50	HR	\$	\$
82	Starters	50	HR	\$	\$
83	Alternators	50	HR	\$	\$
84	Fuel Tanks	50	HR	\$	\$

### **Group/Price Line 85:**

**J** 85 Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00.

> Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount here)

List- 30 %

Example: \$200,000.00 by

11%=\$22,000.00 or \$200,000.00 by

.11= \$22,000.00

Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right.

\$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x **\_3**%)=

\$196,000.00

Introduced on: Adopted on:

May 6, 2020 May 6, 2020 Official Resolution#: 2020000553

Page 24 of 29

Proposal for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER for the County of Ocean.

### VENDOR WILL EXTEND CONTRACT PRICES TO "COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM" PARTICIPANTS.

(X)-YES

( )-NO

### **PRICE SCHEDULE**

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
Catego	ry 1: OEM Repairs and Preventive	Maintenance:	Major		
1	Altec	210	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
,	Contact Name and Phone #				
2	Allison Transmission	50	HR	\$148,00	\$ 7,400.00
	Contact Name and Phone #				
3	American Rolloff	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #				
4	Aquatech	75	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Rid
	Contact Name and Phone #			<u> </u>	<u> </u>
5	Blue Bird	150	HR	e m mia	\$ No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #		III	\$ No Bid	<u> </u>
6	Braun		HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #	100	пк	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
7	Camel			s No Bid	s No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #	100	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
8	Case IH			\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
Ü	Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR		
9	Case Construction				1-
9		100	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
10	Contact Name and Phone #		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	N	
10	Caterpillar Construction	2,600	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #		-		
11	Chevrolet	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #				
12	Collins	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #				

Introduced on: Adopted on:

May 6, 2020 May 6, 2020

Official Resolution#: 2020000553

## CAMPBELL FREIGHTLINER, LLC

Res-Pg:m.10-11

Page 25 of 29

_Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
13	Cummins	125	HR	\$ 154.00	\$ 19,250.00
•	Contact Name and Phone #				
14	Detroit Diesel	50	HR	\$ 154.00	\$ 7,700.00
	Contact Name and Phone #			the state of the s	
15	Eldorado	100	HR	\$ No Bid	<sub>\$</sub> No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #				<del></del>
16	Elgin	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #				
17	Elliot	50	HR	\$ No Bid	s No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #				
18	Extec	50	HR	\$ No Bid	s No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #			<u> </u>	<del>_</del>
19	Ford	<b>50</b> °	HR	\$ No Bid	s No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	
20	Freightliner	50	HR	\$ 154.00	\$ 7 <b>,</b> 700 <b>.</b> 00
	Contact Name and Phone #				
21	General Motors	50	HR	\$ No Bid	♥ No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ
22	Girardin	150	HR	\$ No Bid	<b>\$</b> No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	<b>y</b>
23	Glaval	150	HR	\$ No Bid	€ No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #	150		Ф	Φ
24	Goodall	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #			<u> </u>	<u> </u>
25	Goshen	150	HR	\$ No Bid	s No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #		1110		<u> </u>
26	International Bus	150	HR	\$ No Bid	s No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #			*	
27	International	100	HR	\$ No Bid	s No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #			<u> </u>	. <u> </u>
28	Isuzu	50		\$ No Bid	s No Bid
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ

Page 26 of 29

~,			Est.	Unit of		Page 26 01 29	
		Description	Qty.	Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price	
	28	Isuzu	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	
		Contact Name and Phone #					
	29	John Deere	100	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	
		Contact Name and Phone #					
	30	Kubota	75	HR	\$ No Bid	§ No Bid	
		Contact Name and Phone #					
	31	Mack	100	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	
		Contact Name and Phone #					
	32	McCloskey	75	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	
		Contact Name and Phone #			<u> </u>		
	33	New Holland Agriculture	50	HR	\$ No Bid	s No Bid	
		Contact Name and Phone #			Ф	<u> </u>	
	34	New Holland Construction	50	HR	\$ No Bid	s No Bid	
		Contact Name and Phone #	30	тк	3 1 2 2 2 2	9	
	35	Peterbilt	50	TID.	\$ No Bid	s No Bid	
Ì		Contact Name and Phone #		HR	<b>3</b> 10 110	<b>3</b> 10 1m2	
	36	Powerscreen		IID	⊕ No Bid	s No Bid	
		Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$ No Bid	2 10 123	
	37	Ricon	. 1	TID	n No Dia	e No Did	
		Contact Name and Phone #	100	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	
	38	Schwarze			e Mo Did	a No Did	
		Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	
	39	Startrans				. Nr. 104.7	
		Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	
	40	Stellar Crane			. No Did	. No Trid	
	70	Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	
1	<b>/1</b>	Sterling					
7	41	•	50	HR	\$ 154.00	\$ 7,700.00	
	42	Contact Name and Phone #			·		
	42	Supreme Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	
	42	Contact Name and Phone #			NI TOLE	NT TOLER	
	43	Sweeprite	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	
`\ -	4.4	Contact Name and Phone #					
	44		50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid	
Ado	pted on:	Contrey N 2026 and Phone # May 6, 2020 ation#: 2020000553					

Page 29 of 29

Item#	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
	ry 20: Parts Repair/Rebuild	20.	1120451	OMA TITLE	100011100
78	Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Cooler, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
79	Hydraulic Rams	150	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
80	Hydraulic Pump Motors	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
81	PTO	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
82	Starters	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
83	Alternators	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid
84	Fuel Tanks	50	HR	\$ No Bid	\$ No Bid

### **Group/Price Line 85:**

**4** 85 Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00.

> Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount here) 5 %

Example: \$200,000.00 by 11%=\$22,000.00 or \$200,000.00 by .11= \$22,000.00

Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right.

\$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x 5 %)=

\$ 266,000.00

Introduced on: Adopted on: Official Resolution#: 2020000553

May 6, 2020 May 6, 2020

Page 25 of 29

, Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.		Total Price
√ 13	Cummins	125	HR	\$ 125.00	\$ 15,625
	Contact Name and Phone #	<del>- , </del>			
14	Detroit Diesel	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #	·			
15	Eldorado	100	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
16	Elgin	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
17	Elliot	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
18	Extec	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
19	Ford	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
20	Freightliner	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
21	General Motors	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
22	Girardin	150	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
23	Glaval	150	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				Ψ
24	Goodall	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				. <u> </u>
25	Goshen	150	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
26	International Bus	150	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
27	International	100	HR	\$	_\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				<u> </u>
28	Isuzu	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				

Introduced on:

May 6, 2020 Adopted on: May 6, 2020 Official Resolution#: 2020000553

Page 27 of 29

					1 464 27 01 29
Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
45	Terex	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
46	Thomas	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
47	Vac Con	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
48	Vactor	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				<u> </u>
49	Vermeer	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ
50	Versalift East	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			. ·	Ψ
51	Volvo	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #		1110	φ	φ
Categor	ry 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Maint		Major		
52	Category 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Maintenance: Major	50	HR	<sub>\$</sub> 75.00	§ 3,750
Categor	ry 3: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Minor				
53	Category 3: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Minor	125	HR	<sub>\$</sub> 75.00	\$ 9,375
Categor	y 4: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Major				
54	Category 4: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Major	600	HR	<sub>\$</sub> 75.00	\$ 45,000
Categor	y 5: Non-OEM Repairs: Hoist & Cranes				
55	Category 5: Non-OEM Repairs: Hoist & Cranes	100	HR	<sub>\$</sub> 75.00	\$ 7,500
Categor	y 6: Non-OEM Repairs: Lift Gates				·
56	Category 6: Non-OEM Repairs: Lift Gates	100	HR	<sub>\$</sub> 75.00	<sub>\$</sub> 7,500
_	ry 7: Non-OEM Repairs: Wheelchair Lifts	3			
57	Category 7: Non-OEM Repairs: Wheelchair Lifts	125	HR	<sub>\$</sub> 75.00	\$ 9,375
Categor	y 8: Non-OEM Repairs: Hydraulic System	ns & PT	O's		
58	Category 8: Non-OEM Repairs: Hydraulic Systems & PTO's	100	HR	\$ 75.00	\$ 7,500

Page 28 of 29

		Est.	Unit of		1 490 40 01 22
Item #	Description	Qty.	Meas.	<b>Unit Price</b>	<b>Total Price</b>
Catego	ory 9: Non-OEM Repairs: Snow Plows ar	id Sprea	ders		
√59	Category 9: Non-OEM Repairs: Snow Plows and Spreaders	50	HR	\$ 75.00	\$ 3,750
Catego	ory 10: Non-OEM Repairs: Winches				
<b>√</b> 60	Category 10: Non-OEM Repairs: Winches	50	HR	\$ 75.00	<sub>\$</sub> 3,750
Catego	ory 11: Non-OEM Repairs: Seats				
61	Category 11: Non-OEM Repairs: Seats	50	HR	\$	\$
Catego	ory 12: Non-OEM Repairs: Truck Bodies	& Trail			
$\sqrt{62}$	Category 12: Non-OEM Repairs: Truck Bodies & Trailers	500	HR	\$ 75.00	<sub>\$</sub> 37,500
Catego	ry 13: Non-OEM Repairs: Gauges				
63	Category 13: Non-OEM Repairs: Gauges	50	HR	\$	\$
_	ory 14: Non-OEM Repairs: Pressure Was	shers			
64	Category 14: Non-OEM Repairs: Pressure Washers	50	HR	\$	\$
Catego	ory 15: Non-OEM Repairs: Tools				
65	Category 15: Non-OEM Repairs: Tools	50	HR	\$	\$
Catego	ry 16: Non-OEM Repairs: Engines				
<b>1</b> 66	Category 16: Non-OEM Repairs: Engines	600	HR	\$ 75.00	\$ 45,000
Catego	ory 17: Non OEM Repairs: Radiators, He	eat Exch	anges, Hea	ater Coolers, Oil C	Cooler, Intercoolers
√ 67	Category 17: Non OEM Repairs: Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Coolers, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	220	HR	\$ 75.00	\$ 16,500
1	ry 18: Non-OEM Repairs: Exhaust				
√68	Category 18: Non-OEM Repairs: Exhaust	50	HR	\$ 75.00	\$ 3,750
_	ry 19: County Location Repairs				
69 <b>5</b> 0	Aladdin Pressure Washer	110	HR	\$	\$
70 	Altec	50	HR	\$	_\$
71	Cyclonator	50	HR	\$	\$
72	Hydraulic Systems	50	HR	\$	\$
73	McCloskey	50	HR	\$	\$
74	PSC Pressure Washer	50	HR	\$	\$
75	Riveer	50	HR	\$	\$
76	Vermeer	50	HR	\$	\$
77	Versa Lift East	50	HR	\$	\$
	M 0 0000				

Page 29 of 29

238,000

					Page 29 of 29
Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
	ry 20: Parts Repair/Rebuild	<u> </u>			
78	Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Cooler, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	50	HR	\$	\$
79	Hydraulic Rams	150	HR	\$	\$
80	Hydraulic Pump Motors	50	HR	\$	\$
81	PTO	50	HR	\$	\$
82	Starters	50	HR	\$	\$
83	Alternators	50	HR	\$	\$
84	Fuel Tanks	50	HR	\$	\$
Group/	Price Line 85:				
<b>√</b> 85	Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00.  Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount here)  15 %  Example: \$200,000.00 by				
	11%=\$22,000.00 or \$200,000.00 by .11=\$22,000.00  Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right.				

Introduced on: Adopted on:

May 6, 2020 May 6, 2020 Official Resolution#: 2020000553

\$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x <u>15</u> %)=

Page 24 of 29

Proposal for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER for the County of Ocean.

### VENDOR WILL EXTEND CONTRACT PRICES TO "COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM" PARTICIPANTS.

(**√**) - YES

( )-NO

### PRICE SCHEDULE

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
	y 1: OEM Repairs and Preventive M				
1	Altec	210	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	
2	Allison Transmission	50	HR	\$ 125.00	\$ 6250.00
	Contact Name and Phone #_732-414	1-6666			
3	American Rolloff	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ
4	Aquatech	75	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #		пк	<u> </u>	<u> </u>
5	Blue Bird			Ф	<b>c</b>
	Contact Name and Phone #	HR	\$		
6	Braun				
Ü	Contact Name and Phone #	100	HR	\$	\$
7	Camel				
,		100	HR	\$	\$
0	Contact Name and Phone #				
8	Case IH	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #	·· <u>·</u>	<del></del>		
9	Case Construction	100	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #	,			
10	Caterpillar Construction	2,600	HR	\$ 125.00	\$ 325,000.00
	Contact Name and Phone # 732-414	*			
11	Chevrolet	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ
12	Collins		110	Φ	¢
	Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$	\$

Introduced on: Adopted on:

May 6, 2020 May 6, 2020 Official Resolution#: 2020000553

Page 28 of 29

Item #	Description	Est. Oty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
	ry 9: Non-OEM Repairs: Snow Plows an				
59	Category 9: Non-OEM Repairs: Snow Plows and Spreaders	50	HR	<b>\$</b> 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
Catego	ry 10: Non-OEM Repairs: Winches				
<b>1</b> 60	Category 10: Non-OEM Repairs: Winches	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
, ,	ry 11: Non-OEM Repairs: Seats				
J 61	Category 11: Non-OEM Repairs: Seats	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
Catego	ry 12: Non-OEM Repairs: Truck Bodies	& Trail	ers		
62	Category 12: Non-OEM Repairs: Truck Bodies & Trailers	500	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 55,000.00
, -	ry 13: Non-OEM Repairs: Gauges				
√63	Category 13: Non-OEM Repairs: Gauges	50	HR	\$ 110.00	<b>\$</b> 5,500.00
_	ry 14: Non-OEM Repairs: Pressure Was	hers			
<b>\</b> 64	Category 14: Non-OEM Repairs: Pressure Washers	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
	ry 15: Non-OEM Repairs: Tools				
65	Category 15: Non-OEM Repairs: Tools	50	HR	\$	\$
Catego	ry 16: Non-OEM Repairs: Engines				
66	Category 16: Non-OEM Repairs: Engines	600	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 66,000.00
_	ry 17: Non OEM Repairs: Radiators, He	at Exch	anges, Hea	ater Coolers, Oil C	ooler, Intercoolers
<sup>1</sup> 67	Category 17: Non OEM Repairs: Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Coolers, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	220	HR	<b>\$</b> 110.00	\$ 24,200.00
Categor	y 18: Non-OEM Repairs: Exhaust				
68	Category 18: Non-OEM Repairs: Exhaust	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
	y 19: County Location Repairs				
1 69	Aladdin Pressure Washer	110	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 12,100.00
√70	Altec	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
<b>√</b> 71	Cyclonator	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
<b>√</b> 72	Hydraulic Systems	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
√73	McCloskey	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
<b>J</b> 74	PSC Pressure Washer	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
<b>√</b> 75	Riveer	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
√76	Vermeer	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
Adopted on	on Versa Inity 5,20020 : May 6, 2020 olution#: 2020000553	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00

## JERRY'S TOWING & DIESEL REPAIR

Page 29 of 29

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit P	rice Total Price
	ry 20: Parts Repair/Rebuild	<u> </u>	Wicas.	Oniti	ince iotalities
J 78	Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater				
	Cooler, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
<b>1</b> 79	Hydraulic Rams	150	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 16,500.00
<b>1</b> 80	Hydraulic Pump Motors	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
81	PTO	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
√ 82	Starters	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
√83	Alternators	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
√84	Fuel Tanks	50	HR	\$ 110.00	\$ 5,500.00
Group/	Price Line 85:			7,10.00	
√ 85	Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00.				
	Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount here)  7 %				
	Example: \$200,000.00 by 11%=\$22,000.00 or \$200,000.00 by .11= \$22,000.00				
	Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right.				
	\$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x _ <sup>7</sup> %)=				\$ 260,400.00

Page 27 of 29

							1 080 27 01 23
	Item#	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.		Unit Price	Total Price
	45	Terex	50	HR	\$	Omi Trice	\$
		Contact Name and Phone #	30	пк	<u> </u>		Φ
7	1 46	Thomas	50	IID	Φ.	9500	· 475000
		Contact Name and Phone # Mair Miszke	50 a 732-3	HR 370-2009	_\$_		\$ 4,730
	47	Vac Con		•	ф		Φ
		Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$		\$
	48	Vactor	50	HR	¢		\$
		Contact Name and Phone #	50	пк			Φ
	49	Vermeer	50	HR	ø		\$
		Contact Name and Phone #	30	пк	_\$_		\$
	50	Versalift East	50	HR	¢.		\$
		Contact Name and Phone #	30	TIK.	_\$_		Ф
	51	Volvo	50	HR	\$		\$
		Contact Name and Phone #		11IX	Ф		\$
	Categor	y 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Maint	enance:	Major			
	52	Category 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Maintenance: Major	50	HR	\$	85 00	\$ 4,250 <sup>99</sup>
	Categor	y 3: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Minor					
	53	Category 3: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Minor	125	HR	\$	85 00	\$ 10,62500
	Categor	y 4: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Major					· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
	54	Category 4: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Major	600	HR	\$	85 %	\$51,000
	Categor	y 5: Non-OEM Repairs: Hoist & Cranes					
	55	Category 5: Non-OEM Repairs: Hoist &					
	Catagor	Cranes y 6: Non-OEM Repairs: Lift Gates	100	HR	\$		\$
	56	Category 6: Non-OEM Repairs: Lift				85 00	<u>م</u>
	50	Gates	100	HR	_\$	85	\$ 8,500
	Categor	y 7: Non-OEM Repairs: Wheelchair Lifts	1				
<b>√</b>	57	Category 7: Non-OEM Repairs: Wheelchair Lifts	125	HR	\$_	85 %	\$ 10,625
	Categor	y 8: Non-OEM Repairs: Hydraulic System	ns & PT	O's			
	58	Category 8: Non-OEM Repairs: Hydraulic Systems & PTO's	100	HR	_\$_	85 <sup>9</sup>	\$ 8,500

Page 28 of 29

Item#	Description	Est. Oty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
	ry 9: Non-OEM Repairs: Snow Plows an				100011100
59	Category 9: Non-OEM Repairs: Snow Plows and Spreaders	50	HR	\$	\$
Catego	ry 10: Non-OEM Repairs: Winches			,	2
60	Category 10: Non-OEM Repairs: Winches	50	HR	\$	\$
Catego	ry 11: Non-OEM Repairs: Seats				
61	Category 11: Non-OEM Repairs: Seats	50	HR	\$	\$
Catego	ry 12: Non-OEM Repairs: Truck Bodies			<u> </u>	
62	Category 12: Non-OEM Repairs: Truck Bodies & Trailers	500	HR	\$ 85 00	\$ 42,500
Catego	ry 13: Non-OEM Repairs: Gauges				
√63	Category 13: Non-OEM Repairs: Gauges	50	HR	\$ 85 00	\$ 4,250 =
Catego	ry 14: Non-OEM Repairs: Pressure Was	hers			
64	Category 14: Non-OEM Repairs: Pressure Washers	50	HR	\$	\$
Catego	ry 15: Non-OEM Repairs: Tools				
65	Category 15: Non-OEM Repairs: Tools	50	HR	\$	\$
Catego	ry 16: Non-OEM Repairs: Engines				
66	Category 16: Non-OEM Repairs: Engines	600	HR	\$ 85 00	\$ 51,000
Catego	ry 17: Non OEM Repairs: Radiators, He	at Exch	anges, He	ater Coolers, Oil C	ooler, Intercoolers
√ 67	Category 17: Non OEM Repairs: Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Coolers, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	220	HR	s 85 °°	s 18,700 00
Categor	ry 18: Non-OEM Repairs: Exhaust				
√ 68	Category 18: Non-OEM Repairs: Exhaust	50	HR	\$ 85%	\$ 4,250
	ry 19: County Location Repairs				
69	Aladdin Pressure Washer	110	HR	\$	\$
70	Altec	50	HR	\$	\$
71	Cyclonator	50	HR	\$	\$
72	Hydraulic Systems	50	HR	\$	\$
73	McCloskey	50	HR	\$	\$
74	PSC Pressure Washer	50	HR	\$	\$
75	Riveer	50	HR	\$	\$
76	Vermeer	50	HR	\$	\$
Adopted on:	nVersa <b>May</b> t6 <u>F2020</u> May 6, 2020 lution#: 2020000553	50	HR	\$	\$

### ON-SITE FLEET SERVICE, INC.

Page 29 of 29

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
Catego	ry 20: Parts Repair/Rebuild				
78	Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Cooler, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	50	HR	\$	\$
79	Hydraulic Rams	150	HR	\$	\$
80	Hydraulic Pump Motors	50	HR	\$	\$
81	PTO	50	HR	\$	\$
82	Starters	50	HR	\$	\$
83	Alternators	50	HR	\$	\$
84	Fuel Tanks	50	HR	\$	\$
~	T) ' T' O#				

Group/Price Line 85:

√85 Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00.

Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount here) 10 %

Example: \$200,000.00 by 11%=\$22,000.00 or \$200,000.00 by

.11=\$22,000.00

Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right.

 $280,000.00-(280,000.00 \times 10^{-6})=$ 

\$ 252,000

Page 24 of 29

Proposal for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER for the County of Ocean.

### VENDOR WILL EXTEND CONTRACT PRICES TO "COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM" PARTICIPANTS.

(X ) - YES

( )-NO

### PRICE SCHEDULE

	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
	y 1: OEM Repairs and Preventive	Maintenance: I	Major		
1	Altec	210	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			<u> </u>	<u> </u>
2	Allison Transmission	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
3	American Rolloff	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #		TIK	тр	
4	Aquatech	75	HR	<b>c</b>	<b>\$</b> -
	Contact Name and Phone #		нĸ	\$	<u> </u>
5	Blue Bird		***		\$
	Contact Name and Phone #	150	HR	\$	
6	Braun			. 405.00	
	Contact Name and Phone # 856-845	100 5-2800 x 45 - Rici	HR h	\$ 105.00	\$ 10,500.00
7	Camel	2000 X.40 - (\(\)			
•		100	HR	\$ 95.00	\$ 9,500.00
,	Contact Name and Phone # 856-845	-2000 X.45 - Kici	<u> </u>		
3	Case IH	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #		<del>- · · · <u>· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·</u></del>		
,	Case Construction	100	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			•	
0	Caterpillar Construction	2,600	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
1	Chevrolet	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ
2	Collins	50	LID	<b>c</b>	<b>ው</b>
	Contact Name and Phone #		HR	\$	\$

Introduced on: Adopted on:

May 6, 2020 May 6, 2020

Official Resolution#: 2020000553

Page 26 of 29

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
28	Isuzu	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				Ψ
29	John Deere	100	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
30	Kubota	75	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				<u> </u>
31	Mack	100	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			<u> </u>	<u> </u>
32	McCloskey	75	HR	\$	<b>'S</b>
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ
33	New Holland Agriculture	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ
34	New Holland Construction	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			J .	
35	Peterbilt	50	HR	\$	.\$
	Contact Name and Phone #	50		4	
36	Powerscreen	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	Ψ
37	Ricon	100	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #	100	1111	Φ	
/ <sub>38</sub>	Schwarze	50	HR	\$ 95.00	\$ 4.750.00
	Contact Name and Phone #_856-845-2800	x.45 - Rich	пк	ъ 00.00	\$ 4,750.00
39	Startrans	50	HR	<b>\$</b> `	\$
,	Contact Name and Phone #			Φ.	Ψ
<b>/</b> 40	C. II. C			ቀ 95 በበ	e 4 750 00
	Contact Name and Phone # 856-845-2800	x.45 - Rich	rik.	\$ 95.00	<u> </u>
41	Sterling	50	LID	ф	<b>c</b> r
	Contact Name and Phone #	50		\$	
42	Supreme			ø	en e
	Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$	
43	Sweeprite		IID	dt.	Ф
	Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$	_\$
44	Sweepster		TTP	Φ.	•
	Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$	_\$

Page 27 of 29

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
45	Térex	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
46	Thomas	50	HR	\$105.00	\$ 5,250.00
	Contact Name and Phone # 856-845-2800 x				
47	Vac Con	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				Ψ
48	Vactor	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #		III	<b>5</b>	<b>J</b>
49	Vermeer	50	HR	\$	<b>c</b> h.
	Contact Name and Phone #	J0	ш	•	\$
50	Versalift East	50	מוז	<b>ሰ</b>	ф
	Contact Name and Phone #	30	HR	\$	_\$
51	Volvo	50	HR	\$	
	Contact Name and Phone #	50			<u>\$</u>
Categor	y 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Mainte	enance: M	Taior		
52	Category 2: Non-OEM Chassis Preventive Maintenance: Major		-		
Categor	y 3: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Minor	50	HR	\$	\$
53	Category 3: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs:				
55	Minor	125	ĽЮ	Ф	φ
Categor	y 4: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs: Major	123	HR	\$	\$
54	Category 4: Non-OEM Chassis Repairs:				
	Major	600	HR	\$	\$
	y 5: Non-OEM Repairs: Hoist & Cranes				
55	Category 5: Non-OEM Repairs: Hoist &				
atogom	Cranes	100	HR	\$ 95.00	\$ 9,500.00
zategor; 6	6: Non-OEM Repairs: Lift Gates				
0	Category 6: Non-OEM Repairs: Lift Gates	100	HR	\$ 95.00	\$ 9,500.00
Category	y 7: Non-OEM Repairs: Wheelchair Lifts				ψ 0,000.00
7	Category 7: Non-OEM Repairs: Wheelchair Lifts	125	HR	<b>\$</b> 105.00	£42.425.00
ategory	y 8: Non-OEM Repairs: Hydraulic System			<b>"р 100.00</b>	\$13,125.00
_	Category 8: Non-OEM Repairs:				
	Hydraulic Systems & PTO's	100	HR _	\$ 95.00	\$ 9,500.00

Page 29 of 29

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
Catego	ry 20: Parts Repair/Rebuild				
78	Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Cooler, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	50	HR	\$	\$
79	Hydraulic Rams	150	HR	\$	\$
80	Hydraulic Pump Motors	50	HR	\$	\$
81	PTO	50	HR	\$	\$
82	Starters	50	HR	\$	\$
83	Alternators	50	HR	\$	\$
84	Fuel Tanks	50	HR	\$	\$
Group/	Price Line 85:				

**√** 85 Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price

list. For bid purposes assume parts at

\$280,000.00.

Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount here)

\_\_\_.5\_%

Example: \$200,000.00 by

11%=\$22,000.00 or \$200,000.00 by

.11 = \$22,000.00

Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the

right.

\$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x \_\_\_\_5 %)= \$14,000.00

**\$** 128,625.00

Introduced on: Adopted on:

May 6, 2020 May 6, 2020 Official Resolution#: 2020000553 Proposal for the furnishing and delivery of REPAIR SERVICES FOR VEHICLES AND EQUIPMENT WITH GVWR 15,000 LBS. OR GREATER for the County of Ocean.

### VENDOR WILL EXTEND CONTRACT PRICES TO "COUNTY COOPERATIVE CONTRACT PURCHASING SYSTEM" PARTICIPANTS.

( )-YES ( )-NO

### PRICE SCHEDULE

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	1	Unit Price	Total Price
Catego	ry 1: OEM Repairs and Preventive	Maintenance:	Major			
1	Altec	210	HR	\$	$\checkmark$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #					
2	Allison Transmission	50	HR	\$		\$
	Contact Name and Phone #		·			
3	American Rolloff	50	HR	\$	$\star$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #	,				
4	Aquatech	75	HR	\$	X	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #					
$\int 5$	Blue Bird	150	HR	\$	120.00	\$ 18,000.00
	Contact Name and Phone # MARK			Ψ	1,,,,,,	<u> </u>
6	Braun	100	HR	\$	X	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			<u> </u>		<u> </u>
7	Camel	100	HR	\$	X	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ		Ψ
8	Case IH	50	HR	\$	X	\$
•	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ		Ψ
9	Case Construction	100	HR	\$	X	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ		Ψ
10	Caterpillar Construction	2,600	HR	\$	X	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #	•		Ψ	·	<u>. Ψ</u>
11	Chevrolet	50	HR	\$	X	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ		<u> </u>
12	Collins	50	HR	\$	*	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #	<i>J</i> 0		Ψ		<del></del>

Introduced on: Adopted on:

May 6, 2020 May 6, 2020

Official Resolution#: 2020000553

## ROBERT H. HOOVER & SONS, INC.

Page 25 of 29

Litem #	Description		Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.		Unit Price	Total Price
<b>√</b> 13	Cummins	MARK	125	HR	\$	120.00	\$ 15,000.00
1	Contact Name and Phone #_	732 341 21	28	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·			
$\sqrt{14}$	Detroit Diesel	MARK	50	HR	_\$_	120.00	\$ 6,000.00
	Contact Name and Phone #_	73231/21	28	<del> </del>		<b>\</b> 1	
15	Eldorado		100	HR	\$		\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_					1	
16	Elgin		50	HR	\$		\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_						
17	Elliot		50	HR	\$	<i>&gt;</i>	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_					<u> </u>	
18	Extec		50	HR	\$	$\nearrow$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #						
19	Ford		50	HR	\$	X	<b>\$</b>
	Contact Name and Phone #_						managaran Sansya ar managaran
<b>1</b> 20	Freightliner	MARK	50	HR	\$	120.00	\$ (0,000,00
	Contact Name and Phone #_	732341212	29		<del></del>		
21	General Motors		50	HR	\$	7	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_						
22	Girardin		150	HR	\$	X	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_				Ψ		<u> </u>
23	Glaval		150	HR	\$	X	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_				Ψ		<u> </u>
24	Goodall		50	HR	\$	X	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_				Ψ		Ψ .
25	Goshen		150	HR	\$	X	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_	.,					Ψ
26	International Bus		150	HR	\$	X	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_		150		Ψ		Ψ
27	International		100	HR	\$	$\lambda$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_		100	7TK	Ψ		Ψ
28	Isuzu		50	HR	\$	$\star$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_				Ψ		Ψ

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
28	Isuzu	50	HR	\$ X	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_				
29	John Deere	100	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_				
30	Kubota	75	HR	\$ 1	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_				
31	Mack	100	HR	<b>\$</b> \( \stacksquare \)	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_			<u> </u>	
32	McCloskey	75	HR	s /	¢
	Contact Name and Phone #_			<u> </u>	Ψ
33	New Holland Agriculture	50	HR	* ×	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_		1110	ψ	•
34	New Holland Construction	50	HR	s ×	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_		HK	<b>D</b> (	Φ
35	Peterbilt	50	HR	* ×	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #_	30	пк	Φ ι	<b>D</b>
36	Powerscreen	50	HR	\$ ×	¢
	Contact Name and Phone #		пк	Φ (	Φ
37	Ricon	100	HR	s ×	<b>c</b>
	Contact Name and Phone #_	100	пк	<del></del>	
38	Schwarze	50	IID	, ×	Ф
	Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$ /	<u> </u>
39	Startrans	50	IID	× ×	Ф
	Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$ / -	\$
40	Ctaller Crans		IID	* ×	, th
	Contact Name and Phone #	MARK 50 732 341 2128	HR	\$	\$
$\sqrt{41}$	Sterling —		IID	\$ 120.00	s 6,000,00
	Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$ 120.00	\$ 6,000,00
42	Supreme	50	TTD	, ×	<b>A</b>
	Contact Name and Phone #	, 50	HR	\$ ~	\$
43	Sweeprite	<b>70</b>	TID	$\sim$	Φ.
	Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$	\$
44	Sweepster Sweepster	<b></b>	IID	* *	<b>d</b>
	Contact Name and Phone #	50	HR	\$ /	\$

Introduced on: Ontach Name and Phone #\_\_\_\_\_Adopted on: May 6, 2020
Official Resolution#: 2020000553

### ROBERT H. HOOVER & SONS, INC.

Res-Pg:m.10-31 Page 29 of 29

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
	ry 20: Parts Repair/Rebuild				
78	Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater Cooler, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	50	HR	s ×	\$
79	Hydraulic Rams	150	HR	\$ >	\$
80	Hydraulic Pump Motors	50	HR	\$ ×	\$
81	PTO	50	HR	\$	\$
82	Starters	50	HR	\$ X	\$
83	Alternators	50	HR	\$ X	\$
84	Fuel Tanks	50	HR	\$ 7	\$
Group/	Price Line 85:			<del>-</del>	

**J** 85 Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00.

> Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount here) 5 %

Example: \$200,000.00 by 11%=\$22,000.00 or \$200,000.00 by .11 = \$22,000.00

Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right.

\$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x 5 %)=

\$ 14,000-00

Introduced on: Adopted on:

May 6, 2020 May 6, 2020 Official Resolution#: 2020000553

Item #	Description	Est. Qty.	Unit of Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
13	Cummins	125	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
14	Detroit Diesel	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
15	Eldorado	100	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
16	Elgin	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
17	Elliot	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
18	Extec	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				
19	Ford	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #				<u> </u>
20	Freightliner	50	HR	\$	<b>\$</b> .
	Contact Name and Phone #				
21	General Motors	50	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	
22	Girardin	150	HR	\$	\$
	Contact Name and Phone #			<u> </u>	<u> </u>
23	Glaval	150	HR	\$	¢
	Contact Name and Phone #			Ψ	ψ
√24	Goodall	50	HR	\$ 85 00	\$ 4,250,00
	Contact Name and Phone #	_ =			\$ 1,230,00
25	Goshen	D&W	Engine Compo Tank & Truck E Industrial Produ	quipment	• •
	Contact Name and Phone #				Φ
26	International Bus	888.5	62.539		¢
	Contact Name and Phone #	423 County Rd Cliffwood, NJ 07721	732.566.49 732.566.0		<u> </u>
27	International		sel.com	DW176	¢
	Contact Name and Phone #	100	iiix	Ψ	\$
28	Isuzu	50	LID	¢	<b>c</b>
	Contact Name and Phone #		HR	\$	\$

		Est.	Unit of		
Item #	Description	Qty.	Meas.	Unit Price	Total Price
Catego	ry 20: Parts Repair/Rebuild				
78	Radiators, Heat Exchanges, Heater				
	Cooler, Oil Cooler, Intercoolers	50	HR	\$	\$
79	Hydraulic Rams	150	HR	\$	\$
√ <sub>80</sub>	Hydraulic Pump Motors	50	HR	<b>\$</b> 95	\$ 4,750.00
$\sqrt{81}$	PTO	50	HR	\$ 95	\$ 4.750,00
$\sqrt{82}$	Starters	50	HR	\$ 95	\$ 4 750.00
√83	Alternators	50	HR	\$ 95	\$ 4,750.00
84	Fuel Tanks	50	HR	\$	\$

### Group/Price Line 85:

Parts: Percentage discount from manufacturer's suggested retail price list. For bid purposes assume parts at \$280,000.00.

Calculate percentage of discount on parts by multiplying \$280,000.00 by your discount (show bid discount here)

15\_%

Example: \$200,000.00 by 11%=\$22,000.00 or \$200,000.00 by .11=\$22,000.00

Show retail cost of parts minus discount % in the space provided at the right.

\$280,000.00-(\$280,000.00 x <u>15</u>%)=

\$ 238,000,00

Local Sales & Service



Engine Components Tank & Truck Equipment Industrial Products

888.562.5391

423 County Rd Cliffwood, NJ 07721 732.566.4970 Local 732.566.0340 Fax

dwdiesel.com

DW178